
SWIMMING POOL 
Local Technical Amendments 

to the 
2020 7th Edition Florida Building Code 

JURISDICTION 
DOCUMENT with 

TECHNICAL 
AMENDMENT 

TEXT OF TECHNICAL AMENDMENT TAC REVIEW 

Broward County 

FBC – Building Ch 4 
Sec 454.1.4.1 

And 
Sec 454.2.16 

FBC 7th Edition, Building, Public Swimming Pools 454.1.4.1 Electrical. 
Electrical equipment wiring and installation, including the bonding 
and grounding of pool components, shall comply with Chapter 27 of 
the Florida Building Code, Building. Outlets supplying pool pump 
motors connected to single-phase 120-volt through 240- volt branch 
circuits, whether by receptacle or by direct connection, and outlets 
supplying other electrical equipment and underwater luminaires 
operating at voltages greater than the low voltage contact limit, 
connected to single-phase, 120 volt through 240 volt branch circuits, 
rated 15 or 20 amperes, whether by receptacle or by direct 
connection, shall be provided with ground-fault circuit interrupter 
protection for personnel. 454.1.4.1.1 Maximum voltage. The 
maximum voltage for each luminaire in any private swimming or 
bathing pools shall not exceed the Low Voltage Contact Limit, which 
is defined as a voltage not exceeding the following values: (1) 15 
volts (RMS) for sinusoidal alternating current (2) 21.2 volts peak for 
nonsinusoidal alternating current (3) 30 volts continuous direct 
current (4) 12.4 volts peak for direct current that is interrupted at a 
rate of 10 to 200 Hertz The maximum incandescent lamp size shall 
be 300 watts. 

Broward County Ch 4-Sec454.1.4.1 and Sec 454.2.16 -- 
2020 FBC 

Swimming Pool 

County of 
Miami-Dade 

FBC-Building 
Sec 454 

Sec 454.1.4.1, 
Sec 454.1.10.4.1 

Sec 454.2.16 

Miami-Dade-Local Amend Pool Lighting - Ch 454 and 
Ch 4206  2020 FBC 

Swimming Pool 



and 
Sec4206 

Sec 4206.4 – 4206.4.1 

City of 
Winter Park 

FBC-Building 
Sec 454.3 (Bldg) 

and R4501.17.1.16 
(Res) 

During the construction of public or private swimming pools, the 
permanent fence or wall meeting all applicable requirements of the 
Florida Building Code, Residential Volume, Chapter 45, or a temporary 
fence at least four (4) feet in height above the grade shall be installed.  
The fence or wall shall be closed, latched and locked at all times, except 
when work is in progress and workmen are on the site.  The temporary 
fence shall not be removed except when the permanent fence, wall, 
enclosure or swimming pool is being actively constructed.  At no time 
shall the pool be left by workmen unless secured by either the 
permanent or temporary enclosure.  Swimming pool barrier protection 
shall allow bodies of water such as lakes, canals and streams to serve as 
one side of the required barrier when the water frontage is at least six 
feet wide beyond the shoreline, and the side yard fence barrier proceeds 
at least one foot into the water body or the fence continues to the edge of 
the water to the top of a canal stream bulkhead wall.  Provisions in this 
section apply to swimming pools on building sites, including 
commercial, residential or multifamily projects.  Failure to maintain 
enclosure protection security with a 

swimming pool protection barrier 
shall cause the city to secure the pool from outside entry, and authorize 
the issuance of a “stop work” order until all fees related to providing a 
pool protection barrier have been paid or waived by the building official 
minus costs. 

Swimming Pool 

County of 
Broward 

FBC Electrical 
Sec 4501.16 Broward County-Local Amend Ch4501.16 - Max Volt-FBC 2020 Swimming Pool 



BROWARD COUNTY BACK 

BOARD OF RULES AND APPEALS 

October 13, 2020 

RE: Florida Building Code – 7th Edition (2020) Building – Section 454.1.4.1 Electrical 
Florida Building Code – 7th Edition (2020) Building – Section 454.2.16 Electrical 

To whom it may concern: 

The following amendments to the Florida Building Code – 7th Edition (2020) Building – 
Section 454.1.4.1 Electrical and Florida Building Code – 7th Edition (2020) Building – 
Section 454.2.16.1 Electrical were passed by vote of the Broward  County  Board  of 
Rules and Appeals on its regular session of October 8, 2020, the effective date is 
December 31, 2020. 

The amendments consist as follows: 

• Florida Building Code – 7th Edition (2020) Building – Section 454.1.4.1 Electrical
• Florida Building Code – 7th Edition (2020) Building – Section 454.1.4.1.1
• Florida Building Code – 7th Edition (2020) Building – Section 454.2.16 Electrical
• Florida Building Code – 7th Edition (2020) Building – Section 454.2.16.1
• Total of Paragraphs Changed: 12

A full amended document is to be posted on the www.floridabuiding.org. If needed please 
feel free to contact our office 954-765-4500 – or email us at rulesboard@broward.org at 
any time. 

Thank You, 

Ruth Boselli Administrative Coordinator 
Attachments 

ONE NORTH UNIVERSITY DRIVE 

SUITE 3500-B 

www.  

2020 Voting Members 
Chair 
Mr. Daniel Lavrich, 
P.E.,S.I.,SECB,F.ASCE, F.SEI 
Structural Engineer 
Vice-Chair 
Mr. Stephen E. Bailey, P.E.
Electrical Engineer
Mr. John Famularo,
Roofing Contractor 
Mrs. Shalanda Giles Nelson,
General Contractor 
Mr. Daniel Rourke 
Master Plumber
Mr. Gregg D’Attile,
Mechanical Contractor
Mr. Ron Burr 
Swimming Pool Contractor
Mr. John Sims, 
Master Electrician 
Mr. Dennis A. Ulmer
Consumer Advocate 
Mr. Abbas H. Zackria, CSI 
Architect 
Mr. Robert A. Kamm, P.E.
Mechanical Engineer 

Vacant 
Representative Disabled Community 
Mr. Sergio Pellecer 
Fire Service Professional 

2020 Alternate Board Members 
Mr. Jeff Falkanger 
Architect 
Mr. Steven Feller, P.E. 
Mechanical Engineer 
Mr. Alberto Fernandez, 
General  Contractor 
Mr. Robert Taylor 
Fire Service 
Mr. Gary Elzweig, P.E., F.ASCE 
Structural Engineer 
Mr. David Rice, P.E. 
Electrical Engineer 
Mr. James Terry, 
Master Plumber 
Mr. David Tringo, 
Master Electrician 
Mr. William Flett, 
Roofing Contractor 

Board Attorney 
Charles M. Kramer, Esq. 

Board Administrative Director 
James DiPietro 

http://www.floridabuiding.org/
mailto:rulesboard@broward.org
http://www/


BACK to TOP 
FBC 7th Edition, Building, Public Swimming Pools 

454.1.4.1 Electrical. 
Electrical equipment wiring and installation, including the bonding and grounding of pool 
components, shall comply with Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building. 
Outlets supplying pool pump motors connected to single-phase 120-volt through 240- 
volt branch circuits, whether by receptacle or by direct connection, and outlets supplying 
other electrical equipment and underwater luminaires operating at voltages greater than 
the low voltage contact limit, connected to single-phase, 120 volt through 240 volt 
branch circuits, rated 15 or 20 amperes, whether by receptacle or by direct connection, 
shall be provided with ground-fault circuit interrupter protection for personnel. 

454.1.4.1.1 Maximum voltage. The maximum voltage for each luminaire in any private 
swimming or bathing pools shall not exceed the Low Voltage Contact Limit, which is defined 
as a voltage not exceeding the following values: 

(1) 15 volts (RMS) for sinusoidal alternating current
(2) 21.2 volts peak for nonsinusoidal alternating current
(3) 30 volts continuous direct current
(4) 12.4 volts peak for direct current that is interrupted at a rate of 10 to 200 Hertz The
maximum incandescent lamp size shall be 300 watts.

NEXT 

BACK to TOP 



4. 

BROWARD COUNTY LOCAL AMENDMENT 
Proposed Modification to the Florida Building Code 

Per Section 553.73. Fla Stat 

Name:      Broward County, Board of Rules and Appeals, ATTN: J. DiPietro 

Address:  1 North University Dr. Suite 3500B Plantation, FL 33324 

E-mail:     jdipietro@broward.org

Phone:    954-765-4500

Fax:         954-765-4504   

Code: Florida Building Code, Building, 7th Edition (2020). Section 454.1.4.1 

Text of Modification (additions underlined; deletion stricken): 
Please see attachment. 

Respond to the following questions: 

1. How is the local amendment more stringent than the minimum standards described in the FBC?

This amendment exceeds the minimum standards by requiring all swimming pool lighting fixtures
to be low voltage (15 Volts or less) RMS for sinusoidal alternating current.

2. Demonstrate or provide evidence or data that the geographical jurisdiction governed by the local
governing body exhibits a local need to strengthen the FBC beyond the needs or regional variation
addressed by the FBC.

South Florida has more swimming pools than other jurisdictions, also South Florida salty
environment may cause loose or broken connections on electrical equipment.

3. Explain how the local need is addressed by the proposed local amendment.

This modification will require all swimming pool lighting to be 15 volts or less RMS for sinusoidal
alternating current, thereby reducing the probability of electrocution hazard of high voltage
lighting in residential swimming pools.

Broward County 

Board of Rules and Appeals 
TL 954.765.4500  FX 954.765.4504 

http:// www. broward. org/ codeappeals 

mailto:jdipietro@broward.org


   

This modification will require all swimming pool lighting to be 15 volts or less RMS for sinusoidal 
alternating current, thereby reducing the probability of electrocution hazard of high voltage 
lighting in residential swimming pools. 

 
 

5. Are the additional requirements discriminatory against materials, products, or construction 
techniques of demonstrated capabilities? 

 
No. 

 
6. Indicate whether or not additional requirements introduce a new subject not already addressed 

in the FBC. 
 

The Florida Building Code currently allows the use of high voltage and low voltage types of light 
fixtures. Thus, by only allowing low voltage pool light fixtures to be used for pool lighting would 
strengthen the code. 

 
7. Include a fiscal impact statement which documents the costs and benefits of the proposed 

amendment. Criteria for the fiscal impact statement shall include a, b, and c: 
a) Impact to local government, relative to enforcement. 

 
None 

 
b) Impact to property and building owners relative to cost of compliance. 

 
Less than $50.00 per swimming pool 

 
c) Impact to industry relative to the cost of compliance 

 
Less than $50.00 per swimming pool 

 
 
 

Broward County Board of Rules and Appeals Public hearing and vote on October 8, 2020, 

respectively. 

Amendment Effective date: December 31, 2020. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

G:\SHARED\2020 BR&A\BOARD AGENDA\9. September\Electrical amendments\3. Swimming Pool Amnd - 5th Edition Update to 7th Edition 



 

FBC 7th Edition, Building, Private Swimming Pools BACK to TOP 
 

454.2.16 Electrical. 
Electrical equipment wiring and installation, including the bonding and grounding of pool 
components, shall comply with Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building. 
Outlets supplying pool pump motors connected to single-phase 120-volt through 240- 
volt branch circuits, whether by receptacle or by direct connection, and outlets supplying 
other electrical equipment and underwater luminaires operating at voltages greater than 
the low voltage contact limit, connected to single-phase, 120 volt through 240 volt 
branch circuits, rated 15 or 20 amperes, whether by receptacle or by direct connection, 
shall be provided with ground-fault circuit interrupter protection for personnel. 

 
454.2.16.1 Maximum voltage. The maximum voltage for each luminaire in any private 
swimming or bathing pools shall not exceed the Low Voltage Contact Limit, which is defined 
as a voltage not exceeding the following values: 

 

(1) 15 volts (RMS) for sinusoidal alternating current 
(2) 21.2 volts peak for nonsinusoidal alternating current 
(3) 30 volts continuous direct current 
(4) 12.4 volts peak for direct current that is interrupted at a rate of 10 to 200 Hertz The 
maximum incandescent lamp size shall be 300 watts. 



4.   

  
 

BROWARD COUNTY LOCAL AMENDMENT 
Proposed Modification to the Florida Building Code 

 
Per Section 553.73. Fla Stat 

 
 

Name:      Broward County, Board of Rules and Appeals, ATTN: J. DiPietro    

Address:  1 North University Dr. Suite 3500B Plantation, FL 33324   

E-mail:     jdipietro@broward.org      

Phone:     954-765-4500    

Fax:         954-765-4504    

Code: Florida Building Code, Building, 7th Edition (2020). Section 454.2.16 

Text of Modification (additions underlined; deletion stricken): 
Please see attachment. 

 
 

Respond to the following questions: 
 

1. How is the local amendment more stringent than the minimum standards described in the FBC? 
 

This amendment exceeds the minimum standards by requiring all swimming pool lighting fixtures 
to be low voltage (15 Volts or less) RMS for sinusoidal alternating current. 

 
2. Demonstrate or provide evidence or data that the geographical jurisdiction governed by the local 

governing body exhibits a local need to strengthen the FBC beyond the needs or regional variation 
addressed by the FBC. 

 
South Florida has more swimming pools than other jurisdictions, also South Florida salty 
environment may cause loose or broken connections on electrical equipment. 

 
 

3. Explain how the local need is addressed by the proposed local amendment. 
 

This modification will require all swimming pool lighting to be 15 volts or less RMS for sinusoidal 
alternating current, thereby reducing the probability of electrocution hazard of high voltage 
lighting in residential swimming pools. 

Broward County 

Board of Rules and Appeals 
        

TL 954.765.4500  FX 954.765.4504 
http:// www. broward. org/ codeappeals 

mailto:jdipietro@broward.org


   

This modification will require all swimming pool lighting to be 15 volts or less RMS for sinusoidal 
alternating current, thereby reducing the probability of electrocution hazard of high voltage 
lighting in residential swimming pools. 

 
 

5. Are the additional requirements discriminatory against materials, products, or construction 
techniques of demonstrated capabilities? 

 
No. 

 
6. Indicate whether or not additional requirements introduce a new subject not already addressed 

in the FBC. 
 

The Florida Building Code currently allows the use of high voltage and low voltage types of light 
fixtures. Thus, by only allowing low voltage pool light fixtures to be used for pool lighting would 
strengthen the code. 

 
7. Include a fiscal impact statement which documents the costs and benefits of the proposed 

amendment. Criteria for the fiscal impact statement shall include a, b, and c: 
a) Impact to local government, relative to enforcement. 

 
None 

 
b) Impact to property and building owners relative to cost of compliance. 

 
Less than $50.00 per swimming pool 

 
c) Impact to industry relative to the cost of compliance 

 
Less than $50.00 per swimming pool 

 
 
 

Broward County Board of Rules and Appeals Public hearing and vote on October 8, 2020, 

respectively. 

Amendment Effective date: December 31, 2020. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

G:\SHARED\2020 BR&A\BOARD AGENDA\9. September\Electrical amendments\5. Swimming Pool Amnd - 5th Edition Update to 7th Edition 



  

OF lALFIU: COPY 
CLERK OF THE BOARD· 

OF COL'NTV C·O on S1O. RS 
M l AMI -DAI>E C'OIDl"'TY, n o RI D·A 

 
 

MEMORANDUM 

BACK to TOP 

 

 Agenda Item No. 7(B) 

 
TO: Honorable Chairman Jose "Pepe" Diaz 

 
DATE: 

(Second Reading: 3-2-21) 
December 15, 2020 

 and Members, Board of County Commissioners   

 
FROM: 

 
Geri Bonzon-Keenan 

 
SUBJECT: 

 
Ordinance relating to underwater 

 County Attorney  pool lighting; amending section 
 8-31 of the Code; enacting 

local technical amendments 
to the 2020 Florida Building 
Code; re-enacting maximum 
voltage limitations for 
underwater pool lighting for 
private and public swimming 

Ordinance No. 21-18 
pools and bathing places 

 
 

 
 

The accompanying ordinance was prepared and placed on the agenda at the request of Prime 
Sponsor Commissioner Sally A. Heyman and Co-Sponsor Chairman Jose "Pepe" Diaz. 

 
 
 

Geri Bonzon-Keenan 
County Attorney 

 
 

GBK/smm 



  

Memorandum  r..:11 
 

Date: March 2, 2021 
 

To: Honorable Chairman Jose uPepe• Diaz 
and Members, Board of County Commissioners 

 

From: Daniella Levine Cava fJ • Al Y. /J ,6 _ _ 

Mayor 
 

Subject: Fiscal Impact Statement for Ordinance Relating to Underwater Pool Lighting 
 

 
The implementation of this ordinance will not have a fiscal impact to Miami-Dade County. Approval of 
this item is not anticipated to create a fiscal impact to the County, as the proposed changes will not 
require additional staffing resources nor generate additional operational expenses. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

J; my orales 
C\ , i ef Operations Officer 

 
FIS01521 202430 



  

 
 
 

Date: March 2, 2021 

Memorandum mMInA iiiIl-', 

 

To: 

From: 

Subject: 

Honorable Chairman Jose "Pep•e Diaz 
and Members, Board of County Commissioners 

Daniella Levine Cava /1 _ .  AA · · /',. 
Mayor 

Social Equity Statement for Ordinance Relating to Underwater Pool Lighting for Private 
and Public Swimming Pools and Bathing Places 

 

The proposed ordinance relating to Private and Public Swimming Pools and Bathing  Places 
amends Section 8-31 of the Code of Miami-Dade County (Code) enacting Local Technical 
Amendments to the Florida Building Code 7th Edition (2020) pertaining to maximum voltage 
limitations for underwater pool lighting In both the incorporated and unincorporated areas of Miami 
Dade County. 

 
In order to lessen the potential for electrocution, the proposed ordinance provides a local technical 
amendment to the Florida Building Code to require low voltage underwater lighting in newly built 
public and private pools, and for permitted construction work In existing public and private pools. 

 
This proposed ordinance will make a valuable contribution in maximizing  the health and safety of 
all County residents and visitors ·by minimizing the potential for serious electrical shocks and 
electrocution In both public and private recreational swimming pools. 

 
 
 

 
 

Jimmy Morales 
Chief Operations Officer 
202430 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 

 

MEMORANDUM 
(Revised) 

 
TO: Honorable Chairman Jose "Pepe" Diaz 

and Members, Board of County Commissioners 

 
 
 

DATE: March 2, 2021 

 
 
 
 

FROM: 
 

County Attorney 

 
SUBJECT: Agenda Item No. 7(B) 

 
 

 

 

Please note any items checked. 
 
 

   "3-Day Rule" for committees applicable if raised 
 

6 weeks required between first reading and public hearing 
 

4 weeks notification to municipal officials required prior to public 
hearing 

 
   Decreases revenues or increases expenditures without balancing budget 

 
   Budget required 

 
   Statement  of fiscal  impact required 

 
   Statement  of social equity required 

 
   Ordinance creating a new board requires detailed County Mayor's 

report for public hearing 
 

   No committee review 
 

   Applicable legislation requires more than a majority vote (i.e., 2/3's 
present    ,  2/3 membership_, 3/S's    , unanimous _, CDMP 
7 vote requirement  per 2-116.1(3)(h) or (4)(c) _, CDMP 2/3 vote 
requirement  per 2-116.1(3)(h) or (4)(c) _, or CDMP 9 vote 
requirement per 2-116.1(4)(c)(2)  J to approve 

 
   Current information regarding funding source, index code and available 

balance, and available capacity (if debt is contemplated) required 



 

 

 

Approved 
Veto   
Override    

Agenda Item No. 7(8) 
3-2-21 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 21-18 

 
ORDINANCE RELATING TO UNDERWATER POOL  
LIGHTING; AMENDING SECTION 8-31 OF THE CODE OF 
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA; ENACTING LOCAL 
TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS TO THE 2020 FLORIDA 
BUILDING CODE; RE-ENACTING MAXIMUM VOLTAGE 
LIMITATIONS FOR UNDERWATER POOL LIGHTING FOR 
PRIVATE AND PUBLIC SWIMMING POOLS AND BATHING 
PLACES; PROVIDING SEVERABILITY, INCLUSION IN THE 
CODE, AND AN EFFECTIVE DATE 

 
 

WHEREAS, this Board desires to maximize the health and safety of County residents and 

visitors, and to minimize the potential for electrocution in swimming pools both public and private; 

and 

WHEREAS, the 2010 Florida Building Code did not require  low  voltage  lighting  m 

private swimming pools; and 

WHEREAS, the 2010 Florida Building Code was still in effect in 2014, and that year there 

were three serious injuries and one fatality in Miami-Dade County as a result of electrical shock 

and electrocution caused by underwater swimming pool lighting, as reported by local news media; 

and 

WHEREAS, to lessen the potential for lethal electrocution and electrical shock injuries, 
 

this Board adopted Ordinance No. 14-95 on October 7, 2014, which enacted local technical 

amendments to the 20 IO Florida Building Code, to require low voltage lighting ( l) in newly built 

private swimming or recreational bathing pools that have underwater lighting installed, and (2) in 

existing private pools with underwater lighting when permitted construction work is done after the 

initial pool construction; and 



 

 

Agenda Item No. 7(B) 
Page 2 

 

WHEREAS, chapter  553,  Florida Statutes,  provides that  all  local technical  amendments  

to the building code expire with each new edition of the Florida Building Code, unless  readopted ; 

and 

WHEREAS, the Florida Building Code is revised , amended, and  updated  with  new  

editions every three to four years; and 

WHEREAS, a new Florida Building Code was adopted in 2014, and like the 2010 edition, 

the 2014 Florida Building Code did not require low voltage lighting in private swimming pools; 

and 

WHEREAS, to continue to protect the public from serious injuries and deaths from 

electrocutions and electrical shocks in private swimming pools,  this  Board  re-enacted  local 

technical amendments to the 2014 Florida Building Code  by adopting  Ordinance  No.  15-27 on  

May 5, 2015 reimposing the underwater pool lighting voltage limitations; and 

WHEREAS, the 2017 Florida Building Code eliminated the requirement for low voltage 

underwater lights in public pools, thereby removing provisions which mitigated the potential for 

lethal electrocution and electric shock in public settings; and 

WHEREAS, on October 2, 2018, this Board adopted Ordinance No. 18-121 which 

extended the County's local technical amendments from private swimming pools to both public 

and private swimming pools to continue to mitigate the potential for lethal electrocution and 

electric shock i n private and public swimming pools ; and 

WHEREAS, the recently published 2020 Florida Building Code does not contain the low 

voltage limitations imposed by this Board's  prior  local  technical  amendments  adopted  in 

Ordinance No. 18-1 21; and 



 

 

Agenda Item No. 7(B) 
Page 3 

 

WHEREAS, the absence of the low voltage limitations in the 2020 Florida Building Code 

now necessitates enactment of a new ordinance to maintain the local technical amendments to 

mitigate the potential for lethal electrocution and electric shock; and 

WHEREAS, the absence of any lethal electrocution and electric shock in swimming  pools  

in Miami-Dade County since 2014, when this Board first enacted its local technical amendments 

imposing low voltage limitations for pool lighting, demonstrates the effectiveness  of this Board's 

local technical amendments to the Florida Building Code; and 

WHEREAS, this Board wishes to maintain the heightened public safety resulting from the 

local technical amendments that  impose  low voltage  limitations  for underwater  lighting  systems 

in both private and public pools, 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF MIAMI-

DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA: 

Section 1. 

Section 2. 

Incorporates and adopts the foregoing recitals as fully set forth herein. 

Section 8-31 of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida, is hereby 

amended to read as follows: 1 

 
Sec. 8-31. - Local technical amendments to Florida Building Code. 

 
(A) The County hereby adopts the following local technical 

amendments to Chapter 6 (Plumbing) of the Florida Building 
Code. 

* * * 

(C) [[The  Cowity   hereby  adopts  the  follo1+YiAg  loeal  teeh.'lieal 
ameAdmeAt to Chapter 42 (ResideAtial) of the Florida 
BuildiAg Code.]] 

 
 

Words stricken through and/or [[double bracketed]] shall be deleted. Words underscored 
and/or >>double  arrowed<< constitute  the  amendment  proposed.  Remaining  provisions are now 
in effect and remain unchanged. 

 

BACK to TOP 



 

 

Agenda Item No. 7(8) 
Page 4 

 

[[E420(j,4 UederwateF llHllie&it:es, The desigR ef ae underwater 
h,11nieaiH supfllied ftem a hrft:flek eireuit h ' wa-y ef a transfermer 
er fl0'Ner S flly  meeting  the  reeiuirements  ef Seetiee  B42 0€i.l , 
skall he sHGk that, wkere the fiKtHre is flF0flerly iRStalleEI without a 
greund famt  eireuit ieterr ter,  there  is ft0 skeek 80:lBrd with aRy 
m • r eemeinatieR ef fault oeeditieRS durieg ft0Rml use (eat 
relaHJf'ing). The iestall&tiee ef the greHRd fault eireuit iete ter 
skall he sHGh that tkeH is ft0 sh.eek hazard widl any likely famt 
oeeElitiee eemeinatiee  that iwfel¥es a f)ersee iR a 00eElueti1,'e patk 
ftem aey llRgF0HRded f)art ef the hraRGk eirouit or the lumiRaire to 
groHRd. CefHf)lift:flee ,,,idl this requiremeet skall he ehtaiRed hy the 
use ef a listed HRderwater lUfflieaire aeEI h , iRStall&tiee ef a listed 
traRSfermer er pewer supply fer lumieaires eperating at R0t mere 
th&R the lew ¥eltage eeetact lifnit. Lumieaires that defleeEI eR 
suhmersiee fer safe ef)eratiee skall he inhereetly f)retected agaiRSt 
tke  ha-zards  ef  01,<erkeating  1NkeR  R0t  suemerged.  [ €>8  0.23(}..)(l  ), 
(/\.)(3), (A)(?) aeEI (A)(8)]]] 

 
 
BACK to TOP 

 

[[E4l0(j,4,l  Ma'l:imum   :Yoltage. The  Rl8Jaffllim  1fe ltage fer  eaek 
lumiRaiH in any f)frrate swimming er Here&tieeal hathing fleels 
skall Rot exoeed the Lew Voltage GeRtaet Lifnit; whiek is defiRed 
as a ,,eltage R0t exoeeding th.e fellowing ¥alues: 

 

(1) 15 ¥alts (RMS) fer sinuseidal alternating eurreet 
(2) 21.2 ¥alts fleak fer R0RSieus0idal alternatiRg 
eurreRt 
(3) 30 1,<elts eeRtiRUOus direct ourreRt 
(4) 12.4 ¥alts  f)eak  fer  direet  eurreftt  that  is 
iete ted at a rate ef 10 to 2Q0 Hertz 
The fH8iciffR:lm iRGaeEleseeRt lamp si'le shall he 300 
watts-:]] 

 
 

[[fl)j]] The Cowrty hereby adopts the following local technical 
amendment to Chapter 4 (Building) of the Florida Building 
Code. 

 
[[454.1.4,l Eleetrieal efiuipmeet eed w111eg. Blectrieal 
eeiHiflmeRt vliring aRd iRStall&tion, including the heeEling aed 
greHRding efpeol GOffif:!0ReRts skall eomply with Chapter 27 of the 
Flerida Building Gode, 8uildieg. Outlets s plying peel pump 
meters eeRRected to single pkase 120 'foltthrough. 240 ·felthraRGh 
circuits, wkether h , receptacle or h , direct oeR:Reotien shall he 
prei,rided widl ground fault oirouit interrupter preteetiee fer 
persoR:Rel. 



 

 

Agenda Item No. 7(8) 
Page 5 

 

Ille mmamum •;altage fer eaeh URaen¥ater h:tmiROire shall R0t 
eKeeea tke Low ¥eltage Camaet Limit, whieh is aefiRed as a 
¥altage R0t eKeeediRg the fellawiRg ¥alues: 

 

BACK to TOP 

 

(1) 15 •;alts (RMS) fer siAUSaiaal aJtematiRg eurreRt 
(2) 21.2 ¥alts peak fer R0nsiRHSaidal alterROtiRg 
6\:lfreRt 
(3) 30 ¥alts eaRtiRHeHS direet eurreRt 
(4) 12.4 •;alts peak fer direeteurreRt that is iRte ted 
at a rate af 10 te 200 Hertz 
Ille maximum i0ea0deseeRt lamp si:a, shall ae 300 
watts-.]] 

>>454.1.10.4.1 Ground-fault circuit interrupter protection for 
personnel. 
Outlets supplying repaired, replaced. altered, or relocated pool 
pump motors connected to single-phase. 120-voltthrough 240-volt 
branch circuits, whether by receptacle or by direct connection, and 
outlets supplying all other repaired. replaced. altered, or relocated 
electrical equipment connected to single-phase, 120-volt through 
240-volt branch circuits. rated 15- and 20-amperes. whether by 
receptacle or by direct connection, shall be provided with grmmd 
fault circuit interrupter protection for personnel. 

 

The maximum voltage for each underwater luminaire shall not 
exceed the Low Voltage Contact Limit, which is defined as a 
voltage not exceeding  the following values: · 

 

(1} 15 volts (RMS) for sinusoidal alternating current: 
(2) 21.2 volts peak for nonsinusoidal alternating 
current: 
(3) 30 volts continuous direct current: 
(4) 12.4 volts peak for direct current that is interrupted 
at a rate of 10 to 200 Hertz. 

 
The maximum incandescent lamp size shall be 300 
watts.<< 

 
454.2.16 Electrical. 
Electrical equipment wiring and installation, including the bonding 
and grounding of pool components, shall comply with Chapter 27 
of the Florida Building Code, Building. Outlets supplying pool 
pump motors connected to single-phase 120-volt through 240-volt 
branch circ uits, whether by receptacle or by direct connection, and 
outlets supplying other electrical equipment >>connected to single 
phase. 120 volt through 240 volt branch circuits. rated 15 or 20 



 

 

Agenda Item No. 7(B) 
Page 6 

 

amperes. whether by receptacle or by direct connection.<< shall be 
provided with ground-fault circuit interrupter protection for 
personnel. 

 

BACK to TOP 

 

>>The maximum voltage for each underwater luminaire shall not 
exceed the Low Voltage Contact Limit which is defined as a 
voltage not exceeding the following values: 

 

(I) 15 volts (RMS) for sinusoidal alternating current: 
(2) 21.2 volts peak for nonsinusoidal alternating 
current: 
(3) 30 volts continuous direct current: 
( 4) 12.4 volts peak for direct current that is interrupted 
at a rate of 10 to 200 Hertz. 

 

The maximum incandescent lamp size shall be 300 
watts.<< 

 

Section 3. If any section. subsection. sentence, clause or provision ofthis ordinance is 
 

held invalid, the remainder of this ordinance shall not be affected by such invalidity. 
 

Section 4. It is the intention of the Board of County Commissioners, and it is hereby 

ordained that the provisions of this ordinance, including any s\lllSet provision. shall become and 

be made a part of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida. The sections of this ordinance may 

be renumbered or relettered to accomplish such intention. and the word "ordinance" may be 

changed to "section." "article," or other appropriate word. 



 

 

Agenda Item No. 7(B) 
Page 7 

 
 

Sect ion 5. This ordinance shall become effective ten (10) days after the date  of 

enactment unless vetoed by the Mayor, and if vetoed, shall become effective only upon an override 

by this Board. 

 
 

PASSED AND ADOPTED: March 2, 2021 
 

Approved by Cowrty Attorney as 
to form and legal sufficiency: 

 
Prepared by: 

 
Eduardo W. Gonzalez 

 

Prime Sponsor: 
Co-Sponsor: 

Commissioner Sally A. Heyman 
Chairman Jose "Pepe" Diaz 

 
BACK to TOP 

































































BACK to TOP

































BROWARD COUNTY 
BOARD OF RULES AND APPEALS 

ONE NORTH UNIVERSITY DRIVE 
SUITE 3500-B 

PLANTATION, FLORIDA 33324 

PHONE: 954-765-4500 
FAX: 954-765-4504 

www.

October 12, 2020 

RE: Florida Building Code - 7th Edition (2020) - Residential  – R4501.16 
Electrical. 

To whom it may concern: 

The following amendment  to the Florida Building Code - 7th Edition (2020) 
Residential – R4501.16 Electrical was passed by vote of the Broward County 
Board of Rules and Appeals on its regular session of October 8, 2020, the 
effective date is December 31, 2020. 

The amendments consist as follows:  

 Section –  Residential  – R4501.16 Electrical. 

Sub-Section R4501.16.1 Maximum voltage. (new) 

• Total of paragraphs changed : 6

A full amended document is to be posted on the www.floridabuiding.org,  if needed 
please feel free to contact our office 954-765-4500  - or email us at 
rulesboard@broward.org at any time. 

Thank you, 

Ruth Boselli 
Administrative Coordinator 

Attachments  

G:\SHARED\FBC Amendments\2021 - 7th edition amendments\Sent to State October 2020\RESIDENTIAL\Memo 
R4501.16-Electrical.docx 

2020 Voting Members 
Chair  
Mr. Daniel Lavrich, 
P.E.,S.I.,SECB,F.ASCE, F.SEI 
Structural Engineer 
Vice-Chair 
Mr. Stephen E. Bailey, P.E. 
Electrical Engineer 
Mr. John Famularo, 
Roofing Contractor
Mrs. Shalanda Giles Nelson, 
General Contractor 
Mr. Daniel Rourke 
Master Plumber 
Mr. Gregg D’Attile, 
Mechanical Contractor 
Mr. Ron Burr 
Swimming Pool Contractor 
Mr. John Sims, 
Master Electrician 
Mr. Dennis A. Ulmer 
Consumer Advocate 
Mr. Abbas H. Zackria, CSI 
Architect 
Mr. Robert A. Kamm, P.E. 
Mechanical Engineer 
Mr. Sergio Pellecer 
Fire Service Professional 

Vacant  
Representative Disabled Community 

2020 Alternate Board Members 
Mr. Jeff Falkanger 
Architect 
Mr. Steven Feller, P.E.  
Mechanical Engineer 
Mr. Alberto Fernandez,  
General Contractor 
Mr. Robert Taylor 
Fire Service 
Mr. Gary Elzweig, P.E., F.ASCE 
Structural Engineer 
Mr. David Rice, P.E.  
Electrical Engineer 
Mr. James Terry, 
Master Plumber  
Mr. David Tringo,  
Master Electrician 
Mr. William Flett,  
Roofing Contractor 

Board Attorney 
Charles M. Kramer, Esq. 

Board Administrative Director 
James DiPietro 

BACK to TOP

http://www.floridabuiding.org/
mailto:rulesboard@broward.org


R4501.16 Electrical. 
Electrical equipment wiring and installation, including the bonding and grounding of pool 
components, shall comply with Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building. 
Outlets supplying pool pump motors connected to single-phase 120-volt through 240-
volt branch circuits, whether by receptacle or by direct connection, and outlets supplying 
other electrical equipment and underwater luminaires operating at voltages greater than 
the low voltage contact limit, connected to single-phase, 120 volt through 240 volt 
branch circuits, rated 15 or 20 amperes, whether by receptacle or by direct connection, 
shall be provided with ground-fault circuit interrupter protection for personnel.  

R4501.16.1 Maximum voltage. The maximum voltage for each luminaire in any private 
swimming or bathing pools shall not exceed the Low Voltage Contact Limit, which is defined 
as a voltage not exceeding the following values: 

(1) 15 volts (RMS) for sinusoidal alternating current
(2) 21.2 volts peak for nonsinusoidal alternating current
(3) 30 volts continuous direct current
(4) 12.4 volts peak for direct current that is interrupted at a rate of 10 to 200 Hertz The
maximum incandescent lamp size shall be 300 watts.

3

BACK to TOP



BROWARD COUNTY LOCAL AMENDMENT 
Proposed Modification to the Florida Building Code 

Per Section 553.73. Fla Stat

Name:   Broward County, Board of Rules and Appeals, ATTN: J. DiPietro _______________ 

Address:   1 North University Dr. Suite 3500B Plantation, FL 33324_____________________ 

E-mail:  jdipietro@broward.org ________________________________________________ 

Phone:       954-765-4500_______________________________________________________

Fax:           954-765-4504 ______________________________________________________

Code:   Florida Building Code, Building, 7th Edition (2020).  Section R4501.16 

Text of Modification (additions underlined; deletion stricken): 
Please see attachment. 

Respond to the following questions: 

1. How is the local amendment more stringent than the minimum standards described in the FBC?

This amendment exceeds the minimum standards by requiring all swimming pool lighting fixtures
to be low voltage (15 Volts or less) RMS for sinusoidal alternating current.

2. Demonstrate or provide evidence or data that the geographical jurisdiction governed by the local
governing body exhibits a local need to strengthen the FBC beyond the needs or regional variation
addressed by the FBC.

South Florida has more swimming pools than other jurisdictions, also South Florida salty
environment may cause loose or broken connections on electrical equipment.

3. Explain how the local need is addressed by the proposed local amendment.

This modification will require all swimming pool lighting to be 15 volts or less RMS for sinusoidal
alternating current, thereby reducing the probability of  electrocution hazard of high voltage
lighting in residential swimming pools.

4. Explain how the local amendment is no more stringent than necessary to address the local need.

4

mailto:jdipietro@broward.org


This modification will require all swimming pool lighting to be 15 volts or less RMS for sinusoidal 
alternating current, thereby reducing the probability of electrocution hazard of high voltage 
lighting in residential swimming pools. 

5. Are the additional requirements discriminatory against materials, products, or construction
techniques of demonstrated capabilities?

No.

6. Indicate whether or not additional requirements introduce a new subject not already addressed
in the FBC.

The Florida Building Code currently allows the use of high voltage and low voltage types of light
fixtures. Thus, by only allowing low voltage pool light fixtures to be used for pool lighting would
strengthen the code.

7. Include a fiscal impact statement which documents the costs and benefits of the proposed
amendment. Criteria for the fiscal impact statement shall include a, b, and c:
a) Impact to local government, relative to enforcement.

None

b) Impact to property and building owners relative to cost of compliance.

Less than $50.00 per swimming pool

c) Impact to industry relative to the cost of compliance

Less than $50.00 per swimming pool

Broward County Board of Rules and Appeals Public hearing and vote on  October 8th, 2020.

Amendment Effective date: December 31, 2020. 

5


	Swimming Pool - Local Amendments WORD.pdf
	BROWARD COUNTY
	BACK
	BACK to TOP
	BROWARD COUNTY LOCAL AMENDMENT
	Respond to the following questions:
	Broward County Board of Rules and Appeals Public hearing and vote on October 8, 2020, respectively.


	BACK to TOP
	Electrical equipment wiring and installation, including the bonding and grounding of pool components, shall comply with Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building. Outlets supplying pool pump motors connected to single-phase 120-volt through 24...
	BROWARD COUNTY LOCAL AMENDMENT
	Respond to the following questions:
	Broward County Board of Rules and Appeals Public hearing and vote on October 8, 2020, respectively.
	OF COL'NTV C O on S1O. RS
	(Revised)
	FROM:
	Please note any items checked.
	BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA:
	Sec. 8-31. - Local technical amendments to Florida Building Code.

	* * *


	BACK to TOP
	skall he sHGk that, wkere the fiKtHre is flF0flerly iRStalleEI without a greund famt  eireuit ieterr ter,  there  is ft0 skeek 80:lBrd with aRy
	(1) 15 ¥alts (RMS) fer sinuseidal alternating eurreet
	[[454.1.4,l Eleetrieal efiuipmeet eed w111eg. Blectrieal eeiHiflmeRt vliring aRd iRStall&tion, including the heeEling aed greHRding efpeol GOffif:!0ReRts skall eomply with Chapter 27 of the Flerida Building Gode, 8uildieg. Outlets s plying peel pump m...
	Ille mmamum •;altage fer eaeh URaen¥ater h:tmiROire shall R0t eKeeea tke Low ¥eltage Camaet Limit, whieh is aefiRed as a
	(3) 30 ¥alts eaRtiRHeHS direet eurreRt
	Ille maximum i0ea0deseeRt lamp si:a, shall ae 300 watts-.]]
	>>454.1.10.4.1 Ground-fault circuit interrupter protection for personnel.
	454.2.16 Electrical.


	BACK to TOP
	BACK to TOP


	Winter Park 4501.17
	Broward County 4501.16
	6. R4501.16.1 FBC, Residential, 7th Edition Swimming Pools
	R4501.16 Electrical.

	7. Swimming Pool Amnd - 5th Edition Update to 7th Edition R4501.16




