Supplement to the 2007 Florida Building Code, August 2008

2007 Florida Building Code, Mechanical


Preface

Preface add text after the section, Adoption and Maintenance, to read as follows:
Letter Designations in Front of Section Numbers

In each code development cycle, proposed changes to the code are considered at the Code Development Hearings by the ICC Fire Code Development Committee, whose action constitutes a recommendation to the voting membership for final action on the proposed change. Proposed changes to a code section that has a number beginning with a letter in brackets are considered by a different code development committee. For example, proposed changes to code sections that have [F] in front of them (e.g. [F] 903.1.1.1) are considered by the ICC Fire Code Development Committee at the code development hearings.

The content of sections in this code that begin with a letter designation are maintained by another code development committee in accordance with the following:

[E] = International Energy Conservation Code Development Committee;

[EB] = International Existing Building Code Development Committee;

[EL] = ICC Electrical Code Development Committee;

[F] = International Fire Code Development Committee;

[FG] = International Fuel Gas Code Development Committee;

[M] = International Mechanical Code Development Committee; and

[P] = International Plumbing Code Development Committee.
[Mod 2862]

Chapter 2 Definitions

Section 202 General Definitions, revise text to read as follows:

BOILER, HOT WATER SUPPLY. Any vessel used for generating hot water to be used external to the vessel, which exceeds any of the following limitations:

1. A heat input capacity of 400,000 200,000 Btuh (58.6 kW).

2. A water temperature of 210 200ºF (93ºC).

3. A nominal water capacity of 120 gal (454 L).
[Commissioner Bassett comment]

CONDITIONED SPACE. That volume of a structure which is either mechanically heated, cooled or both heated and cooled by direct means. Spaces within the thermal envelope that are

not directly conditioned shall be considered buffered unconditioned space. Such spaces may include, but are not limited to, mechanical rooms, stairwells and unducted spaces beneath

roofs and between floors. Air leakage into dropped ceiling cavities does not constitute conditioned space. For residential energy purposes; see “SPACE (a) conditioned space, Chapter 11 Section N1100.7.3 of the Florida Building Code, Residential.
[Mod 3003 revised]

Chapter 3 General Regulations
Section 304.5 Public garages, revise text to read as follows:

304.5 Public garages. Appliances located in public garages, motor fueling dispensing facilities, repair garages or other areas frequented by motor vehicles, shall be installed a minimum of 8 feet (2438 mm) above the floor. Where motor vehicles exceed 6 feet (1829 mm) in height and are capable of passing under an appliance, appliances shall be installed a minimum of 2 feet (610 mm) higher above the floor than the height of the tallest vehicle.
Exception: The requirements of this section shall not apply where the appliances are protected from motor vehicle impact and installed in accordance with Section 304.3 and NFPA 30A.

[Mod 2822]

Chapter 4 Ventilation
Section 403.1 Ventilation of uninhabited spaces, revise text to read as follows:

403.1 Ventilation system. Mechanical ventilation shall be provided by a method of supply air and return or exhaust air. The amount of supply air shall be approximately equal to the

amount of return and exhaust air. The system shall not be prohibited from producing negative or positive pressure. The system to convey ventilation air shall be designed and installed in accordance with Chapter 6. See also Section 13-409.ABC.2 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

No change to remaining text.
[Staff comment AS.  Mod 2823 comment1 NAR]

Section 406Ventilation, revise to read as follows:
SECTION 406  RESERVED
VENTILATION OF UNINHABITED SPACES

406.1 General. Uninhabited spaces, such as crawl spaces and attics, shall be provided with natural ventilation openings as required by the Florida Building Code, Building or shall be provided with a mechanical exhaust and supply air system. The mechanical exhaust rate shall be not less than 0.02 cfm per square foot (0.00001 m3/s • m2) of horizontal area and shall be automatically controlled to operate when the relative humidity in the space served exceeds 60 percent.

[Staff comment]

Chapter 5 Exhaust Systems
Section 504.6 Domestic clothes dryer ducts, revise text to read as follows:

504.6  Domestic clothes dryer ducts. Exhaust ducts for domestic clothes dryers shall be constructed of metal and shall have a smooth interior finish. The exhaust duct shall be a minimum nominal size of 4 inches (102 mm) in diameter. The entire exhaust system shall be supported and secured in place. The male end of the duct at overlapped duct joints shall extend in the direction of airflow. Clothes dryer transition ducts used to connect the appliance to the exhaust duct system shall be limited to single lengths not to exceed 8 feet (2438 mm) and shall be listed and labeled for the application. Transition ducts shall not be concealed within construction.

Exhaust ducts for domestic clothes dryers shall have a smooth interior finish and the maximum developed length shall not exceed 25 feet (7620 mm) from the dryer location to the outlet terminal. The maximum length of the duct shall be reduced 2½ feet (762 mm) for each 45-degree (0.79 rad) bend and 5 feet (1524 mm) for each 90-degree (1.6 rad) bend. The exhaust duct shall be a minimum nominal size of 4 inches (102 mm) in diameter. The entire exhaust system shall be supported and secured in place. The male end of the duct at overlapped duct joints shall extend in the direction of airflow. Clothes dryer transition ducts used to connect the appliance to the exhaust duct system shall be limited to single lengths not to exceed 8 feet (2438 mm) in length and shall be listed and labeled for the application. Transition ducts shall not be concealed within construction. 

Developed duct lengths longer than 25 feet (7620 mm) shall be allowed for specific dryer installations where the dryer manufacturer’s installation instructions specify the allowable developed length of an engineered system.

Exception: Where a clothes dryer booster fan is installed and listed and labeled for the application, the maximum length of the exhaust duct, including any transition duct, shall be permitted to be in accordance with the booster fan manufacturer’s installation instructions. Where a clothes dryer booster fan is installed and not readily accessible from the room in which the dryer is located, a permanent identifying label shall be placed adjacent to where the exhaust duct enters the wall. The label shall bear the words: “This dryer exhaust system is equipped with a remotely located booster fan.”

Section 504.6.1 Maximum length, revise text to read as follows:

504.6.1 Maximum length. The maximum length of a clothes dryer exhaust duct shall not exceed 25 feet (7620 mm) from the dryer location to the outlet terminal. The maximum length of the duct shall be reduced 21/2 feet (762 mm) for each 45 degree (0.79 rad) bend and 5 feet (1524 mm) for each 90 degree (1.6 rad) bend. The maximum length of the exhaust duct does not include the transition duct.

Exception: 
1. Where the make and model of the clothes dryer to be installed is known and the manufacturer’s installation instructions for such dryer are provided to the code official, the maximum length of the exhaust duct, including any transition duct, shall be permitted to be in accordance with the dryer manufacturer’s installation instructions. 

2. Where a clothes dryer booster fan is installed and listed and labeled for the application, the maximum length of the exhaust duct, including any transition duct, shall be permitted to be in accordance with the booster fan manufacturer’s installation instructions.  Where a clothes dryer booster fan is installed and not readily accessible from the room in which the dryer is located, a permanent identifying label shall be placed adjacent to where the exhaust duct enters the wall. The label shall bear the words: “This dryer exhaust system is equipped with a remotely located booster fan.”

[Mod 2946rev]

Section 506.3.2.5 is moved to become Section 506.3.3.1:
506.3.3.1 506.3.2.5 Grease duct test. Prior to the use or concealment of any portion of a grease duct system, a leakage test shall be performed in the presence of the code official. Ducts shall be considered to be concealed where installed in shafts or covered by coatings or wraps that prevent the ductwork from being visually inspected on all sides. The permit holder shall be responsible to provide the necessary equipment and perform the grease duct leakage test. A light test or an approved equivalent test method shall be performed to determine that all welded and brazed joints are liquid tight. A light test shall be performed by passing a lamp having a power rating of not less than 100 watts through the entire section of duct work to be tested. The lamp shall be open so as to emit light equally in all directions perpendicular to the duct walls. A test shall be performed for the entire duct system, including the hood-to-duct connection. The ductwork shall be permitted to be tested in sections, provided that every joint is tested.

[Staff comment:  New IMC section is in the wrong place in the FBC-M.]

Section 508.1.1 Makeup air temperature, delete text to read as follows:

508.1.1 Makeup air temperature.  Reserved. The temperature differential between makeup air and the air in the conditioned space shall not exceed 10ºF 

Exceptions:

1. Makeup air that is part of the air-conditioning system.

2. Makeup air that does not decrease the comfort conditions of the occupied space.

[Mod 3245]

Section 511.1.1 Collectors and separators, revise text to read as follow:

511.1.1 Collectors and separators. Collectors and separators involving such systems as centrifugal separators, bag filter systems and similar devices, and associated supports shall be constructed of noncombustible materials and shall be located on the exterior of the building or structure. A collector or separator shall not be located nearer than 10 feet (3048 mm) to combustible construction or to an unprotected wall or floor opening, unless the collector is provided with a metal vent pipe that extends above the highest part of any roof within a distance of 30 feet (9144 mm).
Exceptions 1 and 2, no change.
[Mod 2825]
Section 513 Smoke Control Systems, revise text to read as follows:
SECTION 513

SMOKE and CARBON MONOXIDE CONTROL SYSTEMS

Section 513.3 Special inspection and test requirements, revise text to read as follows:

513.3 Special inspection and test requirements. In addition to the ordinary inspection and test requirements which buildings, structures and parts thereof are required to undergo, smoke control systems subject to the provisions of Section 909 of the Florida Building Code, Building shall undergo special inspections and tests sufficient to verify the proper commissioning of the smoke control design in its final installed condition. The design submission accompanying the construction documents shall clearly detail procedures and methods to be used and the items subject to such inspections and tests. Such commissioning shall be in accordance with generally accepted engineering practice and, where possible, based on published standards for the particular testing involved. The special inspections and tests required by this section shall be conducted under the same terms as found in Section 909.18 1704 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

[Mod 2982 revised]
Section 513.12 Detection and control systems, revise text to read as follows:

[F] 513.12 Detection and control systems. 
513.12.1 Fire detection systems.  Fire detection systems providing control input or output signals to mechanical smoke control systems or elements thereof shall comply with the requirements of Chapter 9 of the Florida Building Code, Building and NFPA 72. Such systems shall be equipped with a control unit complying with UL 864 and listed as smoke control equipment.

Control systems for mechanical smoke control systems shall include provisions for verification. Verification shall include positive confirmation of actuation, testing, manual override, the presence of power downstream of all disconnects and, through a preprogrammed weekly test sequence report, abnormal conditions audibly, visually and by printed report.

[F] 513.12.1.1 Wiring. In addition to meeting the requirements of Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building, all wiring, regardless of voltage, shall be fully enclosed within continuous raceways.
[F] 513.12.1.2 Activation. Smoke control systems shall be activated in accordance with the Florida Building Code, Building.

[F] 513.12.1.3 Automatic control. Where completely automatic control is required or used, the automatic control sequences shall be initiated from an appropriately zoned automatic sprinkler system complying with the Florida Fire Prevention Code or from manual controls that are readily accessible to the fire department, and any smoke detectors required by engineering analysis.
513.12.2 Carbon monoxide control systems.  See Section 913 of the Florida Building Code, Building.
[Mod 2895]

Chapter 6 Duct Systems

Section 603.8 Cavities of the building structure, revise text to read as follows:

603.8 Cavities of the building structure.  Cavities in framed spaces, such as dropped soffits and walls, shall not be used to deliver air from or return air to the conditioning system unless they contain an air duct insert which is insulated in accordance with Table 13-410.1.ABC.2.2 or Table 13-610.1.ABC.2.1 of Chapter 13 of the Florida Building Code, Building and constructed and sealed in accordance with the requirements of Section 603.1 appropriate for the duct materials used.
Exception: Return air plenums.

Cavities designed for air transport such as mechanical closets, chases, air shafts, etc. shall be lined with an air barrier and sealed in accordance with Section 603.9 and shall be insulated in accordance with Table 13-410.1.ABC.2.2 or Table 13-610.1.ABC.2.1 of Chapter 13 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

Building cavities which will be used as return air plenums shall be lined with a continuous air barrier made of durable non-porous materials. All penetrations of the air barrier shall be sealed with a suitable long-life mastic material.

Exception: Surfaces between the plenum and conditioned spaces from which the return/mixed air is drawn.

Building cavities beneath a roof deck that will be used as return air plenums shall have an insulated roof with the insulation having an R-value of at least R-19.

Section 603.10 Enclosed support platforms, revise text to read as follows:

603.10 Enclosed support platforms. Enclosed support platforms located between the return air inlet(s) from conditioned space and the inlet of the air handling unit or furnace, shall contain a duct section constructed entirely of rigid metal, rigid fibrous glass duct board, or flexible duct which is constructed and sealed according to the respective requirements of Section 603.1 and insulated according to the requirements of Section 13-410.1.ABC.2.2 and 13-610.1.ABC.2.1 of Chapter 13 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

●
The duct section shall be designed and constructed so that no portion of the building structure, including adjoining walls, floors and ceilings, shall be in contact with the return air stream or function as a component of this duct section.

●
The duct section shall not be penetrated by a refrigerant line chase, refrigerant line, wiring, pipe or any object other than a component of the air distribution system.

●
Through-wall, through-floor and through-ceiling penetrations into the duct section shall contain a branch duct which is fabricated of rigid fibrous glass duct board or rigid metal and which extends to and is sealed to both the duct section and the grille side wall surface. The branch duct shall be fabricated and attached to the duct insert in accordance with Section 603.3 or Section 603.4.2, respective to the duct type used.

[Staff Comment]

Chapter 10 Boilers, Water Heaters and Pressure Vessels
Section 1003.1 General, revise text to read as follows:

1003.1 General. All pressure vessels shall bear the label of an approved agency and shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions. Pressure vessels shall be designed and stamped per ASME Boiler and Pressure Vessel Code, Section VIII-Division 1, Division 2, or Division 3, 1998 edition, 1999 addenda and interpretation.
[Mod 2947]

Chapter 12 Hydronic Piping

1206.9.1 Flood hazard. See Section 301.13. Piping located in a flood hazard area shall be capable of resisting hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and stresses, including the effects of buoyancy, during the occurrence of flooding to the design flood elevation.
[Staff Comment]

Chapter 13 Fuel Oil Piping and Storage

Section 1305.2.1 Flood hazard, revise text to read as follows:

Section 1305.2.1 Flood hazard. See Section 301.13. All fuel oil pipe, equipment and appliances located in flood hazard areas shall be located above the design flood elevation or shall be capable of resisting hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and stresses, including the effects of buoyancy, during the occurrence of flooding  to the design flood elevation.
[Staff Comment]

Chapter 15, Reference Standards

Revise text to read as follows:

NFPA

30A—03 00 Code for Motor Fuel-dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .304.5

86-03 99 Standard for Ovens and Furnaces  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .924.1

90B-06 02 Standard for the Installation of Warm Air Heating and Air Conditioning Systems .. 301.15

91—04 99 Exhaust Systems for Air Conveying of Vapors, Gases, Mists and

Noncombustible Particulate Solids . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .502.9.5.1, 502.17

96-04 01 Ventilation Control and Fire Protection of Commercial Cooking Operations . . . ... . . .506.1

214-05 96 Standard on Water Cooling Towers  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .908.1

[Mod 3052]
PAGE  
7
C:\Documents and Settings\AnnS\My Documents\fbc\MechTAC\Supplement to the 2007 Florida Building Code mechanical.doc
Last printed 11/5/2008 4:37:00 PM

