Page 1 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Code Change Cycle: 2013 Triennial Original Modification 7/1/2012 - 8/2/2012 AELE DA
TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
SubCode: Building
2-Definitions
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5190 2 202 Joe Bigelow To be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement the Commission plan to update the 2013 Code

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| |:|NAR EW |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5633 2 202 Dwight Wilkes Reason: The overall intent of this proposal is to clarify the requirements for tubular daylighting devices,
within the context of skylights and sloped glazing.

Comment EAS D AM DNAR DW DI TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5726 2 202 Joseph Belcher  Brings forward definition of screen enclosure.

Comment EAS D AM DNAR DW DI TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5727 2 202 Joseph Belcher  Brings forward definition of screen enclosure.

Comment EAS D AM DNAR DW DI TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Busjnessy 1 4
Professianal ! :
o . Bualefury OOt o SIandlargy

Total Mods for this TAC: 236

TAC: Structural

Page 2 of 53
9/28/2012

Summary
Retains definition of awning as companion to Mod 5932

Proponent

Mod # Chapter Section
5936 2 202 Joseph Belcher

Pending Review

[Jav  KnarR [Jw

NAR — TAC supports the mod in concept with a comma added after the word “moveable” and to consider the word ‘fixed’ for ‘rigid’ -

comment [_]As I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

Second:

Glenn

14-Exterior Walls

Summary
Delete HVHZ Sections

Proponent
Michael Goolsby

Section
1401.1

Mod # Chapter

4926 M

Pending Review

comment K Jas  []Aam  [NnarR [w C TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Glenn

Summary
Provides reference to labeling requirments for manufactured soffits.

Proponent
Joseph Belcher

Section
1404.13

Chapter

5733

Pending Review

Cdav  [Ovar [[Jw C TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Macomber

Proponent Summary

Michael Goolsby

Chapter Section
14 1404.5.1 Section formatting

Pending Review

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

[Jav  [nar [Jw I

As submitted with consideration for computer error.

Second:

Strawn

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 3 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4931 14 1405.1 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5728 14 1405.1 Joseph Belcher  Brings forward modifications to  AAMA 1402.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Kim

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4932 14 1405.17 Michael Goolshby  Section formatting
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Gascon

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4922 14 1410 Oriol Haage Delete HVHZ Sections
Comment K Jas  []Am  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4933 14 Table 1405.2 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Gascon

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 4 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
16-Structural Desian
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5425 16 1601.1 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Comment [K_]As [Jav  [Inar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

I

Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

16 1605 Suzanne Davis

5116

Section 1605.3.1.1 Declaratory statement determined by the Commission. To be consistent with the
Florida Statutes and to implement the Commission plan to update the 2013 Code

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[Jav K nar [Jw

NAR — already covered by the reference standard.

TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second:

I

Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5118 16 1609 Wind Suzanne Davis Figure 1609 A, B, C Wind Maps added To be consistent with the 2010 FBC Wind maps to continue to
Loads provide for improved resolution for the maps and to implement the Commission plan to update the 2013
Code
comment [ Jas [Javm [ InarR [Jw C TAC Vote: OY-10N Second: Glenn
NAR — to allow staff to correct title and note 1.
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5121 16 1609.1 Suzanne Davis Update Exception 5 to be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement the Commission plan to
Exceptions update the 2013 Code

Comment DAS

K] am

AM - Correct formatting/underline.

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

I

Kim

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 5 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5608 16 1609.1.1 T Stafford Correlation with the 2010 FBC and ASCE 7-10 wind speeds.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Macomber

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5732 16 1609.1.1 Joseph Belcher This mod provides a reference to section 2002.4 for the determination of wind loads on screen enclosures.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5667 16 1609.1.2.1 Joseph Belcher  Adds impact resistant covering as option to protect louvers.

Comment |:|As |:| AM DNAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 7Y-3N Second: Glenn

NAR — creates a life safety issue for essential facilities.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5951 16 1609.1.2.1 Amanda Hickman  Corrects misprint in 2012 IBC on AMCA 540 - test standard for louvers.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5668 16 1609.1.2.2 Joseph Belcher  provides correlation between ASTM E 1996, FBCB, and ASCE 7-10 regarding Wind Zone 4.

Comment |:|As |:| AM DNAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 2Y-8N Second: Glenn

NAR — Weakens the code.

TAC Recommendations Key
| AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 6 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5759 16 1609.1.2.3 Jim Heise Section 1609.1.2.4 Impact resistant coverings. Add text to read as shown.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| |:|NAR EW |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5669 16 1609.1.2.4 Joseph Belcher Establishes factor of safety for testing of impact resistant coverings and provides reference to labeling
requiremets for impact resistan coverings.

Comment EAS |:| AM |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 8Y-1IN Second: Kim

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5715 16 1609.1.2.5 Joseph Belcher  Retains alternate for testing side-hinged steel exterior doors.

Comment |:|As |:| AM DNAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 4Y-6N Second: Glenn

NAR - No Florida specific need

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5707 16 1609.1.2 Joseph Belcher Retains provisions related to glazed opening protection; impact standards; statutory provisions related to
storage sheds; and opening protection for sunrooms.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| ENAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Glenn

NAR — for correction of the grammatical and punctuation issues and possibly correcting section numbers.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5607 16 1609.1 T Stafford Clarifies the applicable wind loads for soffits.

Comment []As AM  KCNAR []w I TAC Vote: Second:
Motion to table Gascon 2™ Carroll Vote 10Y-ON

Motion to remove from table Glenn based on need for NAR - 2™ Gascon

Vote 0Y-10N based on action on 5734.

TAC Recommendations Key
| AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 7 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5734 16 1609.1 Joseph Belcher Carries forward provison stipulating exterior wall coverings and soffits to be designed to resist C&amp;C

loads and reference to labeling repuirements for soffits.

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Macomber

Mod # Chapter

Section

5613 ¢

1609.4.2

Proponent

Summary

T Stafford

Reinstates the open patch limitations for Surface Roughness C from the 2010 FBCB.

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Lavrich

Mod # Chapter

Section

5321 16

1609.7

Proponent

Summary

Joseph Hetzel

Inclusion of garage door / rolling door wind load Table.

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] Aawv

NAR — to clarify the table.

Enar [Jw

TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

I

Second:

Glenn

Mod # Chapter

Section

5643  1°

1616.3

Proponent

Summary

Bonnie Manley

This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, revises the requirements for the deflection of
structural roofing and siding made of formed metal sheets to be more consistent with current testing

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] Awv

Enar [Jw

H £, A3 h
requirements-found-inthe FBC:

I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

NAR — basis of waiting for support data and proponent to submit the data that is currently in testing to be presented prior to February Commission meeting.
available, suggest mod to be denied.

Second:

Glenn

If data is not made

Mod # Chapter

Section

5433 16

1616.5

Proponent

Summary

Michael Goolsby

Add reference for Table 1607.1 footnote

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Carroll

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

w2 4

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 8 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5429 16 1617 Michael Goolshy  Delete HVHZ Section to adopt base code provisions
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5427 16 1618.9 Michael Goolshy  Delete HVHZ Section to adopt base code provisions
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5954 16 1626.1 Amanda Hickman Adds AMCA 540 to HWHZ section of the code.
Comment [ Jas []AM  EINAR [ w I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Gascon

NAR — add cycling requirements for the HVHZ in the standard.

Mod # Chapter

Section

5955 16

1626.1

Proponent

Summary

Amanda Hickman

Adds AMCA 540 to HWHZ section of the code and clarifies language.

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] Awv

Enar [Jw

NAR — based on action on previous mod 5954.

I

TAC Vote:

0Y-10N

Second:

Kim

Mod # Chapter

Section

5253 16

1626.2

Proponent

Jaime Gascon

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

10Y-ON

Second:

Summary
Correlation to TAS201 and TAS203 and specify large missile speeds for essential facilities - Building
Category IV.

I TAC Vote:

Lavrich

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 9 of 53

EL:'?”ES:"H. 4 _StrUCtU ral 9/28/2012
FOIEASINIA Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review
Buskiing Ciocion e Stancardy
TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5729 16 Table 1604.3 Joseph Belcher Adds screen enclosures to table; adds oercebtage if solids for screen walls.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5949 16 Table 1604.5 Joseph Belcher  Retains screen enclosures as low hazard to humn life.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5431 16 Table 1607.1 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting
footnotes
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5610 16 Table 1609.1.2 T Stafford Correlation with wind speeds in ASCE 7-10.
Comment K Jas  []Am  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5611 16 Table 1609.1.2 T Stafford Correlation with wind speeds in ASCE 7-10.
Comment [ Jas  []Am [INAR KW I TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent.

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 10 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
17-Structural Tests and Special Inspections
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5324 17 1702, 1710.5.3 Joseph Hetzel Inclusion of garage door labeling language.

Comment EAS

[] awv

[Cnar [Jw

|:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section
17 1702-09
5149 Definitions

Proponent

Summary

Suzanne Davis

To be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement the Commission plan to update the 2013
Code.

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

I

Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5024 17 1710 &amp; Jaime Gascon Reinstates all the exterior window and door assemblies’ structural performance and standards from the
1711 2010 FBC that are applicable to the HVHZ and are structural wind-related.
comment [ Jas [Javm [ InarR [Jw C TAC Vote: OY-ON Second: Gascon
NAR — proponent wishes to make some clarifications in the mod.
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5325 17 1710.5.2 Joseph Hetzel Clarifies test requirements for sectional garage doors and rolling doors.
comment K ]as []avm [INarR [Jw C TAC Vote: 9Y-ON Second: Gascon

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 11 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5582 17 1710.5 Dwight Wilkes Reinstates exterior window and door assemblies structural performance and standards from the 2010 FBC

and introduces language submitted to the ICC for inclusion into the 2015 IBC, thru modification to the

Elarida-h Aatha-2012-1RC-P le Q172 ~A-Q179
FIOrda uase Couc e 2ulLZ 1L Froposalis st7ioard sivs

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| ENAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Lavrich

NAR — based on proponents request to work with Jamie Gascon of Miami-Dade regarding the mod.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5615 17 1710.5 T Stafford Correlation with ASCE 7-10. Clarifies the appropriate reduction of design pressures for the purposes of
testing of products that are and have been historically tested using allowable or nominal wind loads.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 9Y-ON Second: Strawn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5855 17 1710.5 James Bell Component approvals are essential to door openings that are made of component. Hardware items such
as hinges, locks,exit devices and bolts are the structural components and need to be rates and have

quqiit dssulrarice.
Comment |:|As |:| AM DNAR |:|W |:i| TAC Vote: 4Y-6N Second: Kim

NAR — weakens the code.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

6007 17 1710.5 Kari Hebrank Add new exception for custom doors. Allows accepted engineering practices such as rational or
comparative analysis for one-of-a-kind custom doors. This language has been incorporated into every
version-of the FloridaBuilding-Code since2002:

Comment |:|As |:| AM DNAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 4Y-6N Second: Glenn

NAR — weakens the code.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

6012 17 1710.5 Kari Hebrank This proposed modification will allow approved door components to be interchanged in exterior door
assemblies provided that the door components provide equal or greater performance. This change has
"""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""""" beenpart-of the 2004, 2007 and 2010 -Florida Building-Code:
| il

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| DNAR |:|W

NAR — weakens the code. Proponent did not provide Florida specifics justification.

TAC Vote: 4Y-6N Second: Glenn

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 12 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5635 17 1710.6 Dwight Wilkes Reason: The overall intent of this proposal is to clarify the requirements for tubular daylighting devices,

within the context of skylights and sloped glazing.

Comment DAS

[] Awv

Enar [Jw

TAC Vote: 0Y-ON

I

NAR — no Florida specific need and this mod will lose the regulation of Tubular Daylight Devices.

Second:

Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5712 17 1710.8 Joseph Belcher Adds requirements labeling and installation of hurricane resistant coverings.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5737 17 1710.9.4 Joseph Belcher  Brings forward existing provisions for soffit installation and testing.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Macomber

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
17 1710.9 Joseph Belcher  Brings currently required labeling provisions for soffits forward.
5736
Comment K Jas  []Am  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5623 17 1710 Dwight Wilkes Reinstates the exterior window and door structural performance, standards and label from the 2010 FBC
with modifications to clearify Existing FBC 1715.5.
Comment [ Jas []AM  [EINAR [ w I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Glenn

NAR — at proponents request to remove dates from mod language.

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods

2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review
Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

TAC: Structural

Total Mods for this TAC: 236

Page 13 of 53
9/28/2012

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5760 17 1715.5.4.2 Jim Heise 1715.5.4.2 Masonry, concrete or other structural substrate. Add to read as shown.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino
Staff to correct typo in data.
18-Soils and Foundations
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4930 18 1801.1 Michael Goolsby  Remove guidance to HVHZ sections deleted as non-wind related.

Comment EAS D AM

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

[Cnar [Jw I

Second:

Lavrich

Chapter Section

1801.2

4934 18

Proponent Summary
Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Pending Review

[] awv

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

[Cnar [Jw I

Second:

Lavrich

Chapter Section

18 1806.1

Proponent Summary
Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Pending Review

[] awv

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

[Cnar [Jw I

Second:

Lavrich

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

W Structural
- ' Tracking Chart - All Mods
= . 2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural

Total Mods for this TAC: 236

Page 14 of 53
9/28/2012

Section Proponent Summary

Mod # Chapter

5958 18

1807.2.4 Joseph Belcher Retains criteria for design and construction of reinforced masonry retaining walls.

Pending Review

Comment EAS

|:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent Summary

5007 18

1808.3 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Pending Review

Comment EAS

|:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

Carroll

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent Summary

4936 18

1810.3.9.4.1 Michael Goolshby  Section formatting

Pending Review

Comment DAS

Staff clean up spacing.

|:|A|v| |:|NAR EW |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent.

Gascon

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent Summary

4937 18

1810.3.9.4.2 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Pending Review

Comment DAS

|:|A|v| |:|NAR EW |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent.

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent Summary

5801 18

1816.1.7 Steven Dwinell Modify language to state that contracts offered for termite protection compy with Chapter 482, F.S., the
Florida Structural Pest Control Act.

Pending Review

Comment DAS

Vote - 6Y-4N

AM  KCNAR []w I TAC Vote: 4Y-6N Second:
NAR — weakens the base document .
Motion to reconsider Gascon — 2™ Glenn Vote 6Y-4N

NAR — weakens the base document.

Macomber

TAC Recommendations Key

| AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 15 of 53

EL:'?”ES:"H. 4 _Stru ctural 9/28/2012
FOIEASINIA Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review
Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy
TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236

19-Concrete
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4943 19 1901.1 Michael Goolsby  Delete HVHZ Sections

Comment K_]AS [Jav  [Inar [Jw I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4942 19 1908.4 Michael Goolsby  Section Formatting

Comment K_]AS [Jav  [nar [Jw I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5619 19 1913 T Stafford Reinstates requirements that gable endwalls be structurally continuous between points of lateral support.
This language currently exists in the 2010 FBCB.

Comment K_]AS [Jav  [nar [Jw I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4941 19 1927 and 1928 Michael Goolsby  Deletion of HVHZ sections

comment [K_]As [Jav  [nar [Jw I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

20-Aluminum

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

w2 4

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Page 16 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5795 20 2001 and 2002  Joseph Belcher  Retains FBC design criteria for aluminum structures.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5762 20 2002.6 Jim Heise without this, screen enclosures can be misinterpreted as &quot;window&quot; products as has occurred in
other states
Comment [ Jas []Am  [ECINAR [ w I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Glenn
NAR — at the proponent’s request.
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5792 20 2002.6 Joseph Belcher Carries forward adoption of AAMA 2100; Carries forward and updates sunroom categories.
Comment [ Jas []AM  EINAR [w | TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second:
Motion to table until after 5893 Lavrich 2™ Gascon  Vote 10Y-ON
Motion to untable Glenn 2™ Lavrich Vote 10Y-ON
2" Glen for NAR —
NAR at proponents reauest to make corrections.
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4955 20 2003.6.3 Michael Goolsby  Formatting HVHZ reference necessary to maintain base code continuity.
Comment K Jas  []Am  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
20 2003.8.2.1 [ Section Formatting
4956 Michael Goolsby

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W

|:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 17 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5781 20 Table 2002.4 Joseph Belcher Brings forward the table providing design wind pressures for screened enclosures.

Comment DAS

[Jav  [Inar KQw

Withdrawn by proponent in favor of 5905.

|:|| TAC Vote:

Second:

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
Joseph Belcher i

5905 20 Table 2002.4 p Revises Note c of Mod 5781
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 9Y-1N Second: Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5789 20 Table 2002.4A Joseph Belcher Brings forward table with height adjustment factors for screen enclosure design.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

21-Masonrv

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

4957 21 2101.1 Michael Goolsby  Section Formatting

Comment [K_]As [Jav  [nar [Jw

I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Carroll

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 18 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5974 21 2107.1 Joseph Belcher  Retains exception to inspection requirements of adopted standard.
Comment [ Jas []Am  [ECINAR [ w I TAC Vote: 1Y-9N Second: Glenn
NAR — not required.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5962 21 2107.2 Joseph Belcher Clarifies application of MSJC and corrects erroneous reference to a section in MSJC.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5963 21 2107.4 Joseph Belcher  Deletes an unnecessary change to the MSJC.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5975 21 2107.4 Joseph Belcher  Modify Mod 5963 to show section as reserved, rather than deleted.
Comment K Jas  []Am  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5977 21 2107.4 Joseph Belcher Retains gamma factors for calculating lap length for development of bars in tension and compression.

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Parrino

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 19 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5979 21 2107.5 Joseph Belcher  Reinstates provision within MSJC dealing with lateral ties in pilasters.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5987 21 2107.5 Joseph Belcher  Revision of Mod 5979 to remove Section of TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE 5, Section 1.15 from Mod as the
Section is unchanged and was included solely for reference, not direct inclusion in the code.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| |:|NAR EW |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5973 21 2108.1 Joseph Belcher  Retains exception to inspection requirements of adopted standard.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| ENAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Glenn

NAR — at proponents request.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5980 21 2108.4 Joseph Belcher Retains gamma factors for determining development length of reinforcement for strength design.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5649 21 2109.1.1 T Stafford This proposal reinstates the limit on using empirical design of masonry to areas where the Vult wind speed
equals or exceeds 115 mph.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Macomber

Vult and other areas indicated through comments should be underlined. Proponent to correct.

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 20 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5620 21 2114 T Stafford Reinstates requirements that gable endwalls be structurally continuous between points of lateral support.

This language currently exists in the 2010 FBCB.

Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5982 21 2122.1 Joseph Belcher  Upate section of standard cited.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Macomber

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5981 21 2122.2.1 Joseph Belcher  Clarification of intent of section.
Comment [ Jas []AM  EINAR [ w I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Gascon
NAR - Needs editorial changes/corrections.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5993 21 2122.2.3 Joseph Belcher  Updates Section citation.
Comment K Jas  []Am  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5983 21 2122.4 Joseph Belcher  Modifies reinforcement details.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 21 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5990 21 21225 Joseph Belcher  Modifies provisions related to concentrated loads.

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Gascon

Mod # Chapter

Section

5991

2122.8.2

Proponent

Summary

Joseph Belcher

Clarification and update of cited section number.

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter

Section

5992 2

2122.8.8

Proponent

Summary

Joseph Belcher

Clarification and and adoption of TMS 602/ ACI 530.1/ ASCE 6 Section 3.5.

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Aawv

[Cnar [Jw

I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Parrino

22-Steel
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4947 22 2201.1 Michael Goolsby  Section Formatting

Comment DAS

K] am

[CInar w

I

Motion to approve as amended — with A4 Glenn, 2™ Carroll Vote 10Y-ON

TAC Vote:

Second:

Glenn

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 22 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5319 22 2201.1 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, clarifies the relationship between the HVYHZ

provisions and the model base code.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| |:|NAR EW |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Based on written documentation to be withdrawn by a representative of the proponent.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4948 22 2204.1 Michael Goolsby  Section Formatting

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4944 22 2210 Thomas Sputo Add Standard for composite steel deck slabs to Section 2210

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Kim

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5621 22 2212 T Stafford Reinstates requirements that gable endwalls be structurally continuous between points of lateral support.
This language currently exists in the 2010 FBCB.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

4993 22 2214.3.3 Thomas Sputo Delete reference to ASCE 3, an outdated standard for composite deck that was removed from the 2012
IBC, and which, as explained in Proposal 4944, will be replaced in the 2015 IBC by ANSI/SDI C-2011.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| ENAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Glenn

NAR — to correlate with the Miami-Dade and other interested parties and Mod 4927.

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

: Page 23 of 53
1 4 Structural 9/28/2012

- Tracking Chart - All Mods

! - 2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5327 22 2214 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, builds on the changes already recommended in

the FL Supplement. It coordinates Section 2214 with the base model code.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| ENAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Glenn

NAR — correlation for consistency.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5366 22 2215 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, updates Section 2215.

Comment [ Jas []Am  [ECINAR [ w I TAC Vote: Second:
Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley 5366-5471 by Glenn 2" Kim Vote 10Y-ON

Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON

Motion to NAR by proponent 2™ by Carroll 0Y-10N to allow for coordination.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5369 22 2217 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, corrects a section reference based upon changes
recommended in a proposal for Section 2214.

Comment [ Jas []AM  EINAR [ w I TAC Vote: Second:
Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley 5366-5471 by Glenn 2" Kim Vote 10Y-ON

Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON

Motion to NAR by proponent 2" by Carroll 0Y-10N to allow for coordination.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5379 22 2221.1 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, corrects a section reference based upon changes
recommended in a proposal for Section 2214.

Comment [ Jas []AM  EINAR [ w I TAC Vote: Second:
Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley 5366-5471 by Glenn 2" Kim Vote 10Y-ON

Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON

Motion to NAR by proponent 2™ by Carroll 0Y-10N to allow for coordination

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5470 22 2221.6.2 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, corrects the requirements on end support and
anchorage of steel joists.

Comment [ Jas []AM  [EINAR [ w | TAC Vote: Second: Parrino
Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2™ Kim Vote 10Y-ON
Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON
Motion to approve Al as replacement for original mod Parrino 2" Carroll  Vote 0Y-9N
NAR — editorial corrections in preference for A1
TAC Recommendations Key
| AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

: Page 24 of 53
1 4 Structural 9/28/2012

- Tracking Chart - All Mods

! - 2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5383 22 2221.6.3 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, corrects a section reference based upon changes

recommended in an alternate proposal for Section 2214.

Comment [ Jas []Am  [ECINAR [ w |:_|| TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Carroll
Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2™ Kim Vote 10Y-ON

Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON

NAR as requested by the proponent and for correlation

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5461 22 2222.1 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, corrects a section reference based upon changes
recommended in an proposal for Section 2214.

Comment [ Jas []Am  [ECINAR [ w |:_|| TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Carroll
Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2™ Kim Vote 10Y-ON

Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON

NAR as requested by the proponent and for correlation

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5462 22 2222.2 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, recommends deletion of Section 2222.2.

Comment [ Jas []AM  EINAR [ w |:_|| TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Carroll
Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2™ Kim Vote 10Y-ON

Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON

NAR as requested by the proponent and for correlation

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5644 22 2222.4.4 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, coordinates with the Chapter 16 changes
recommended in Mod. 5643 by removing a redundant requirement in Chapter 22.

Comment [ Jas  []AM [INAR KW |:_|| TAC Vote: Second:
Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2™ Kim Vote 10Y-ON
Withdrawn by proponent.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5464 22 2222.4 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, corrects a reference based upon changes
recommended in a proposal for Section 2214.

Comment [ Jas []AM  [EINAR [ w |:_|| TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Carroll
Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2™ Kim Vote 10Y-ON

Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON

NAR as requested by the proponent and for correlation

TAC Recommendations Key
| AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

w2 4

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 25 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5466 22 2222.6.1 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, corrects a reference section based upon changes
recommended in a proposal for Section 2214.
Comment [ Jas []Am  [ECINAR [ w |:_|| TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Carroll

Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2™ Kim Vote 10Y-ON
Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON
NAR as requested by the proponent and for correlation

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5469 22 2222.7 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, deletes a section reference based upon changes
recommended in an proposal for Section 2214.
Comment AS AM  KCNAR []w |:_|| TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Carroll

Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2™ Kim Vote 10Y-ON
Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON
NAR as requested by the proponent and for correlation

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5471 22 2223.2 Bonnie Manley This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, corrects a section reference based upon changes
recommended in an proposal for Section 2214.
Comment []As AM  KCNAR []w |:_|| TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Carroll

Motion to table all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2™ Kim Vote 10Y-ON
Motion to untable all mods proposed by Bonnie Manley by Glenn 2" Macomber 10Y-ON
NAR as requested by the proponent and for correlation

23-Wood
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4945 23 2301.1 Michael Goolsby  Section Formatting

Comment [K_]As [Cnar [Jw I

[] awv

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Gascon

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 26 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5622 23 2304.3.4 T Stafford Reinstates requirements that gable endwalls be structurally continuous between points of lateral support.

This language currently exists in the 2010 FBCB.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5671 23 2304.7.2.1 T Stafford Requires the use of ring shank nails for roof decking attachment. This language will achieve consistency
between the FBCB and FBCR. The FBCR has required the roof decking to be attached with ring shank
nails since the-2006-Supplement-to-the 2004 -code:

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| ENAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 5Y-5Y Second: Carroll

NAR — weakens the code and discriminatory against design.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5650 23 2308.2 T Stafford This proposal reinstates the limit on using conventional wood frame construction to areas where the Vult
wind speed equals or exceeds 115 mph.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 8Y-ON Second: Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4946 23 2325.1 Michael Goolsby  Section Formatting

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 9Y-ON Second: Lavrich

24-Glass and Glazina

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 27 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5025 24 2401.1 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 9Y-ON

I

Second:

Lavrich

Mod # Chapter

Section

5764 %4

2403.1

Proponent

Summary

Jim Heise

Section 2403.1 Identification is revised to read as follows:

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 9Y-ON

I

Second:

Glenn

Mod # Chapter

Section

5026  #

2404.1

Proponent

Summary

Michael Goolsby

Section Formatting

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Aawv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 9Y-ON

I

Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5636 24 2404.2, 24055,  Dwight Wilkes Reason: The overall intent of this proposal is to clarify the requirements for tubular daylighting devices,
2405.5.1, within the context of skylights and sloped glazing.
240552

[] Awv

Enar [Jw

TAC Vote: 0Y-ON

I

NAR — consistency with previous action and justify Florida specific need.

Second:

Glenn

Mod # Chapter

5027 %

Section formatting

Section Proponent Summary
2404.3.1 and Michael Goolsby
2404.3.3

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 9Y-ON

I

Second:

Gascon

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Page 28 of 53
9/28/2012

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
3. [ ection formatting
5028 24 2404.3.5 Michael Goolsby s f

[Cnar [Jw

Comment EAS

[] Awv

TAC Vote: 9Y-ON Second: Gascon

I

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5584 24 2404 Dwight Wilkes This proposal is to coordinate the glass design load equations of Chapter 24 with those of Chapter 16, to
the change of design wind load model from Allowable Stress Design to Strength Design in ASCE 7-10.
These revisions-were not carried-back to the glass-design-load-equations-of Chapter24:
Comment []As AM  KCNAR []w I TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Carroll

NAR — for proponent to make corrections.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary Pending Review

24 2404 T Stafford

5647

Correlation with ASCE 7-10. Clarifies the appropriate reduction of design pressures for protocols that are
and have been historically tested using allowable or nominal wind loads.

[Jav  KnarR [Jw

NAR — correlation and to correct strike thru.

Comment DAS

TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Glenn

I

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary Pending Review

Michael Goolsby

24 2407.1.4.2

5029

Section formatting

[Cnar [Jw

Comment EAS

[] Awv

TAC Vote: 9Y-ON Second: Carroll

I

25-Gvpsum Board Plaster

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 29 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
Michael Goolsb i i
4940 25 2501.1.1 Yy Deletion of HVHZ sections
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4939 25 2516, 2516 and ~ Michael Goolsby  Deletion of HVHZ sections necessary to utilize base code provisions.
2517
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5648 25 Table 2508.5 T Stafford Clarifies that the shear values for gypsum board diaphragms are allowable (ASD) values.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn
26-Plastic
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5221 26 2603 Suzanne Davis Removal of figure 2603.8. To be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement the Commission
plan to update the 2013 Code
comment K ]as []avm [INarR [Jw C TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino

39-Special Construction

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Page 30 of 53
9/28/2012

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5932 39 3105 Joseph Belcher  Retains provisions for awnings and canopies.

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

Second: Glenn

I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Pending Review

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary
39 3114 Airport Suzanne Davis
5226 Noise

To be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement the Commission plan to update the 2013 Code

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

Second: Glenn

I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

35-Referenced Standards

Mod # Chapter Section

5830 35 AAF

Proponent

Summary Pending Review

Joseph Belcher

Retains information for adopted AAF Guide.

Comment EAS

[] awv

[Cnar [Jw

Second: Lavrich

I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Mod # Chapter Section

35 ANSI

6023

Proponent

Summary Pending Review

Randall
Shackelford

Fixes an error in the 2012 IBC by correcting the ASTM Standard for testing of joist hangers and connectors
and allowing the option of using the newest standard for testing

Comment DAS

[] awv

K nar [Jw

NAR — to correlate with companion changes.

TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Carroll

I

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 31 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
6021 35 ASTM Joseph Belcher  Updates standards.

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

|:|I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section

5893 ¥

Chapter 35

Proponent

Summary

Joseph Belcher

Updates AAMA/NPEA/NSA 2100—11

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

|:|I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section

5674

Standards

Proponent

Summary

Dwight Wilkes

As the Base Code [2012 IBC] only recognizes two [2] AAMA standards and the Florida 2010 Code has
eleven [11] standards with multiple editions, this modification is bring into the 2013 Florida Building Code

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] Aawv

Enar [Jw

+h H 4. Aarde-in-Elarid A+, +datar A3 [ + ot Aard
tneexisung-stanuaaras-iriorda—ana to remove outdatea ana-mmcradae curreritsiandaras.

|:|I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second:

NAR — for proponent to clarify mod as TAC comments have suggested.

Glenn

SubCode: Existing Building
2-Definitions

Mod # Chapter Section

202

5142 2

Proponent

Summary

Ken Cureton

Modify SECTION 202 (Structural TAC)

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] Awv

Withdrawn by proponent.

[CInar KW

TAC Vote: Second:

I

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 32 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5854 2 202 Jim Heise give clear definition of &quot;sunroom&quot;

[Jav  [nar [Jw

Correct item 2 - “of” to “or” fixed glass

Comment EAS

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

T Stafford

5889 2 202

New definitions for correlation with proposed new Chapter 17.

Pending Review

Comment |:|As DNAR |:|W

[] Awv

TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

I

NAR — for staff to provide comments on needed language required by law that was withdrawn in a previous mod.

Second:

Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

brings forward the definition of sunroom

Pending Review

[Jav  [nar [Jw

This mod supersedes the action on mod 5854.

Comment EAS

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Glenn

4-Prescriptive Compliance Method

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

Michael Goolsby

4962 4 [B]402.4

Section formatting

Pending Review

Comment EAS DNAR DW

[] awv

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Carroll

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Page 33 of 53
9/28/2012

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods

2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review
Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

TAC: Structural

Total Mods for this TAC: 236

Section

Mod # Chapter

4963 ¢4

[B]403.4

Proponent Summary
Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

With correction from IBC.

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

[Cnar [Jw I

Mod # Chapter Section

4965 4

[B]404.2.1

Proponent Summary
Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

With correction from IBC.

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

[Cnar [Jw I

5-Classification of Work

Mod # Chapter Section

5890 5 510

Proponent
T Stafford

Summary
Charging language is added to provided direction to Chapter 17 for retrofits.

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] awv

NAR — needs corrections to sitations.

EInar [Jw C TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Lavrich

6-Repairs
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5757 6 606.4 Joseph Hetzel Continues requirements for garage door, exterior door, skylight, and operable and inoperable window

replacement.

Comment DAS

[] Aawv

|:|NAR EW |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

7-Alterations - Level 1

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 34 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4966 7 [B]706.3.2 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W

I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

Ken Cureton

5147 7 706

Add SECTIONS 706.1.1, 706.4 and 706.5

Pending Review

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W

I

TAC Vote: 9Y-1IN

Second:

Strawn

10-Chanae of Occupancyv

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

Ken Cureton

5 87 5 10 1007

Modify SECTION 1007.1

Pending Review

Comment [K_]As [Jav  [nar [Jw

I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

Ken Cureton

5 87 8 10 1007

Modify SECTION 1007.2

Pending Review

Comment [__]As [Jav K nar [Jw

I

NAR - Needs to correct citation reference from 1616.2 to 1620.1...see comments.

TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

Second:

Kim

11-Additions

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 35 of 53

EL:'?”ES:"H. 4 _StrUCtU ral 9/28/2012
FOIEASINIA Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review
Buiding Codos and Standardy
TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5869 11 1103 Ken Cureton Modify Section 1103.2

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| DNAR |:|W |:||

NAR —reference to definition in Ch 2 needs to be correlated.

TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

Second:

Glenn

16-Referenced Standards

Pending Review

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary
5888 16 New Chapter 17 T Stafford Relocates the retrofit provisions in the appendix of the IEBC to new Chapter 17 for consistency with the
2010 FBCEB. This proposal also includes updates to the version in the appendix of the IEBC.
comment K ]as []am [INaR [Jw C TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

Glenn

SubCode: Mechanical

3-General Reaulations

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary

5222 3 301.15 Ann Stanton Repropose Florida-specific wind resistance equipment criteria.

Pending Review

comment [_Jas  []Aam  [KINAR [ w C

NAR — this is already addressed in the base code and not Florida specific.

TAC Vote: 7Y-3N

Second:

Glenn

SubCode: Residential

2-Definitions

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 36 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5678 2 202 T Stafford This proposal part of a serires of proposals that reinstate the ultimate wind speed maps in the FBCR. This

language is currently contained in the 2010 FBCR. No new requirements are being proposed.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Motion to table until after mod 5681 Lavrich 2™ Carroll Vote 10Y-ON
Motion to untable Carroll 2™ Lavrich Vote 10Y-ON
2" to approve as submitted Strawn Vote 10Y-ON

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5793 2 202 Joseph Belcher  Retains FBC definition of sunroom.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

3-Buildina Plannina

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5822 3 308.1 Jim Heise Identification to maintain that laminated glass, when used for other than safety glazing, be permanantly
identified

Comment K_]AS [Jav  [nar [Jw I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Strawn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5651 3 R301.1.1 Dwight Wilkes To recognize the standard for aluminum design as an alternative provision and provide the current edition
AAMA 2100-10 . American Architectural Manufacturers Association (AAMA) National Patio Enclosure

INDEA)-Q N INSAY-21-00 Q

Association (NPEA) &amp; National- Sunroom-Association (NSA) 2100 = Specification for Sunrooms:

comment [_]AS [Jav K nar [Jw I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Lavrich

NAR — based on proponents requests to include additional language.

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 37 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5790 3 R301.2.1.1.1 Joseph Belcher  Brings forward language adopting AAF Guide to Aluminum Construciton in High Wind Areas; Adds

language pemitting design per FBCB.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Kim

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5791 3 R301.2.1.1.2 Joseph Belcher Carries forward adoption of AAMA 2100; Carries forward and updates sunroom categories.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 9Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5998 3 R301.2.1.1 Joseph Belcher  Retains MAF Guide to Concrete Masonry Residential Construction in High Wind Areas; Retains reference
to prescriptive provisions of Chapter 6 for concrete masonry construction; Adds TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE 5

A-TAMS-AOMACHERAO-1HACE-A ~ H +1
dllu 1T VIS OUZ/ACT OoU. LITASCLE O a5 UesIigiopuort.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 9Y-ON Second: Parrino

Note comments to include Florida Building Code, “Building”.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5721 3 R301.2.1.2.1 Joseph Belcher  Modifies ASTM E 1996 Wind Zone definitions to correlate with wind speeds of ASCE 7-10 and FBCR.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| ENAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 0Y-9N Second: Glenn

NAR — for the purpose of negative roll call at proponents request which has no table.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5663 3 R301.2.1.2 Dwight Wilkes To recognize the standard editions for AAMA 506-06 or 08 or 11 Voluntary Specifications for Impact and
Cycle Testing of Fenestration Products.

Comment EAS |:| AM |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 9Y-1IN Second: Strawn

Figure # to be corrected. As submitted references a figure that does not exist. Should reference R301.2.(4)c.

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

F Page 38 of 53
1 4 Structural 9/28/2012

- ' Tracking Chart - All Mods

= . 2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5718 3 R301.2.1.2 Joseph Belcher Modifies opening protection to bring forward currently permitted standards.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

The action on this mod supersedes the action on previous mod 5663

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5694 3 R301.2.1.4 T Stafford The proposal reinstates the surface roughness and exposure category definitions from the 2010 FBCR.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Strawn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5700 3 R301.2.1.6 T Stafford Correlation with ASCE 7-10.

Comment [K_]As AM [ NAR []w I TAC Vote: Second:
Motion to table Parrino 2™ Strawn Vote 10Y-ON

Motion to untable Lavrich 2" Parrino Vote 10Y-ON

2" to approve as submitted Macomber Vote 10Y-ON

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5328 3 R301.2.1 Joseph Hetzel Inclusion of a garage door wind load Table.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| ENAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Glenn

NAR — proponent requests NAR based on action taken on 5321.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5681 3 R301.2.1 T Stafford This proposal part of a serires of proposals that reinstate the ultimate wind speed maps in the FBCR. This
language is currently contained in the 2010 FBCR. No new requirements are being proposed.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 39 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5743 3 R301.9 Joseph Belcher  Reloctes existing wall covering and soffit design criteria from R617.4 to R301.9; adds reference to

C&amp;C load tables.

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Glenn

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent

Summary

5745 3

R301.9 Joseph Belcher

Reloctes existing wall covering and soffit design criteria from R617.4 to R301.9; adds reference to
C&amp;C load tables.

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] Awv

[CInar K w

Withdrawn by proponent.

TAC Vote:

I

Second:

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent

Summary

5416 3

R318.7 Jack Glenn

Reformat the Termite Inspection requirements by moving section R704 to a new Section R381.7

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Aawv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Carroll

Chapter

5432 3

Modify SECTION R301.2.1.2

Section Proponent Summary
SECTION Ken Cureton
R301 - DESIGN

CRITERIA

Pending Review

[] Awv

CURITERIA

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Kim

Mod # Chapter

5430 3

Modify SECTION R301

Section Proponent Summary
SECTION Ken Cureton
R301-DESIGN

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

CRITERIA
CURITERIA

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Glenn

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 40 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5441 3 SECTION R324  Ken Cureton Add SECTION R324
— AIRPORT

NOICE

NUOUTSE

[] Awv

Comment EAS

[Cnar [Jw

|:|I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

Kim

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

Table R301.2(2) T Stafford

5702 3

Correlation with ASCE 7-10. Reinstates the component and cladding load table from the 2010 FBCR.

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[Jav  [nar [Jw

Hand written notes to be added by proponent.

|:|I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

Strawn

4-Foundations

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

R401.1 Michael Goolsby

5626 ¢

Section formatting

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] awv

Withdrawn by proponent.

[CInar K w

|:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

4 R401.2 T Stafford

5780

This proposal reinstates the foundation requirements from the 2010 FBCR.

Pending Review

Comment [K_]As [Jav  [nar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second:

I

Glenn

5-Floors

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 41 of 53

EL:'?”ES:"H. ! 1 g _Stru ctural 9/28/2012
FOIEASINIA . ' Tracking Chart - All Mods
= . 2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review
Buiding Codos and Standardy
TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5627 5 R501.1 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| |:|NAR EW |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5984 5 R502 T Stafford Deletes the prescriptive wood framing construction provisions that do not apply to high wind areas.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|w |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
6000 5 R505 T Stafford Deletes the prescriptive steel framing construction provisions that do not apply to high wind areas.

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|w |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

6-Wall Construction
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

Jim Heise i
5950 6 606.16 Masonry opening tolerances

Comment K_]AS [Jav  [nar [Jw I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 42 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5960 6 612.12.2 Jim Heise maximum sealant joints for Masonry Rough Openings
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
Jim Heise i iopi
5956 6 612.12 Flashing, sealants and weatherstripping
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Macomber
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
Jim Heise i i i
5769 6 612.1 Exterior window and door flashing
Comment [ Jas []AM  EINAR [ w I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Glenn
NAR — at the request of proponent to correct language.
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
Jim Heise iteri i
5953 6 612.2 performance criteria for windows and doors
Comment [ Jas []AM  EINAR [ w I TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Strawn
NAR - Proponent to correct word “designed” to “design”.
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4972 6 R601.1 Michael Goolsby  Reinstate a code section erroneously removed
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Structural
Tracking Chart - All Mods

Page 43 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5986 6 R602 T Stafford Deletes the prescriptive wood framing construction provisions for wall framing that do not apply to high
wind areas.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
6001 6 R603 T Stafford Deletes the prescriptive steel framing construction provisions that do not apply to high wind areas.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
6017 6 R606; R614 Joseph Belcher  Adds prescriptive provisions suitable for Florida&#39;s wind loads as contained in previous editions of the
FBCR for concrete masonry construction.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
T Stafford i i :
5701 6 R612.2 affor Correlation with ASCE 7-10.
Comment K Jas  []Am  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: Second: 10Y-ON
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5329 6 R612.3, R202 Joseph Hetzel Inclusion of garage door labeling requirements.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural

Total Mods for this TAC: 236

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 44 of 53
9/28/2012

Section Proponent Summary

Mod # Chapter

5670 °

R612.3.1 Dwight Wilkes

+ it Q179

To reinstate the exterior windows and doors structural performance, testing, standards, label requirements
and comparative analysis with Proposed changes to the 2012 IRC as submitted under S173-12 and Public

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] Awv

Fay
comimentiosiI7rz:

Enar [Jw I

NAR - at the request of proponent — duplicative.

TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

Second:

Glenn

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent Summary

5334 °

R612.4 Joseph Hetzel

Inclusion of garage door test requirements.

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Strawn

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent Summary

5657 °©

R612.6 Janet Gerard

Provides clarification of the term product approval

Pending Review

Comment DAS

[] Aawv

Enar [Jw I

NAR — at the request of the proponent. Duplication

TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

Second:

Strawn

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent Summary

5722 °

R612.8.4.1 Joseph Belcher

Retains provisions for interchangeability of door components and adopted ANSI Standard for side-hinged
exterior steel doors.

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Glenn

Mod # Chapter

Section Proponent Summary

5723 °

R614 Joseph Belcher

Adds labeling and installation provisions for impact-resistant coverings.

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw I

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Glenn

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 45 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236

7-Wall Coverina

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5709 7 703.3.3,703.3.4 T Stafford This proposal references the WFCM for attachement of wood, hardboard, and wood structural panel
siding.

Comment K_]AS [Jav  [Inar [Jw I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review

5750 7 703.8 Jim Heise This mod adds the standards from R612.12.1 that are referenced in the 2010 FBC. This is also to maintain
the FMA/AAMA 100, FMA/JAAMA 200, FMA/WDMA 250 in the 2013 FBC as previously in the 2010 FBC

comment [ Jas K ]am [INnarR [Jw C TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn
Motion to accept as amended with G2 comments Macomber standing on proponents rationale. Parrino  Vote 10Y-ON

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5629 7 R701.1 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

comment [_]As [Jav  [Inar K Jw I TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5704 7 R703.1.3 T Stafford Clarifies the applicable loads on soffits.

comment [K_]As [Jav  [nar [Jw I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

TAC Recommendations Key
AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 46 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5047 7 R703.11.2 T Stafford Clarifies the application limits of vinyl siding over foam plastic sheathing.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Macomber

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5705 7 R703.4 T Stafford Clarifies the limits of the prescriptive fastening table for wall coverings.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5710 7 R703.5.3 T Stafford This proposal establishes limits for prescriptive attachmend of wood shakes and shingles wall coverings.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5711 7 R703.7 T Stafford This proposal establishes limits for prescriptive attachmend of masonry veneers.
Comment K Jas  []Am  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5706 7 Table R703.4 T Stafford Modifies the prescriptive fastening table for wall coverings to be consistent with the 2010 FBCR.

Removes table entries that permit the use of staples.

Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 47 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
8-Roof-Ceilina Construction
Mod # Chapter Proponent Summary Pending Review
5630 8 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Comment DAS

Withdrawn by proponent.

[CInar K w

I TAC Vote:

Second:

Mod # Chapter Proponent Summary Pending Review
5673 8 T Stafford Requires the use of ring shank nails for roof decking attachment. This language is currently contained in
the 2010 FBCR. No new requirements are being proposed.
Comment K_]AS COnar [Jw C TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Lavrich
Mod # Chapter Proponent Summary Pending Review
59089 8 T Stafford Deletes the prescriptive wood framing construction provisions for roof framing that do not apply to high
wind areas.
Comment K_]AS COnar [Jw C TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn
Mod # Chapter Proponent Summary Pending Review
6003 8 T Stafford Deletes the prescriptive steel framing construction provisions that do not apply to high wind areas.

[Cnar [Jw

I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

Second:

Macomber

21-Hvdronic Pipina

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 48 of 53

EL:'?”ES:"H. ! 1 g _Stru ctural 9/28/2012
FOIEASINIA . ' Tracking Chart - All Mods
= . 2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review
Bhafing Dot o Sranctarsy
TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
4979 21 2101.6 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| DNAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

NAR — requested by proponent based on previous action of the TAC.

Second:

Lavrich

26-General Plumbina Reauirements

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary
4984 26 2603.2 Michael Goolsby  Section formatting

Pending Review

comment [_Jas  []Am  [KINArR [ w C TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

NAR — requested by proponent based on previous action of the TAC

Second:

Lavrich

44-HVHZ
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5850 44 4403.11.2 Joseph Belcher  Modifies sunroom categories to adopt those of AAMA 2100-11

Comment []as K] AM NAR [w I TAC Vote:
Motion to approve the A2 by Lavrich 2™ Carroll Vote —

Withdrawn

2" Glenn - Motion to approve the mod with the A2 comment  Vote 10Y-ON

Second:

Lavrich

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary
5010 44 4403 Michael Goolsby  Eliminating unnecessary duplication of Chapter 44 HVHZ provisions

Pending Review

Comment [ Jas K ]AM  [INAR [ w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON
Glenn motion to correct spelling of “Florida”. 2™ Gascon Vote 10Y-ON

Second:

Kim

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

w2 4

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 49 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5011 44 4404 Michael Goolsby  Eliminating unnecessary duplication of Chapter 44 HVHZ provisions

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W

I

TAC Vote:

10Y-ON

Second:

Carroll

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

4405 Michael Goolsby

5012 #

Eliminating unnecessary duplication of Chapter 44 HVHZ provisions

Pending Review

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W

I

TAC Vote:

10Y-ON

Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

4406 Michael Goolsby

5013 “

Eliminating unnecessary duplication of Chapter 44 HVHZ provisions

Pending Review

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W

I

TAC Vote:

10Y-ON

Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

4407 Michael Goolsby

5014 4

Eliminating unnecessary duplication of Chapter 44 HVHZ provisions

Pending Review

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W

I

TAC Vote:

10Y-ON

Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent

Summary

44 4408 Michael Goolsby

5015

Eliminating unnecessary duplication of Chapter 44 HVHZ provisions

Pending Review

Comment EAS |:|A|v| |:|NAR |:|W

I

TAC Vote:

10Y-ON

Second:

Parrino

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 50 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5016 44 4409 Michael Goolsby  Eliminating unnecessary duplication of Chapter 44 HVHZ provisions

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter

Section

5017

4410

Proponent

Summary

Michael Goolsby

Eliminating unnecessary duplication of Chapter 44 HVHZ provisions

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Awv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter

Section

5018 “

4411

Proponent

Summary

Michael Goolsby

Eliminating unnecessary duplication of Chapter 44 HVHZ provisions

Pending Review

Comment EAS

[] Aawv

[Cnar [Jw

TAC Vote: 10Y-ON

I

Second:

Parrino

Mod # Chapter

Section

5617

R4408

Proponent

Summary

Bonnie Manley

This proposal, submitted on behalf of the steel industry, recommends the deletion of Section R4408 in

favor of a direct reference to the HVHZ provisions in FBC Chapter 22.

Pending Review

Comment DAS

NAR — duplicative.

[] Awv

Enar [Jw

TAC Vote: 0Y-10N

I

Second:

Kim

45-Referenced Standards

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Page 51 of 53
9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
Joseph Belcher
6019 45 ASTM p Updates standards.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
6018 45 Chapte 45 Joseph Belcher Retains the prescriptive guide for small one story residential structures published by the Masonry
Association of Florida.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Parrino
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5840 45 Chapter 44 AAF  Joseph Belcher  Retains information for adoption of AAF Guide.
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Carroll
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5895 45 Chapter 45 Joseph Belcher  Updates AAMA/NPEA/NSA 2100—11
Comment K Jas  []Am  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Kim
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5891 45 FMA Janet Gerard Adds standard practiced for installation flashing and sealing of windows and doors installed in wood frame
and masonry construction where extreme wind/water conditions exist
Comment K Jas  []AM  [NAR [w I TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Strawn

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Page 52 of 53

Structural 9/28/2012

Tracking Chart - All Mods
2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review

Business .
Professional

Evalifing Codos aedd Smandandy

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5659 45 Standards Dwight Wilkes To recognize the standard for aluminum design as an alternative provision and provide the current edition

AAMA 2100-10 . American Architectural Manufacturers Association (AAMA) National Patio Enclosure

A HH INIDEAY-Q Nati L A o INSAY-21-00 Q PR £ Q
ASSOCIAUONT{INFEA) &almp, Natornalr surroornTrASSOCIalorn (INSA) 210U ="SpeCicauor1or sunroorrs.

Comment |:|As |:|A|v| ENAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 0Y-10N Second: Lavrich

NAR — requested by proponent to correct and correlate with previous mod.

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Pending Review
5664 45 Standards Dwight Wilkes To recognize the standard editions for AAMA 506-06 or 08 or 11 Voluntary Specifications for Impact and
Cycle Testing of Fenestration Products.

Comment |:|As EAM |:|NAR |:|W |:|| TAC Vote: 10Y-ON Second: Glenn

2" to approve Al instead of original mod. Glenn

SubCode: Building
16-Structural Desian

Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Withdrawn
5122 16 1609.1.2 Suzanne Davis Revised to add items 3 and 4 and to be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement the
Protection of Commission plan to update the 2013 Code
Openings

Comment |:|As AM |:|NAR EW |:|| TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent

19-Concrete
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Withdrawn
5216 19 1913 Suzanne Davis Sections 1913.3.1 and 1913.3.2. To be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement the
Commission plan to update the 2013 Code

comment [_]As [Jav  [Inar K Jw I TAC Vote: Second:

Withdrawn by proponent.

21-Masonryv

TAC Recommendations Key
| AS = Approved as Submitted AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




Business,
Professional

Structural

Tracking Chart - All Mods

2013 Florida Building Code - TAC review
Ehalafirg Cos e Srandargy

Page 53 of 53

9/28/2012

TAC: Structural Total Mods for this TAC: 236
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Withdrawn
5217 21 2115 Suzanne Davis Sections 2115.1-2115.1.2 To be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement the Commission
plan to update the 2013 Code
Comment [ Jas  []Am [INAR KW I TAC Vote: Second:
Withdrawn by proponent.
22-Steel
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Withdrawn
5218 22 2212 Suzanne Davis Sections 2212.1 and 2212.2. To be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement the Commission
plan to update the 2013 Code
comment [_Jas  []Aam  [INnarR K ]w I TAC Vote: Second:
Withdrawn by proponent.
23-Wood
Mod # Chapter Section Proponent Summary Withdrawn
5219 23 2304 Suzanne Davis Sections 2304.3.4.1, 2304.3.4.2, 2304.3.4.3. To be consistent with the Florida Statutes and to implement
the Commission plan to update the 2013 Code
Comment [ Jas  []Am [INAR KW I TAC Vote: Second:
Withdrawn by proponent.
Search Criteria
Modification #: ALL Code Version: 2013
Code Change Cycle: ALL Sub Code: ALL
Chapter & Topic: ALL Section: ALL
Date Submitted From: ALL Date Submitted To: ALL
TAC: S TAC Recommendation: ALL
Commission Action: ALL Proponent Last Name: ALL
Proponent First Name: ALL Text of Modification: ALL
Related Modifications: ALL Affects HVHZ: ALL

TAC Recommendations Key

AS = Approved as Submitted

AM = Approved as Modified NAR = No Affirmative Recommendation

W = Withdrawn | = Insufficient (incomplete or does not meet criteria)




