Supplement to the 2007 Florida Building Code, 2008

Existing Building

Preface

Preface, add text to read as follows:

Letter Designations in Front of Section Numbers

In each code development cycle, proposed changes to the code are considered at the Code Development Hearings by the ICC Fire Code Development Committee, whose action constitutes a recommendation to the voting membership for final action on the proposed change. Proposed changes to a code section that has a number beginning with a letter in brackets are considered by a different code development committee. For example, proposed changes to code sections that have [F] in front of them (e.g. [F] 903.1.1.1) are considered by the ICC Fire Code Development Committee at the code development hearings.

The content of sections in this code that begin with a letter designation are maintained by another code development committee in accordance with the following:

[E] = International Energy Conservation Code Development Committee;

[EB] = International Existing Building Code Development Committee;

[EL] = ICC Electrical Code Development Committee;

[F] = International Fire Code Development Committee;

[FG] = International Fuel Gas Code Development Committee;

[M] = International Mechanical Code Development Committee; and

[P] = International Plumbing Code Development Committee.
[Mod 2862]

Chapter 2 Definitions

Section 202, add text to read as follows:

RETROFIT.  The voluntary process of strengthening or improving  buildings or structures, or individual components of buildings or structures for the purpose of making existing conditions better serve the purpose for which they were originally intended or the purpose that current building codes intend.

[Mod 3147]

Add text to read as follows:

Site built single- family residential structures.  This term shall mean site built single family detached residential structures.
[Mod 3050 rev and Mod 3118]

Revise text to read as follows:

SUBSTANTIAL STRUCTURAL DAMAGE. A condition where:

1. In any story, the elements of the lateral-force-resisting system, in any direction and taken as a whole, have suffered damage such that the lateral load-carrying capacity of the structure in any horizontal direction has been reduced by more than 20 percent from its pre-damaged condition, or

2. The capacity of any vertical load-carrying components , or any group of such components, that supports supporting more than 30 percent of the total area of the structure’s floor(s) and roof(s) has been reduced more than 20 percent from its predamaged condition and the remaining capacity of such affected elements, with respect to all dead and live loads, is less than or roof area have suffered a reduction in vertical load-carrying capacity to below 75 percent of that required by the Florida Building Code, Building for new buildings of similar structure, purpose and location.   required strength levels calculated by either the strength or allowable stress method
[Mod 2892]

Chapter 3 Prescriptive Compliance Method

Section 308 is revised to read as follows:

[B] SECTION 308 ACCESSIBILITY FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS

RESERVED  See Chapter 11 of the Florida Building Code, Buildings.
[Staff after]

Section 309 is added to read as follows:

Section 309 Energy Conservation.  See Chapter 13 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

[Staff after]

Chapter 4 Classification of Work
Section 410 Retrofitting, add text to read as follows:

SECTON 410 RETROFITTING
410.1 Scope.  Retrofitting of buildings, as defined in Chapter 2, includes work of a voluntary nature for the purposes of improving the ability of the building or building elements or building components to better serve the purpose for which they were originally intended or the purpose that current building codes intend.  Retrofit work shall not include repair work as defined in Chapter 2 and described in Section 402.1

410.2 Application.  Retrofitting of existing buildings shall comply with the provisions of Chapter 16.

[Mod 3147]

Chapter 5 Repairs
Section 501.1 Scope, revise text to read as follows:

501.1 Scope. Repairs as described in Section 302 402 shall comply with the requirements of this chapter. Repairs to historic buildings shall comply with this chapter, except as modified in Chapter 11.
[Mod 3221]

Section 501.4 Flood hazard areas, revise text to read as follows:

501.4 Flood hazard areas.  In flood hazard areas, repairs that constitute substantial improvement shall require that the building comply with Section 1612 of the Florida Building Code, Building.
[Mod 2882]  [See Mod 3223]

Section 507.1 Material revise text to read as follows:

507.1 Material. Existing electrical wiring and equipment undergoing repair shall be allowed to be repaired or replaced with like material in accordance with Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

Exceptions:

1. Existing electrical wiring and equipment undergoing repair shall be permitted to be repaired or replaced with like material.

2. For replacement of nongrounding-type receptacles with grounding-type receptacles and for branch circuits that do not have an equipment grounding conductor in the branch circuitry, the grounding conductor of a grounding-type receptacle outlet shall be permitted to be grounded to any accessible point on the grounding electrode system or to any accessible point on the grounding electrode conductor, in accordance with Article 250.130 (C) of Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

3. Frames of electric ranges, wall-mounted ovens, counter-mounted cooking units, clothes dryers, and outlet or junction boxes that are part of the existing branch circuit for these appliances shall be permitted to be grounded to the grounded circuit conductor in accordance with Article 250.140 of Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

Section 507.1.1 Receptacles revise text to read as follows:

507.1.1 Receptacles. Replacement of electrical receptacles shall comply with the applicable requirements of Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building Section 406.3(D) of NFPA 70.

Section 507.1.2 Plug fuses revise text to read as follows:

507.1.2 Plug fuses. Plug fuses of the Edison-base type shall be used for replacements only where there is no evidence of over fusing or tampering per applicable requirements of Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building Section 240.51(B) of NFPA 70.

Section 507.1.3 Nongrounding-type receptacles revise text to read as follows:

507.1.3 Nongrounding-type receptacles. For replacement of nongrounding-type receptacles with grounding-type receptacles and for branch circuits that do not have an equipment grounding conductor in the branch circuitry, the grounding conductor of a grounding-type receptacle outlet shall be permitted to be grounded to any accessible point on the grounding electrode system or to any accessible point on the grounding electrode conductor in accordance with Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building Section 250.130(C) of NFPA 70.

Section 507.1.4 Group I-2 receptacles revise text to read as follows:

507.1.4 Group I-2 receptacles. Non-“hospital grade” receptacles in patient bed locations of Group I-2 shall be replaced with “hospital grade” receptacles, as required by NFPA 99 and Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building Article 517 of NFPA 70.

507.1.5 Grounding of appliances. Frames of electric ranges, wall-mounted ovens, counter-mounted cooking units, clothes dryers and outlet or junction boxes that are part of the existing branch circuit for these appliances shall be permitted to be grounded to the grounded circuit conductor in accordance with Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building Section 250.140 of NFPA 70.
[Mod 3224 and Mod 2875]

Chapter 6 Alterations - Level 1
Section 606.2.2 Parapet bracing and wall anchors for reroof permits, delete text to read as follows:

606.2.2 Parapet bracing and wall anchors for reroof permits.  Reserved.  Unreinforced masonry bearing wall buildings shall have parapet bracing and wall anchors installed at the roof line whenever a reroofing permit is issued.
[Mod 2890]

Section 611.1 General revise text to read as follows:

611.1 General. Materials and methods of application used for recovering or replacing an existing roof covering shall comply with the requirements of Chapter 15 of the Florida Building Code, Building or Chapter 9 of the Florida Building Code, Residential, as applicable. Roof repairs to existing roofs and roof coverings shall comply with the provisions of this code.
No change to remaining text.

[Mod 3208]

Section 611.7 add text to read as follows:

611.7 When a roof covering on an existing site-built - single family residential structure is removed and replaced, the following procedures shall be permitted to be performed by the roofing contractor:

(a) Roof-decking attachment shall be as required by Section 611.7.1.

(b) A secondary water barrier shall be provided as required by section 611.7.2.  

Exception:  Single family residential structures permitted subject to the Florida Building Code are not required to comply with this section.

611.7.1 Roof decking attachment for site-built single family residential structures.  For site-built single family residential structures the fastening shall be in accordance with section 611.7.1.1 or  611.7.1.2 as appropriate for the existing construction. 8d nails shall be a minimum of 0.141 inch in diameter and shall be a minimum of 2-1/4 inch long to qualify for the provisions of this section for existing nails regardless of head shape or head diameter.

611.7.1.1   Roof decking consisting of sawn lumber or wood planks up to 12” wide and secured with at least two nails (minimum size 8d) to each roof framing member it crosses shall be deemed to be sufficiently connected.  Sawn lumber or wood plank decking secured with smaller fasteners than 8d nails or with fewer than two nails (minimum size 8d) to each framing member it crosses shall be deemed sufficiently connected if fasteners are added such that two clipped head, round head, or ring shank nails (minimum size 8d) are in place on each framing member it crosses.

611.7.1.2  For roof decking consisting of wood structural panels, fasteners and spacing required in columns 3 and 4 of Table 611.7.1.2 are deemed to comply with the requirements of Section 606.3, Florida Building Code, Existing Building for the indicated design wind speed range.  Wood structural panel connections retrofitted with a two part urethane based closed cell adhesive sprayed onto the joint between the sheathing and framing members are deemed to comply with the requirements of Section 606.3, Florida Building Code, Existing Building, provided testing using the manufacturer’s recommended application on panels connected with 6d smooth shank nails at no more than a 6-inch edge and 12-inch field spacing demonstrate an uplift resistance of a minimum of 200 psf.  

Supplemental fasteners as required by Table 611.7.1.2 shall be 8d ring shank nails with round heads and the following minimum dimensions:

1. 0.113-inch nominal shank diameter

2. Ring diameter a minimum of 0.012-inch greater than shank diameter

3. 16 to 20 rings per inch

4. A minimum 0.280-inch full round head diameter

5. Ring shank to extend a minimum of 1 ½” from the tip of the nail.

6. Minimum 2-1/4 inch nail length

Table 611.7.1.2 

Supplement Fasteners at Panel Edges and Intermediate Framing

	Existing fasteners 
	Existing spacing


	Wind speed 110 mph or less supplemental fastener spacing shall be no greater than
	Wind speed greater than 110 mph supplemental fastener spacing shall be no greater than

	Staples or 6d 
	Any
	6” o.c. b
	6” o.c. b

	8d clipped head, round head, smooth or ring shank
	6” o.c. or less
	None necessary
	None necessary

	8d clipped head, round head , smooth or ring shank
	Greater than 

6” o.c.
	6” o.c.a 


	6” o.c. a


a.  Maximum spacing determined based on existing fasteners and supplemental fasteners.

b.  Maximum spacing determined based on supplemental fasteners only.  

611.7.2 Roof secondary water barrier for site-built single family residential structures.  A secondary water barrier shall be installed using one of the following methods when roof covering is removed and replaced: 

     1.  In either HVHZ or Non-HVHZ regions,
a) All joints in structural panel roof sheathing or decking shall be covered with a minimum 4 in. wide strip of self-adhering polymer modified bitumen tape applied directly to the sheathing or decking.  The deck and self adhering polymer modified bitumen tape shall be covered with one of the underlayment systems approved for the particular roof covering to be applied to the roof.  

b) The entire roof deck shall be covered with an approved asphalt impregnated 30# felt underlayment or approved synthetic underlayment installed with nails and tin-tabs in accordance with Sections R4402.7.2, R4402.7.3, or R4402.7.4 of the Florida  Building Code, Residential.  (No additional underlayment shall be required over the top of this sheet).  The synthetic underlayment shall be fastened in accordance with the manufacturer’s recommendations.

2. Outside the High Velocity Hurricane Zone:
a) The entire roof deck shall be covered with an approved self-adhering polymer modified bitumen sheet meeting ASTM D 1970 or an approved self-adhering synthetic underlayment installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions.  No additional underlayment shall be required on top of this sheet for new installations.

b) An underlayment system approved for the particular roof covering shall be applied with the following modification: 

(1) For roof slopes that require one layer of underlayment, a layer of approved asphalt impregnated ASTM D 226 Type I or Type II underlayment or approved synthetic underlayment shall be installed. The felt is to be fastened with 1” round plastic cap or metal cap nails, attached to a nailable deck in a grid pattern of 12 inches (305 mm) staggered between the overlaps, with 6-inch (152 mm) spacing at the overlaps.  The synthetic underlayment shall be fastened in accordance with the manufacturer’s recommendations.

(2) For roof slopes that require two layers of underlayment, an approved asphalt impregnated ASTM D 226 Type I or Type II underlayment shall be installed in a shingle-fashion and lapped 19” and fastened as described above. An approved synthetic underlayment shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instruction. (No additional underlayment shall be required over the top of this sheet).

Exceptions:

1. Roof slopes < 2:12 having a continuous roof system shall be deemed to comply with section 611.7.2 requirements for a secondary water barrier.

2. Clay and Concrete tile roof systems installed as required by the Florida Building Code are deemed to comply with the requirements of section 611.7.2 for Secondary Water Barriers. 

Section 611.8, add text to read as follows:

611.8 When a roof covering on an existing site-built-single-family residential structure is removed and replaced on a building that is located in the wind-borne debris region as defined in the Florida Building Code, Building and that has an insured value of $300,000 or more or, if the building is uninsured or for which documentation of insured value is not presented, has a just valuation for the structure for purposes of ad valorem taxation of $300,000 or more: 

(a)  Roof to wall connections shall be improved as required by Section 611.8.1


(b)  Mandated retrofits of the roof-to-wall connection shall not be required beyond a 15 percent increase in the cost of re-roofing.

Exception: Single family residential structures permitted subject to the Florida Building Code are not required to comply with this section.
(c)  Where complete retrofits of all the roof-to-wall connections as prescribed in Section 611.8.1 would exceed 15 percent of the cost of the re-roofing project, the priorities outlined in Section 611.8.1.7 shall be used to limit the scope of work to the 15 percent limit.  

 [Mod 3050 revised and Mod 3118]  
611.8.1 Roof-to-wall connections for site-built single family residential structures.  Where required by Section 611.8, the intersection of roof framing with the wall below shall provide sufficient resistance to meet the uplift loads specified in Table 611.8.1 either because of existing conditions or through retrofit measures. As an alternative to an engineered design, the prescriptive retrofit solutions provided in Sections 611.8.1.1 through 611.8.1.76 shall be accepted as meeting the mandated roof-to-wall retrofit requirements.  

Exceptions: 
1.  Where it can be demonstrated (by code adoption date documentation and permit issuance date) that roof-to-wall connections and/or roof-to-foundation continuous load path requirements were required at the time of original construction.

2.   Roof- to- wall connections shall not be required unless evaluation and installation of connections at gable ends or all corners can be completed for 15% of the cost of roof replacement.  

611.8.1.1 Access for Retrofitting Roof to Wall Connections.  These provisions are not intended to limit the means for gaining access to the structural elements of the roof and wall for the purposes of retrofitting the connection.  The retrofit of roof to wall connections can be made by access through the area under the eave, from above through the roof, or from the interior of the house.  Methods for above access include removal of roof panels or sections thereof or removal of portions of roof paneling at selected locations large enough for access, viewing, and installing the retrofit connectors and fasteners.  

Where panels or sections are removed, the removed portions shall not be reused.  New paneling shall be used and fastened as in new construction.  

Holes shall be deemed adequately repaired if a patch of paneling is installed with no gap greater than ½ inch between the patch and the existing sheathing and if the patch is supported using one of the following methods.

a) Solid 1-1/2 inch lumber shall fully support the patch and shall be secured to the existing sheathing with #8 by 1-1/4 inch screws spaced a minimum of 3” around the perimeter with screws a minimum of ¾ inch from the near edge of the hole.  The patch shall be secured to the lumber with #8 x 1-1/4 inch screws spaced on a grid no greater than 6 inches by 6 inches with no fewer than 2 screws. 

b) Holes that extend horizontally from roof framing member to adjacent roofing framing member that are less than or equal to 7” wide along the slope of the roof shall be supported by minimum of 2x4 lumber whose face is attached to each roofing framing members using a minimum of 2 each 3-inch long fasteners (#8 screws or 10d common nails) connecting the two.  The patch shall have attached to its bottom running horizontally a minimum 2x4 either flat wise or on edge secured with #8 x 1-1/4 inch screws a maximum of 4 inches on center and no more distant from the end of the added lumber than 3 inches.  The patch shall be secured with two #8 x 1-1/4 inch screws to each support member.  

611.8.1.2 Partially inaccessible straps:  Where part of a strap is inaccessible, if the portion of the strap that is observed is fastened in compliance with these requirements, the inaccessible portion of the strap shall be presumed to comply with these requirements.

611.8.1.3  Prescriptive method for gable roofs on a wood frame wall.    The anchorage of each of the exposed rafters or truss within 6 ft of the corner along the exterior wall on each side of each gable end shall be inspected.  Wherever a strap is missing or an existing strap has fewer than four fasteners on each end, approved straps, ties or right angle brackets with a minimum uplift capacity of 500 lbs shall be installed that connect each rafter or truss to the top plate below.  Adding fasteners to existing straps shall be allowed in lieu of adding a new strap provided the strap is manufactured to accommodate at least 4 fasteners at each end.  Wherever access makes it possible (without damage of the wall or soffit finishes), both top plate members shall be connected to the stud below using a stud to plate connector with a minimum uplift capacity of 500 lbs.  Use of straps that connect directly from the rafter or truss to the wall stud below shall be allowed as an alternate provided the two members align with no more than 1-1/2” offset.

611.8.1.4  Prescriptive method for gable roofs on a masonry wall.  The anchorage of each of the exposed rafters or truss within 6 ft of the corner along the exterior wall on each side of each gable end shall be inspected.  Wherever a strap is missing or an existing strap has fewer than four fasteners on each end, approved straps, ties or right angle gusset brackets with a minimum uplift capacity of 500 lbs shall be installed that connect each rafter or truss to the top plate below or directly to the masonry wall using approved masonry screws that will provide at least a 2-1/2 embedment into the concrete or masonry.  When the straps or right angle gusset brackets are attached to a wood sill plate, the sill plate shall be anchored to the concrete masonry wall below.  This anchorage shall be accomplished by installing ¼-inch diameter masonry screws, each with supplementary ¼-inch washer, having sufficient length to develop a 2-1/2 inch embedment into the concrete and masonry.  These screws shall be installed within 4-inches of the truss or rafter on both sides of each interior rafter or truss and on the accessible wall side of the gable end truss or rafter.

611.8.1.5  Prescriptive method for hip roofs on a wood frame wall. Unless it is possible to verify through non-destructive inspection or from plans prepared by a design professional that the roof structure is anchored at least as well as outlined below, access shall be provided at a minimum to the hip rafter (commonly known as a “king jack”), to the hip girder and at each corner of the hip roof.  The hip rafter (commonly known as a “king jack”), the hip girder and the rafters/trusses adjacent to the hip girder that are not anchored with a strap having at least four fasteners on each end, shall be connected to the top plate below using a strap or a right angle gusset bracket having a minimum uplift capacity of 500 lbs.  Adding fasteners to existing straps shall be allowed in lieu of adding a new strap provided the strap is manufactured to accommodate at least 4 fasteners at each end.   Wherever access makes it possible (without damage of the wall or soffit finishes), both top plate members shall be connected to the stud below using a stud to plate connector with a minimum uplift capacity of 500 lbs.  Use of straps that connect directly from the hip rafter, hip girder or adjacent rafters/trusses to the wall stud below shall be allowed as an alternate provided the two members align with no more than 1-1/2” offset.

611.8.1.6 Prescriptive method for hip roofs on a masonry wall.  Unless it is possible to verify through non-destructive inspection or from plans prepared by a design professional that the roof structure is anchored at least as well as outlined below, access shall be provided at a minimum to the hip rafter (commonly known as a “king jack”), to the hip girder and at each corner of the hip roof.  The hip rafter (commonly known as a “king jack”), the hip girder and the rafters/trusses adjacent to the hip girder that are not anchored with a strap having at least four fasteners on each end, shall be connected to the concrete masonry wall below using approved straps or right angle gusset brackets with a minimum uplift capacity of 500 lbs.  Adding fasteners to existing straps shall be allowed in lieu of adding a new strap provided the strap is manufactured to accommodate at least 4 fasteners at each end.  The straps or right angle gusset brackets shall be installed such that they connect each rafter or truss to the top plate below or directly to the masonry wall using approved masonry screws that will provide at least a 2-1/2 embedment into the concrete or masonry.  When the straps or right angle gusset brackets are attached to a wood sill plate, the sill plate shall be anchored to the concrete masonry wall below.  This anchorage shall be accomplished by installing ¼-inch diameter masonry screws, each with supplementary ¼-inch washer, with sufficient length to develop a 2-1/2 inch embedment into the concrete and masonry.  These screws shall be installed within 4-inches of the truss or rafter on both sides of each interior rafter or truss and on the accessible wall side of the gable end truss or rafter.

611.8.1.7 Priorities for mandated roof-to-wall retrofit expenditures.  Priority shall be given to connecting the exterior corners of roofs to walls where the spans of the roofing members are greatest. For houses with both hip and gable roof ends, the priority shall be to retrofit the gable end roof-to-wall connections unless the width of the hip end is more than 1.5 times greater than the width of the gable end.  
Table 611.8.1 

Required Uplift Capacities for Roof-to-Wall Connections

(POUNDS PER LINEAR FOOT)

[image: image1.png]ROOF SPAN (FEET)

[
e T o T ow ] w5 T o Jowawes
« o w0 | e | wen s | e |
m st et | amw | avs e s | s
w0 susis | znon | ass | oo sz | saw | e
H 2 e | w94 |z | awm | smwo | sum | s
P a2 | amay | aom | sz o | own | ea
P s | swn | s | wom | _ow | | s
E awoto | wan | s | oo _wow | _omw | sz
= 170 645.67 77481 903.94. -1033.08 116221 129135 -108
. | o | o | o | amo | mw |
g 90 9639 -11246 12852 -14459 -160.66 303
H 100 13589 -158.54 18119 20384 22649 374
£, [ s | awa | oo _awn s | s
A amse | oo | smes | _aon | s | a2
A T T T P
H 150 s | o | e | sme | e | s





[Mod 3050 revised]

Chapter 7 Alterations – Level 2
Section 703.5.1 Minimum requirement revise text to read as follows:

703.5.1 Minimum requirement. Every port ion of a floor, such as a balcony or a loading dock, that is more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the floor or grade below and is not provided with guards, or those in which the existing guards are judged to be in danger of collapsing, shall be provided with guards.

Exception: Guards are not required for the following locations:

1. On the loading side of loading docks or piers.

2. On the audience side of stages and raised platforms, including steps leading up to the stage and raised platforms.

3. On raised stage and platform floor areas, such as runways, ramps and side stages used for entertainment or presentations.

4. At vertical openings in the performance area of stages and platforms.

5. At elevated walking surfaces appurtenant to stages and platforms for access to and utilization of special lighting or equipment.

6. Along vehicle service pits not accessible to the public.

7. In assembly seating where guards in accordance with Section 1025.14 are permitted and provided.

[Mod 3228]

Section 705.3.1.2.1 Fire escape access and details delete text to read as follows:

705.3.1.2.1 Fire escape access and details.  Reserved.  Fire escapes shall comply with all of the following requirements:

1. Occupants shall have unobstructed access to the fire escape without having to pass through a room subject to locking.

2. Access to a new fire escape shall be through a door, except that windows shall be permitted to provide access from single dwelling units or sleeping units in Group R-1, R-2, and I-1 occupancies or to provide access from spaces having a maximum occupant load of 10 in other occupancy classifications.

3. Newly constructed fire escapes shall be permitted only where exterior stairs cannot be utilized because of lot lines limiting the stair size or because of the sidewalks, alleys, or roads at grade level.

4. Openings within 10 feet (3048 mm) of fire escape stairs shall be protected by fire assemblies having minimum 3/4-hour fire-resistance ratings.

Exception: Opening protection shall not be required in buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system.

5. In all buildings of Group E occupancy, up to and including the 12th grade, buildings of Group I occupancy, rooming houses, and childcare centers, ladders of any type are prohibited on fire escapes used as a required means of egress.

705.3.1.2.2 Construction. The fire escape shall be designed to support a live load of 100 pounds per square foot (4788 Pa) and shall be constructed of steel or other approved noncombustible materials. Fire escapes constructed of wood not less than nominal 2 inches (51 mm) thick are permitted on buildings of Type V construction. Walkways and railings located over or supported by combustible roofs in buildings of Types III and IV construction are permitted to be of wood not less than nominal 2 inches (51 mm) thick.

705.3.1.2.3 Dimensions. Stairs shall be at least 22 inches (559 mm) wide with risers not more than, and treads not less than, 8 inches (203 mm). Landings at the foot of stairs shall not be less than 40 inches (1016 mm) wide by 36 inches (914 mm) long and located not more than 8 inches (203 mm) below the door.
[Mod 2872]

Section 705.5 Openings in corridor walls revise text to read as follows:

705.5 Openings in corridor walls. Reserved.  Openings in corridor walls in any work area shall comply with Sections 705.5.1.1 through 705.5.4.

Exception: Openings in corridors where such corridors are not required to be rated in accordance with the Florida Building Code, Building.

[Mod 3051]

Section 705.5.1 Corridor doors revise text to read as follows:

705.5.1 Corridor doors. Reserved.  Corridor doors in the work area shall not be constructed of hollow core wood and shall not contain louvers. All dwelling unit or sleeping unit corridor doors in work areas in buildings of Groups R-1, R-2, and I-1 shall be at least 13/8-inch (35 mm) solid core wood or approved equivalent and shall not have any glass panels, other than approved wired glass or other approved glazing material in metal frames. All dwelling unit or sleeping unit corridor doors in work areas in buildings of GroupsR-1,R-2, and I-1 shall be equipped with approved door closers. All replacement doors shall be 13/4-inch (45 mm) solid bonded wood core or approved equivalent, unless the existing frame will accommodate only a 13/8-inch (35 mm) door.

Exceptions:

1. Corridor doors within a dwelling unit or sleeping unit.

2. Existing doors meeting the requirements of HUD Guideline on Fire Ratings of Archaic Materials and Assemblies (IEBC Resource A) for a rating of 15 minutes or more shall be accepted as meeting the provisions of this requirement

3. Existing doors in buildings protected throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system shall be required only to resist smoke, be reasonably tight fitting, and shall not contain louvers.

4. In group homes with a maximum of 15 occupants and that are protected with an approved automatic detection system, closing devices may be omitted.

5. Door assemblies having a fire-protection rating of at least 20 minutes.
[Mod 2873]  
707.4.2 Lateral loads.  Reserved.  Buildings in which Level 2 alterations increase the seismic base shear by more than 10 percent or decrease the seismic base shear capacity by more than 10 percent shall comply with the structural requirements specified in Sections 807.5 and 807.7. Changes in base shear and base shear capacity shall be calculated relative to conditions at the time of the original construction.

Exception: If the building’s seismic base shear capacity has been increased since the original construction, the percentage changes shall be permitted to be calculated relative to the increased value.
[Staff Comment]
Chapter 8 Alterations – Level 3

Section 801.2 Compliance revise text to read as follows:

801.2 Compliance. In addition to the provisions of this chapter, work shall comply with all of the requirements of Chapters 6 and 7. The requirements of Sections 703, 704, and 705 shall apply within all work areas whether or not they include exits and corridors shared by more than one tenant and regardless of the occupant load.

Exception: Buildings in which the reconfiguration of space affecting exits or shared egress access is exclusively the result of compliance with the accessibility requirements of Section 605.2 shall not be required to comply with this chapter.
[Mod 3072]

Section 804.2.1 Manual fire alarm systems delete text to read as follows:

804.2.1 Manual fire alarm systems.  Reserved. Where required by the Florida Building Code, Building, a manual fire alarm system shall be provided throughout the work area. Alarm notification appliances shall be provided on such floors and shall be automatically activated as required by the Florida Building Code, Building.

Exceptions:

1. Alarm-initiating and notification appliances shall not be required to be installed in tenant spaces outside of the work area.

2. Visual alarm notification appliances are not required, except where an existing alarm system is upgraded or replaced or where a new fire alarm system is installed.

804.2.2 Automatic fire detection. Where required by the Florida Building Code, Building for new buildings, automatic fire detection systems shall be provided throughout the work area.
[Mod 2888]  
Section 807.7 Voluntary lateral-force-resisting system alterations revise text to read as follows:

807.7 Voluntary lateral-force-resisting system alterations.  Alterations of existing structural elements and additions of new structural elements that are initiated for the purpose of increasing the lateral-force-resisting strength or stiffness of an existing structure and that are not required by other sections of this code shall not be required to be designed for forces conforming to the Florida Building Code, provided that an engineering analysis is submitted to show that:

1. The capacity of existing structural elements required to resist forces is not reduced;

2. Either the lateral loading to existing structural elements is not increased beyond their capacity or the lateral loading to existing structural elements is not increased by more than 10 percent;

3. New structural elements are detailed and connected to the existing structural elements as required by the

Florida Building Code;

4. New or relocated nonstructural elements are detailed and connected to existing or new structural elements as required by the Florida Building Code; and

5. A dangerous condition as defined in this code is not created. Voluntary alterations to lateral-force-resisting systems conducted in accordance with Appendix A and the referenced standards of this code shall be permitted.
[Mod 2891]

Chapter 9 Change of Occupancy
Section 913 is added to read as follows:

913 Energy Conservation.  See Chapter 13 of the Florida Building Code, Building.

[Staff after]

Chapter 15 Reference Standards

Revise text to read as follows:

ASME

A17.1S-2005, Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators, Supplement to A17.1-2004

A17.3-1996 2002, Safety Code for Existing Elevators and Escalators, section 802.1.2

A18.1-1999 2003, Safety Standard for Platform Lifts and Stairway Chair Lifts—with A18.la—2001 Addenda; sections 308.8.3, and 605.1.3

[Mod 3317]

Revise text to read as follows:

NFPA

NFPA 13R—02 99 Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Occupancies up to and Including Four Stories in Height . . . . . . . . . . 704.2.5

NFPA 99—05 99 Health Care Facilities . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .507.1.4

[Mod 3052]

Add text to read as follows:

CHAPTER 16 RETROFITTING

Section 1601 General, add text to read as follows:

SECTION 1601 GENERAL

1601.1  Intent and purpose.  The provisions of this subsection provide prescriptive solutions for the retrofitting of gable ends of buildings. The retrofit measures are based on engineering calculations and are intended to provide strengthening of gable ends such that the retrofitted gable ends have strength equal to the structural provisions of the latest building code requirements for new buildings.  Design for compliance of new buildings and additions to existing buildings shall conform to the requirements of the Florida Building Code, Building or Florida Building Code, Residential as applicable.

1601.2  Scope.  The provisions of this chapter are intended to provide prescriptive methods for retrofitting buildings to make them stronger or more durable.
Section 1602 Definitions, add text to read as follows:

SECTION 1602 DEFINITIONS

ANCHOR BLOCK.  A nominal 2-inch  thick by at least 4” wide piece of lumber secured to horizontal braces and filling the gap between existing framing members for the purpose of restraining horizontal braces from movement perpendicular to the framing members.

COMPRESSION BLOCK.  A nominal 2-inch thick by at least 4” wide piece of lumber used to restrain in the compression mode (force directed towards the interior of the attic) an existing or retrofit stud.  It is attached to a horizontal brace and bears directly against the existing or retrofit stud.   

CONVENTIONALLY FRAMED GABLE END.  A conventionally framed gable end with studs whose faces are perpendicular to the gable end wall.

HORIZONTAL BRACE.   A nominal 2-inch thick by at least 4” wide piece of lumber used to restrain both compression and tension loads applied by a retrofit stud.  It is typically installed horizontally on the top of floor framing members (truss bottom chords or ceiling joists) or on the bottom of pitched roof framing members (truss top chord or rafters). 

HURRICANE TIES.  Manufactured metal connectors designed to provide uplift and lateral restraint for roof framing members. 

NAIL PLATE.  A manufactured metal plate made of minimum of 20 gauge galvanized steel with factory punched holes sized for 8d common nails.  A nail plate may have the geometry of a strap.

RETROFIT STUD.  A nominal 2-inch lumber member used to structurally supplement an existing gable end wall stud.

RIGHT ANGLE BRACKET.  A 14 gage or thicker galvanized metal right angle bracket listed by the manufacturer for the material into which they will be attached, masonry (concrete or CMU) or wood, to have a minimum specified load capacity of 350 lbs for uplift and lateral conditions, when the maximum number of fasteners specified by the manufacturer are used.
STUD-TO-PLATE CONNECTOR.  A manufactured metal connector designed to connect studs to plates with a minimum uplift capacity of 500 lbs.

TRUSS GABLE END.  An engineered factory made truss or site built truss that incorporates factory installed or field installed vertical studs with their faces parallel to the plane of the truss and are spaced no greater than 24-inches on center.  Web or other diagonal members other than top chords may or may not be present.  Gable end trusses may be of the same height as nearby trusses or may be drop chord trusses in which the top chord of the truss is lower by the depth of the top chord or outlookers.

Section 1603 Materials of Construction, add text to read as follows:

SECTION 1603 MATERIALS OF CONSTRUCTION

1603.1  Existing materials. All existing wood materials that will be part of the retrofitting work (trusses, rafters, ceiling joists, top plates, wall studs, etc.) shall be in sound condition and free from defects or damage that substantially reduces the load-carrying capacity of the member.  Any wood materials found to be damaged or deteriorated shall be strengthened or replaced with new materials to provide a net dimension of sound wood equivalent to its undamaged original dimensions.

1603.2  New materials.  All materials approved by this code, including their appropriate allowable stresses, shall be permitted to meet the requirements of this chapter.

1603.3 Dimensional lumber.  All dimensional lumber for braces, studs, and blocking shall conform to applicable standards or grading rules.  Dimensional lumber shall be identified by a grade mark of a lumber grading or inspection agency that has been approved by an accreditation body that complies with DOC PS 20.  All new dimensional lumber to be used for retrofitting purposes shall be a minimum grade and species of #2 Spruce-Pine-Fir or shall have a specific gravity of 0.42 or greater.  In lieu of a grade mark, a certificate of inspection issued by a lumber grading or inspection agency meeting the requirements of this code shall be accepted.

1603.4 Metal plate connectors, straps and anchors. Metal plate connectors, plates, straps and anchors shall have product approval.  They shall be approved for connecting wood-to-wood or wood-to-concrete as appropriate.  Straps and nail plates shall be manufactured from galvanized steel with a minimum thickness of 20 gauge.  Nail plates shall have holes sized for a minimum of 8d nails.

1603.5 Twists in straps.  Straps shall be permitted to be twisted 90 degrees in addition to a 90 degree bend where they transition between framing members or connection points.  Straps shall be bent only once at a given location though it is permissible that they be bent or twisted at multiple locations along their length.

1603.6  Fasteners.  Fasteners shall meet the requirements of Sections 1603.6.1 and Section 1603.6.2, and shall be permitted to be screws or nails meeting the minimum length requirement shown in figures and specified in tables. Fastener spacing shall meet the requirements of Section 1603.6.3.

1603.6.1 Screws.  Screws shall be a minimum #8 size with head diameters no less than 0.28 inches.   Screw lengths shall be no less than indicated in the Figures and in Tables.  Permissible screws include deck screws and wood screws.  Screws shall have at least 1 inch of thread.  Fine threaded screws or drywall screws shall not be permitted. Select the largest possible diameter screw such that the shank adjacent to the head fits through the hole in the strap. 

1603.6.2 Nails.  Unless otherwise indicated in the provisions or drawings, where fastener lengths are indicated in Figures and Tables as 1-¼ inches, 8d common nails with shank diameter 0.131 inches and head diameters no less than 0.28 inches shall be permitted.  Unless otherwise indicated in the provisions or drawings, where fasteners lengths are indicated in Figures and Tables as 3 inches, 10d common nails with shank diameter of 0.148 inches and head diameters no less than 0.28 inches shall be permitted.  

[Mod 3148]

1603.6.3 General fastener spacing.  Fastener spacing for shear connections of lumber-to-lumber shall meet the requirements shown in Figure 1603.6.3 and the following conditions.  
1603.6.3.1 General fastener spacing.  Fastener spacing shall meet the following conditions except as provided for in Section 1603.6.3.3

1. The distance between fasteners and the edge of lumber that is less than 3-1/2 inches deep in the direction of the fastener length shall be a minimum of 3/4 inches.  

2. The distance between fasteners and the edge of lumber that is more than 2 inches thick in the direction of the fastener length shall be a minimum of ½ inches.

3. The distance between a fastener and the end of lumber shall be a minimum of 2-½ inches.

4. The distance between fasteners parallel to the grain (center-to-center) shall be a minimum of 2-1/2 inches.

5. The distance between fasteners perpendicular to the grain (center-to-center) in lumber that is less than 3-1/2 inches deep in the direction of the fastener length shall be 1 inch.

6. The distance between fasteners perpendicular to the grain (center-to-center) in lumber that is more than 2 inches thick in the direction of the fastener length shall be ½ inches.

[image: image2.png]o o Vo

2X4
3-1/2" FACE

FIGURE 1603.6.3

FASTENER SPACINGS FOR LUMBER TO LUMBER
CONNECTIONS
OPERATING IN SHEAR PARALLEL TO GRAIN

~~ END DISTANCE MINIMUM 2-1/2"~"

3 -
s EDGE DISTANCE MINIMUM 1/2"

DISTANCE ACROSS GRAIN MINIMUM 1"

T DISTANCE PARALLEL TOGRAIN —

MINIMUM 2-1/2"

2X6
5-1/2" FACE





[Mod 3149]

1603.6.3.2 Wood-to-wood connections of two members each 2 inch or less thick.  Wood-to-wood connections fastener spacing shall meet the following conditions.

1. The distance between fasteners parallel to grain (center-to-center) shall be a minimum of 2-1/2 inches.  

2. The distance between fasteners across grain (center-to-center) shall be a minimum of 1 inch.

3. For wood-to-wood connections of lumber at right angles, fasteners shall be spaced a minimum of 2-1/2 inches parallel to the grain and 1 inch perpendicular to the grain in any direction.

1603.6.3.3 Metal connectors to wood connections.  Metal connectors to wood connections shall meet the following conditions.

1. Fastener spacing to edge or ends of lumber shall be as dictated by the prefabricated holes in the connectors and the connectors shall be installed in a configuration that is similar to that shown by the connector manufacturer.

2. Fasteners in metal straps 1-1/4 inch wide that are installed on the 1-1/2 inch broad face of lumber shall be a minimum 1/4 inches from either face that is perpendicular to the 1-1/2 inch edge of the lumber.  Consistent with Section 1603.6.3.1 fasteners shall be allowed to be spaced according to the fastener holes provided in the strap.
3. Fasteners in metal nail plates shall be spaced a minimum of ½ inches across wood grain and a minimum of 1-1/2 inches parallel to wood grain.

[Mod 3149]

Section 1604 Retrofitting Gable End Walls add text to read as follows:

SECTION 1604 RETROFITTING GABLE END WALLS

1604.1 General.

1604.1.1 Scope and intent.  The following prescriptive methods are intended for applications where the gable end wall framing is provided by a wood gable end wall truss or a conventionally framed rafter system.  The retrofits are appropriate for wall studs oriented with their broad face parallel to or perpendicular to the gable end surface.  Gable ends to be strengthened shall be permitted to be retrofitted using methods prescribed by provisions of this section.  These prescriptive methods of retrofitting are intended to increase the resistance of existing gable end construction for out-of-plane wind loads resulting from high wind events.  The retrofit method addresses four issues by strengthening the framing members of the gable end itself with the use of retrofit studs (Section 1604.3), bracing the top and bottom of the gable end so that lateral loads are transmitted into the roof and ceiling diaphragms by the use of horizontal braces (Section 1604.2), making connections between horizontal braces and retrofit studs by the use of straps (see Section 1604.4), and connecting the bottom of the gable end to the wall below to help brace the top of that wall by the use of right angle brackets (Section 1604.5).  The minimum ceiling diaphragm shall be comprised of minimum ½ inch thick drywall, minimum 3/8 inch thick plywood, or plaster.  An overview isometric drawing of one kind of retrofit is shown in Figure 1604.1.1. 

[image: image3.png]FIGURE 1604.1.1
BASIC GABLE END RETROFIT METHODOLOGY

3. RETROFIT STUDS

/ CONNECTED TO
/ / HORIZONTAL BRACES
/ 2. RETROFIT STUD WITH STRAPS.
/ FASTENED TO y
/ EXISTING STUD
1. HORIZONTAL BRACES  / ESE%ZZLEQAUE[’;‘T / | 4. GABLE END FRAMING
FASTENED TOROOF  / 5 / | MEMBER CONNECTED

AND CEILING /
DIAPHRAGMS VIA THE /
ROOF AND CEILING /
FRAMING MEMBERS.

TO WALL BELOW.

THIS FIGURE SHOWS A TRUSS GABLE END.

THE METHODOLOGY FOR A CONVENTIONALLY FRAMED GABLE END IS SIMILAR
THE NUMBERS INDICATE A TYPICAL SEQUENCE OF INSTALLATION.

IN ORDER TO SHOW STRAPS COMPRESSION BLOCKS ARE NOT SHOWN.





[Mod 3151]

1604.2 Horizontal Braces.  Horizontal braces shall be installed approximately perpendicular to the roof and ceiling framing members at the location of each existing gable end stud greater than 3 feet in length.  Unless it is adjacent to an omitted horizontal brace location, horizontal braces shall be minimum 2x4 dimensional lumber as defined in Section 1603.3.  A single horizontal brace is required at the top and bottom of each gable end stud for Retrofit Configuration A, B, or C and two horizontal braces are required for Retrofit Configuration D.  Maximum heights of gable end wall studs and associated retrofit studs for each Retrofit Configuration shall not exceed the values listed in Table 1604.2.  Horizontal braces shall be oriented with their broad faces across the roof or ceiling framing members, be fastened to a minimum of three framing members, and extend at least 6 feet measured perpendicularly from the gable end plus 2-1/2 inches beyond the last top chord or bottom chord member (rafter or ceiling joist) from the gable end as shown in Figure 1604.2(1), Figure 1604.2(2), Figure 1604.2(3), and Figure 1604.2(4).    
	
	
	    TABLE 1604.2
	
	

	STUD LENGTH LIMITATIONS BASED ON EXPOSURE AND DESIGN WIND SPEED

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Exposure
	Maximum 3-Sec Gust
	    Maximum Height of Gable End Retrofit Stud b

	Category
	Basic Wind Speed a
	 
	
	
	 

	C
	110
	8'-0"
	11'-3"
	14'-9"
	16'-0"

	C
	120
	7'-6"
	10'-6"
	13'-6"
	16'-0"

	C
	130
	7'-0"
	10'-0"
	12'-3"
	16'-0"

	C
	140
	7'-0"
	10'-0"
	12'-3"
	16'-0"

	C
	150
	6'-6"
	8"-9"
	11'-0"
	16'-0"

	B
	110
	8'-0"
	12'-3"
	16'-0"
	N/R c.

	B
	120
	8'-0"
	11'-3"
	14'-9"
	16'-0"

	B
	130
	8'-0"
	11'-3"
	14'-9"
	16'-0"

	B
	140
	7'-6"
	10'-6"
	13'-6"
	16'-0"

	B
	150
	7'-0"
	10'-0"
	12'-3"
	16'-0"

	
	Retrofit Configuration -->
	A
	B
	C
	D

	
	For SI:  1 Inch = 25.4mm, 1 Foot = 304.8mm
	
	
	

	a.
	Interpolation between given wind speeds not permitted.
	
	

	b.
	Existing gable end studs less than or equal to 3'-0" in height shall not require retrofitting.

	c.
	N/R = Not Required.  Configuration C is acceptable to 16'-0" maximum height.
	


[Mod 3151]


[image: image4]

[image: image5]

[image: image6]

[image: image7]
[Mod 3152]
1604.2.1 Existing gable end studs.  If the spacing of existing vertical gable end studs is greater than 24 inches, a new stud and corresponding horizontal braces shall be installed such that the maximum spacing between existing and added studs shall be no greater than 24 inches.  Additional gable end wall studs shall not be required at locations where their length would be 3 feet or less.  Each end of each required new stud shall be attached to the existing roofing framing members (truss top chord or rafter and truss bottom chord or ceiling joist) using a minimum of two 3 inch toenail fasteners (#8 wood screws or 10d nails) and a metal connector with minimum uplift capacity of 175 pounds, or nail plates with a minimum of four 1-1/4 inch long fasteners (#8 wood screws or 8d nails).   
1604.2.2 Main method of installation. Each horizontal brace shall be fastened to each existing roof or ceiling member that it crosses using three 3-inch long fasteners (#8 wood screws or 10d nails) as indicated in Figure 1604.2(1) and Figure 1604.2.31604.2(3) for trusses and Figure 1604.2(2) and Figure 1604.2(4) for conventionally framed gable end walls.   Alternative methods for providing horizontal bracing of the gable end studs as provided in Sections 1604.2.3 through 1604.2.9 shall be allowed in lieu of this primary installation method.
1604.2.3 Omitted horizontal brace.  Where impediments, other permanently attached obstacles or conditions exist that prevent installation in accordance with Section 1604.2.2 horizontal braces may be omitted for height limitations corresponding to Retrofit Configurations A and B as defined in Table 1604.2 provided installation is as indicated in Figure 1604.2.3 and provided all of the following conditions are met.  This method is not allowed for Retrofit Configurations C or D.
1. There shall be at least two horizontal braces on each side of an omitted horizontal brace or at least one horizontal brace if it is the end horizontal brace.  Omitted horizontal braces must be separated by at least two horizontal braces even if that location is comprised of two retrofit studs and two horizontal braces.  
2. Horizontal braces adjacent to the omitted horizontal brace shall be 2x6 lumber, shall butt against the existing studs, and shall be fastened to each existing roof or ceiling member that it crosses using three 3-inch long fasteners (#8 wood screws or 10d nails).  For Retrofit Configuration B, 4 fasteners shall be required on at least one of the connections between the horizontal brace and the existing roof and ceiling framing members.  Fasteners shall be spaced a minimum of ¾” from the edges of the horizontal braces and a minimum of 1-3/4” from adjacent fasteners.

3. Where the existing studs on each side of an omitted horizontal brace have their broad face parallel to the gable end wall the retrofit studs at those locations and the retrofit stud at the omitted horizontal brace locations shall be 2x6 lumber for Retrofit Configuration A and 2x8 lumber for Retrofit Configuration B. 

4. Where the existing studs on each side of an omitted horizontal brace have their broad face perpendicular to the gable end wall, the retrofit studs at those locations and the retrofit stud at the omitted horizontal brace locations shall be sized such that they protrude a minimum of 3-1/2 inches beyond the interior edge of the existing studs for both Retrofit Configurations A and B.  The edges of the three retrofit studs facing towards the interior of the attic shall be aligned such that they are the same distance from the gable end wall.  

5. Retrofit studs shall be fastened to existing studs in accordance with Section 1604.3.

6. Retrofit studs adjacent to the omitted horizontal brace shall be fastened to the horizontal brace using straps in accordance with Table 1604.4.1 consistent with the size of the retrofit stud.  The method applicable to Table 1604.4.2 is not allowed.

7. A strong back made of minimum of 2x8 lumber shall be placed parallel to the gable end and shall be located on and span between horizontal braces on the two sides of the omitted horizontal brace and shall extend beyond each horizontal braces by a minimum of 2-1/2 inches.  The strong back shall be butted to the three retrofit studs.  The strong back shall be attached to each of the horizontal braces on which it rests with 5 each 3 inch long fasteners (#8 screws or 8d nails).  Those fasteners shall be spaced a minimum of 3/4 inch from any edge of lumber and shall be spaced a minimum of 2-1/2 inch from each other.  Additional compression blocks shall not be required at locations where a strong back butts against a retrofit stud. 

8. The retrofit stud at the location of the omitted horizontal braces shall be fastened to the strong back using a connector with minimum uplift capacity of 800 pounds and installed such that this capacity is oriented in the direction perpendicular to the gable end wall.

9. The use of shortened horizontal braces using the alternative method of Section 1604.2.5 is not allowable for horizontal braces adjacent to the omitted horizontal braces.

10. Horizontal braces shall be permitted to be interrupted in accordance with Section 1604.2.8.

[image: image8.emf] 


[Mod 3153 revised]
1604.2.4 Omitted horizontal brace and retrofit stud.  Where impediments, other permanently attached obstacles or conditions exist that prevent installation in accordance with Section 1604.2.2 or Section 1604.2.3 by not permitting installation of horizontal braces, retrofit studs and horizontal brace shall be permitted to be omitted from those locations by installation of ladder assemblies for Retrofit Configurations A and B as defined in Table 1604.2 provided all of the following conditions are met.  This method is not allowed for Retrofit Configurations C or D.
1. No more than two ladder assemblies are permitted on a single gable end.

2. There shall be at least two retrofit studs and horizontal brace assemblies on either side of the locations where the retrofit studs and horizontal bracing members are omitted (no two ladder braces bearing on a single retrofit stud). 

3. Retrofit studs immediately on each side of the omitted retrofit stud shall be increased to the member size corresponding to the next higher Retrofit Configuration indicated in Table 1604.4.1 or Table 1604.4.2 and fastened to the horizontal braces as indicated in that table for the larger member size.

4. Horizontal braces adjacent to the omitted horizontal brace shall be 2x6 lumber and be fastened to each existing roof or ceiling member crossed using three 3-inch long fasteners (#8 wood screws or 10d nails) as indicated in Figure 1604.2(1) and Figure 1604.2(3) for trusses and Figure 1604.2(2) and Figure 1604.2(4) for conventionally framed gable end wall.  For Retrofit Configuration B, 4 fasteners shall be required on at least one of the connections between the horizontal brace and the existing roof and ceiling framing members.  
5. Ladder rungs shall be provided across the location of the omitted retrofit studs as indicated in Figure 1604.2.4(1) for trusses and Figure 1604.2.4(2) for conventionally framed gable end walls.  

6. Ladder rungs shall be made of at a minimum 2x4 lumber oriented with their broad face horizontal and spaced a maximum of 16-inches on center vertically.  

7. Where ladder rungs cross structural members such as the existing stud at the omitted retrofit stud location or gable end vent framing they shall be connected to each other with a metal connector with a minimum capacity of 175 pounds in the direction perpendicular to the gable end wall.   
8. Notching of the ladder rungs shall not be permitted unless the net depth of the framing member is a minimum of 3-1/2 inches.

[image: image9.png](aN3 378V $SNYL) ANLs LIJ0Y13Y A3LLINO YO DNIOYHE ¥3aaAv1 40 1vL3d (2’ v09l 3¥NOI4

M3IA NOILYAIT3

ONIXMO019 ¥3aav1

‘0’0 9 ® syaNTLSYH

ONOT «£ NI /M dNLS ONILSIX3
OL HOVLLY (3ZIs a3SYIHONI)
anLs LI40313d Xz a3dIND3Y

0L (37IS Q3SYIHOND
anls LIH0Y13Y
Wodd (dAl) Ll
SUANTLSYH ONO1
/LI (TTYM OL
“ONId¥3d ALIDY YD
“87521 'NIW) ITONY
ONINYY VL3N ~

ONIDVdS
TWOLLYIA 2L @
ONIX20TE ONNY
¥IAAY1 PXZ NIN

=

ANISTHd 81

HIGWIW TV OILHTIA ONILSIXT
NIHA ONIXO0TE ¥3aav

0L aNLs aN3 379vO ONILSIX3
WOY4 (dAL) SHINTLSYS

ONOT «PiL-L /AR (ALIDY dYD

€7 21 'NIW) 1L INYORIENH

TIVAA ON3 378Y0
SSMYL ONILSIXI

ONIX0078 ¥3aav1
0L (3Z1s a3SYIHONI) ANLS 140813y
WOY4 (dAL) ¥3INILSYH ONOT uFil-L IM
(TTvAA OL ¥V INDIONYJYId ALIDYAYD

M3IANYId

TYOLLYIA 00 «ZL B

"8752L NIN) 3TONY ONINYYA TY.LIW DRI EE; INAEES Ay FXZENIR

‘0’0 .9 ® suaNTLSYL

ONOT «€ NIN /M aNLS ONILSIX3
OL HOVLLY (3ZIs a3SYIHONI
anLs L40313y Xz a3dIND3y

[

4

Q3HOV.LLY S| ONIHLYIHS TT¥A HOIHA OL LNIST¥d ¥
SHIGWIW TYIILHIA ONILSIXT ANV NIHM ONIMO01G ¥3aav
0L aNLS aN3 378vD ONILSIXI WO¥A (dAL) SHANILSYS
ONOT P/1-L /M (ALIOY YD "8 S21 "NIW) 31L 3NV OI-¥NNH

TIYAA ON3 378V0
SSNYL ONILSIX3





[image: image10.png](ONINYYS TYNOILNIANOD) aNLs 1404134 d3LLINO ¥Od ONIOYYE ¥3aav 40 1iviaa (e vo9l 3unold

M3IA NOILYAIT3

0°0 «9 @ SYAN3LSYH ONOT (&

w3aav1 ol (3z1s nww_,_l_\wmwyw T ._<u_._.mw\_h_ _nw”n% = ANanLS SNLLEXIOL HowL L (e
Z GISYIHONI) ANLS LIJ0¥LTY Xz QSN0
anLs LI408134 WO¥A ONI¥DOTE ONNY
(dAL) SHINILSYA ONOT ubiL-L IM ¥3QaY1 vXz NI \
(TT¥M OL ¥V INOIANTdY3d
ALIDYdYO 81821
NIW) STONY ONINYS TY.LIW /.I_l ==
=
/ TTYA ONS 318D QIWYNd
ATTYNOLLNIANOD ONILSIXS
INISTYd SI ¥IEWIW TYOLLYIA ONILSIXS NSHM ONIMOOTE
¥30AYT OL NLS AN 319vO ONILSIXT WO (dAL) SYINILSY
ONOT /L) I (ALIDY YD '8 2L NIW) SIL INYORRINH
ONID0TE ¥3aaYT M3IA NV
0L (371S QISYIHONI) aNLS 1140813
WO¥ (dAL) ¥INILSYH ONOT /L) M 0.2 ® 00 9 @ SANILSVH ONOT «f
(TTYM OL ¥y INDIONId¥3d ALIDY YD TYOLLYIA "D ox:u.v ‘NIW /A ONLS ONILSIX3 OL HOVLLY (3zIS
g7 621 'NIW) 3TONY ONINVNA Tv.LIN 3 ONIXO078 ONNY ¥3AAvT PX2 NIW / QISVIHONI) ANLS LIAONLTN Xz aIINDIY

e

% - ¥
| ug

Q3HOV.LLY SI ONIHLYIHS TT¥AM HOIHAM OL LNIST¥d JdvY /
SHIGWIW TYIILHTIA ONILSIXT ANV NIHAM ONIXMO013 ¥3aav TIVAA ONT 3719YD aWVHL
0L aNLS aN3 378vD ONILSIXT WO¥A (dAL) SHANILSYS ATIYNOILNIANOD ONILSIX3

ONOT «P/1-L /M (ALIOY YD "8 S2L "NIW) 31L SNV OINNNH





[Mod 3153]

1604.2.5 Short horizontal brace.  Where impediments, other permanently attached obstacles or conditions exist that prevent installation in accordance with Sections 1604.2.2, 1604.2.3, or 1604.2.4 by not permitting extension of horizontal braces across the existing framing members such that they can be fastened to a minimum of three framing members and extend at least 6-feet from the gable end wall plus 2-1/2 inches beyond the last roof or ceiling framing member, the horizontal braces may be shortened provided installation is as indicated in Figure 1604.2.5 and provided that all of the following conditions are met.  
1. The horizontal brace shall be installed across a minimum of two framing spaces, extend a minimum of 4-feet from the gable end wall plus 2-1/2 inches beyond the last roof or ceiling framing member, and be fastened to each existing framing member with three 3-inch long fasteners (#8 wood screws or 10d nails),

2. An anchor block shall be fastened to the side of the horizontal brace in the second framing space from the gable end wall as shown in Figure 1604.2.5.  The anchor block lumber shall have a minimum edge thickness of 1-1/2 inches and the depth shall be as a minimum the depth of the existing roof or ceiling framing member.  Six 3-inch long fasteners (#8 wood screws or 10d nails) shall be used to fasten the anchor block to the side of the horizontal brace.  

3. The anchor block shall extend into the space between the roof or ceiling framing members a minimum of one-half the depth of the existing framing members at the location where the anchor block is installed.  The anchor block shall be installed tightly between the existing framing members such that the gap at either end shall not exceed 1/8 inch.  

4. The use of omitted horizontal braces using the method of Section 1604.2.3 is not allowable.

[image: image11.png]& ANCHOR BLOCKS ALLOWED AT ALL FRAMING
2 SPACES EXCEPT THE SPACE CLOSEST TO THE
% GABLE END
£y
Lo /
Z
el
—_ &

\

FLAT HORIZONTAL BRACE

ANCHOR BLOCK (MIN. SIZE EQUIVALENT

TO EXISTING FRAMING MEMBER), ATTACH
TO HORIZONTAL BRACE W/ MIN. 3"LONG
FASTENERS AT MIN. 2-1/2” SPACING
BETWEEN FASTENERS AND TO END OF

%" MIN.

l
% STAGGEV

BLOCK

t

/

EXISTING FRAMIMG MEMBER /

25" MIN. _._I

PLAN VIEW

FLAT HORIZONTAL BRACE W/
MIN. (3) 3” LONG FASTENERS @
CONNECTION TO EACH FRAMING

e

MIN. (3) 3” LONG FASTENERS @ HORIZONTAL
BRACE CONNECTION TO EACH FRAMING MEMBER

ANCHOR BLOCK (MIN. SIZE EQUIVALENT

TO EXISTING FRAMING MEMBER), ATTACH
TO HORIZONTAL BRACE W/ MIN. (6) 3" LONG
FASTENERS

MEMBER

F

EXISTING FRAMING MEMBER

SECTION VIEW

14

EXISTING FRAMING

TO 1/2 DEPTH OF
MEMBER

EXTEND BLOCK

FIGURE 1604.2.5 DETAIL OF ANCHOR BLOCK INSTALLATION





[Mod 3154]

1604.2.6 Installation of horizontal braces onto webs or vertical members of trusses.  Where existing conditions preclude installation of horizontal braces on truss top or bottom chords they shall be permitted to be installed on truss webs or vertical members of trusses provided all of the following conditions are met.

1. Horizontal braces shall be installed as close to the top or bottom chords as practical without altering the truss or any of its components and not more than three times the depth of the truss member to which it would ordinarily be attached. 

2. A racking block, comprised of an anchor block meeting the definition of anchor block of Section 1602 or comprised of minimum 15/32 inch plywood or 7/16 inch OSB, shall be fastened to the horizontal brace in the second framing space from the gable end wall.   The racking block shall extend towards the diaphragm (roof or ceiling as appropriate) so that the edge of the racking block closest to the diaphragm is within ½ the depth of the existing framing member from the diaphragm surface.  They shall be attached to horizontal braces using six fasteners (#8 wood screws or 10d nails) of sufficient length to provide 1-1/2 inches of penetration into the horizontal brace. 

3. Racking blocks can be fastened to any face or edge of horizontal braces between each web or truss vertical posts to which a horizontal brace is attached.  Racking blocks can be on alternate sides of horizontal braces.  Racking blocks shall be installed tightly between the lumber of truss members or truss plates such that the gap at either end shall be a maximum of 1/8 inch.

1604.2.7 Alternative method of installation of horizontal braces at truss ridges.  Where impediments such as truss plates or access for installation of fasteners limits or restricts installation of horizontal braces near the peak of the roof, ridge ties may be added to provide support for the required horizontal brace.  The top of added ridge tie members shall be installed a maximum of 16-inches below the existing ridge line or 4 inches below impediments.  The added ridge tie members shall be installed across a minimum of three bays, but no less than 6-feet from the gable end wall plus 2-1/2 inches beyond the last roof or ceiling framing member to permit fastening of the horizontal brace.  A minimum of a 2x4 member shall be used for each ridge tie and fastening shall consist of two 3-inch long wood screws, four 3 inch long 10d nails or two 3-1/2 inch long 16d nails driven through and clinched at each top chord or web member intersected by the ridge tie as illustrated in Figure 1604.2.7. 
[image: image12.png]NOILYTIVLSNI 311 LI40¥13Y¥ 40 TV13a 2Z¥091 J¥uNSId

M3IA NOILYAIT3

[sECTpleEE] [sEETpleEE]
SL140¥13¥ ON 7TVL <091 NVHL $S37 ANV 0~€ < SANLS AN3 37avD SLI40¥13y ON
«0-€ > sanLs Y04 AFHINDIY SLIH0ULTY «0-€ > sanLs

aN3 37avo aN3 37avo

anLs 114081349 HLIM 3NIT ANV anls (WOLLOE ANV dO1) aNls LIJOYLIY ¥O dnLs
QN3 379V ONILSIX3 ¥3LNID 40 3aIs N3 379VD ONILSIX3 ¥ILINID NIIMLIE (114

@ s30vyE TYINOZINOH pXZ Ly ¥31N3D

/[

1H9IL) ¥2078 NOISSTUAWOD PXZ TIVLSNI m
43

SYUINILSY ONOT £ 40 ¥IFWNN
AI™INDIY /M 30VHE TVINOZROH
OLHOVLLY. ‘HLONI1 a3¥IND3Y
40 20789 NOISSTHdWOD vXZ

$30V¥E TV.INOZIMOH ¥X2 1¥1d
427091 NOILDO3S HLIAM JONYTH0O0V NI NLs

ONILSIX3 OL HOV.LLY. ‘NLS 1I40813Y Xz a3¥IND3Y

HIGWIW ONILOISHILNI
HOV3 OL HOV.LLY .‘3IL ¥3L4VY ¥XZ NIN ‘IDAIY ¥v3IN 30vya
TYINOZIMOH ¥0d4 Q3033N Y S1H0ddNS TYNOILIAay NIHM





[Mod 3155]
1604.2.8 Interrupted horizontal braces.  Where impediments, other permanently attached obstacles or conditions exist that prevent installation of horizontal braces in accordance with Section 1604.2.2 by preventing the installation of a single continuous horizontal braces then horizontal braces shall be permitted to be interrupted using the methods shown in Figure 1604.2.8(1), Figure 1604.2.8(2), and Figure 1604.2.8(3).  For interruptions that occur in the attic framing space closest to the gable end, nine 3 inch fasteners shall be used to connect each section of the interrupted horizontal braces.  For interruptions that occur in the second attic space from the gable end, six 3 inch fasteners shall be used to connect each section of the interrupted horizontal braces.  For interruptions that occur in the attic framing space farthest from the gable end, three 3 inch fasteners shall be used to connect each section of the interrupted horizontal braces.  Horizontal braces shall be continued far enough to allow connections to three existing roof framing members as shown in Figure 1604.2.8(1), Figure 1604.2.8(2), or Figure 1604.2.8(3).  Fasteners shall be spaced in accordance with Section 1604.3.6.  Lumber members used to form horizontal braces shall be the same width and depth as required for an un-interrupted member.  
[image: image13.emf]
[image: image14.emf]
[image: image15.emf]
All fasteners 3”

1604.2.9 Piggyback trusses. Piggyback trusses (trusses composed of two members one above the other) shall be permitted to be retrofitted if either of the following cases is true.  1. The existing studs in both the upper truss and the lower truss to which wall sheathing, panel siding, or other wall facade are attached are sufficiently in line that retrofit studs can be installed and connections made between the two with retrofit stud(s).  2. The same as condition 1 except the studs in the upper truss are not sufficiently in line with ones below and the existing studs in the upper truss are 3 feet or shorter.  For condition 1 both the lower stud and the upper stud shall be retrofitted using the methods of Section 1604.2.  For condition two the retrofit stud shall be connected to the lower studs using the methods of Section 1604.2 and be continuous from the bottom horizontal brace to the top horizontal brace.  No connection is required between the retrofit stud and the upper stud.  In both conditions the bottom chord of the piggy back truss section shall be fastened to each retrofit stud using a connector with minimum axial capacity of 175 pounds.  
[Mod 3156]

1604.3 Retrofit Studs.  Retrofit studs shall be installed in accordance with Section 1604.3.1 and using one of the five methods of Sections 1604.3.2, 1604.3.3, 1604.3.4, 1604.3.5, or 1604.3.6.  Figure 1604.3 shows these methods of installation.  For the Retrofit Configuration derived from Table 1604.2 the size of retrofit studs shall be as indicated in Table 1604.4.1 or Table 1604.4.2.  Retrofit studs shall extend from the top of the lower horizontal brace to the bottom of the upper horizontal brace except that a maximum gap of 1/8 inch is allowed at the bottom and ½ inch at the top.  Where wall sheathing, panel siding, or other wall façade is fastened to gable end studs not manufactured into a truss, i.e. are field installed, retrofit studs shall be applied to those field installed studs in accordance with Section 1604.2.1.  
[image: image16.png]FIGURE 1604.3
METHODS OF INSTALLING RETROFIT STUDS

TRUSS FRAMING CONVENTIONAL FRAMING
PLAN VIEWS PLAN VIEWS

STUD FACES PERPENDICULAR TO WALL STUD FACES PARALLEL TO WALL

EXTERIOR

EXTERIOR
WALL

EXTERIOR
WALL

WALL

METHOD #1: FACE TO EDGE OR TO FACE METHOD OF 1604.3.2
MINIMUM 1-1/2" PENETRATION OF FASTENER INTO SECONDARY MEMBER

EXTERIOR
WALL

METHOD #2: FACE TO OFFSET FACE METHOD OF 1604.3.3
MINIMUM 1-1/2" PENETRATION OF FASTENER INTO SECONDARY MEMBER

14 x
O )
o o
i i !
& L <
1l UJE

NAIL PLATE \ NAIL PLATE

METH¢D #4 BUTTED RETROFIT STUD METHOD OF 1604.3.4
MINIMUM 1-1/4" PENETRATION OF FASTENER INTO LUMBER

EXTERIOR
WALL

NAIL PLATE

METHOD #4: OFFSET RETROFIT STUD METHOD OF 1604.3.5
MINIMYM 1-1/4" PENETRATION OF FASTENER INTO LUMBER

CAN BE M

EXTERIOR

WALL
EXTERIOR
WALL

METHOD #5: NAILER WITH RETROFIT STUD METHOD OF 1604.3.6

MINIMUM 1-1/2" PENETRATION OF FASTENER INTO SECONDARY MEMBER

THE FIGURES DO NOT REFLECT THE NUMBER OF REQUIRED FASTENERS OR SHOW HORIZONTAL BRACES OR STRAPS.
FASTENERS SHALL BE PLACED MAXIMUM 6" ON CENTER AND A MINIMUM OF 2-1/2" FROM ENDS.

3" FASTENERS CAN BE INSTALLED FROM EITHER SIDE OF LUMBER AS LONG AS THERE IS 1-1/2" FASTENER PENETRATION
ES INDICATES AN EXISTING STUD. RS INDICATES A RETROFIT STUD. N INDICATES A NAILER.





[Mod 3158]

1604.3.1  Fastening.  Where nail plates are not used, retrofit studs shall be attached to existing studs using 3 inch fasteners at a maximum of 6 inches on center but no closer than 2-1/2 inches on center with fasteners no closer to ends of members than 2-1/2” inches.  
1604.3.2  Method #1: Face to edge or to face method.  Retrofit studs shall be installed immediately adjacent to existing (Section 1604.2) gable end wall studs as indicated in Figure 1604.3(a).  The retrofit studs shall overlap the edge or side of the existing stud by a minimum of 1-1/4 inches.  Fasteners shall be installed as specified in Section 1604.3.1.  
1604.3.3  Method #2: Face to face offset method.  Retrofit studs shall be installed against the face of existing studs as indicated in Figure 1604.3(b) such that the faces overlap a minimum of 1-1/2 inch and the edge distance to fasteners is no less than ¾ inch.  Fasteners shall be installed as specified in Section 1604.3.1.
1604.3.4  Method #3: Butted retrofit stud method.  Provided that all of the following fastening conditions are met retrofit studs shall be permitted to be butted by edge or face to existing studs with the addition of nail plates as indicated in Figure 1604.3(c) and Figure 1604.3.4. 
1. The 1-1/2 inch edge of retrofit studs shall be installed against the 1-1/2 inch or the broad face of existing studs.

2. A minimum of two nail plates shall be used.

3. Fasteners used to secure nail plates to studs shall be a minimum 1-1/4 inch long (#8 wood screws or 8d nails).
4. Fasteners placed in nail plates shall be a minimum of 2-1/2 inches along the length of lumber.  A fastener shall be placed in nail plates a maximum of 6 inches from the ends of the shorter stud.

5. Fasteners shall be placed a minimum of ½ inches from the edges of studs.  Fasteners shall be placed a maximum of 1-1/2 inches from the abutting vertical edges of existing studs and retrofit studs.

6. There shall be at least 3 fasteners through nail plates into all existing and retrofit studs to which it is attached.

7. Where there are 3 fasteners through nail plates onto a single existing or retrofit stud then nail plates shall be spaced a maximum of 15 inches on center.  
8. Where there are more than 3 fasteners though nail plates onto a single existing or retrofit stud then nail plates shall be spaced a maximum of 20 inches on center.  
9. In line fasteners used to secure nail plates shall be spaced vertically a minimum of 1-1/2 inches on center.  Staggered fasteners used to secure nail plates shall be spaced horizontally a minimum of ½ inches. 

1604.3.5 Method #4: Offset retrofit stud method.   Where retrofit studs are placed as indicated on Figure 1604.3(d) retrofit studs may be offset from existing studs by use of nail plates such that the vertical corner of a retrofit stud shall be placed at the vertical corner of an existing stud as indicated in Figure 1604.3(d) and Figure 1604.3.4 provided the fastening conditions of Section 1604.3.4 are met.  
1604.3.6 Method #5: Nailer with retrofit stud method.  Retrofit studs and existing studs shall be permitted to be connected using non-continuous 2x4 nailers as indicated in Figure 1604.3(e) provided the following conditions are met.

1. Both the existing stud and the retrofit stud shall be butted to nailers and both shall be fastened to the nailer with 3 inch long fasteners (#8 wood screws or 8d nails).  Fasteners connecting each stud to the nailer shall be a spaced 6 inches o.c.
2. Fasteners into nailers from any direction shall be offset vertically by a minimum of 2-1/2 inches.

3. Fasteners into nailers shall be a minimum of 2-1/2 inches but not more than 6 inches from the end of the shorter of the existing stud and retrofit stud to which they are fastened.  

1604.3.7 Reduced size of retrofit studs.  Retrofit studs may be reduced in size by notching, tapering, or other methods at any number of locations along their length provided that all of the following conditions are met. 
1. Retrofit stud to be notched shall be sized such that the remaining minimum depth of member at the location of the notch (including cross cut kerfs) shall not be less than that required by Table 1604.4.1 or Table 1604.4.2. 

2. Notched retrofit stud shall not be spliced within 12 inches of the location of notches.  Splice members shall not be notched.  

3. The vertical extent of notches shall not exceed 12 inches as measured at the depth of notches. 

4. Notched retrofit stud member shall be fastened to the side of the existing gable end wall studs in accordance with Section 1604.3.1.  Two additional 3 inch fasteners (#8 wood screws or 10d nails) shall be installed on each side of notches in addition to those required by Section 1604.3.1. 

[Mod 3158 and comment 1]

[image: image17.png]FIGURE 1604.3.4
NAIL PLATE FASTENING

ELEVATION VIEW
1. MINIMUM OF TWO PLATES VERTICALLY
CONNECTING THE TWO STUDS |

12. NAIL PLATE

3. THE CLOSEST FASTENER SHALL BE
A MINIMUM OF 2-1/2" AND
A MAXIMUM OF 6" FROM
THE END OF THE SHORTER OF
THE EXISTING ORRETROFIT ——— |
STUDS. ™

RETROFIT STUD
EXISTING STUD

4. FASTENERS ON EXISTING STUD SHALL BE
A MINIMUM OF 1/2" FROM EITHER EDGE.

5. A SET OF FASTENERS SHALL
BE A MINIMUM OF 1/2" FROM
THE EDGE NEAREST THE —__
EXISTING STUD AND

A MAXIMUM OF 1-1/4" ~—_
FROM THE EDGE OF THE

RETROFIT STUD NEAREST .
THE EXISTING STUD.  —

SEE NOTE BELOW. T

6. IN LINE FASTENERS SHALL BE SPACED
VERTICALLY A MINIMUM OF 1-1/2"

ON CENTER.
IN LINE FASTENERS SHALL BE SPACED

HORIZONTALLY A MINIMUM OF 1/2"
AND A MINIMUM OF 2-1/2". —

EXTERIOR WALL

7. THE DISTANCE BETWEEN
FASTENERS ON PLATES SHALL
BE A MAXIMUM OF 20"

ON CENTER. —

—
—

8. FASTENERS SHALL BE MINIMUM \\\
—

1-1/4" LONG (#8 WOOD —
SCREWS OR 8D NAILS) T —
—

STUD SIZES MAY DIFFER FROM THOSE SHOWN.
DIAGONAL HATCHES INDICATE ALLOWABLE LATERAL RANGE

FOR FASTENERS
THE RELATIONSHIP BETWEEN STUDS AND PLATES WILL VARY

ACCCORDING TO THE PARTICULARS OF THE METHOD USED.

(FACE)
EXISTING STUD
(EDGE OR FACE)

RETROFIT STUD





[Mod 3158 comment1]

1604.3.8 Retrofit stud splices.  Retrofit studs greater than 8 feet in height may be field spliced in accordance with Figure 1604.3.8. 
[image: image18.png]ELEVATION VIEW SECTION VIEW
REQUIRED

T CONNECTION TO =
HORIZONTAL BRACE \-\=
E
EXISTING GABLE END STUD s | P
e
REQUIRED 2 RETROFIT- J
STUD W/ 3" LONG \
FASTENERS @ 6" 0.C. il
° .
| »
A %" MIN.
g ] 4
4 il i
E . ols
g 11 8 |
g J
—_ 3 s olg
& ull LV g
& 50" LONG SPLICE MEMBER bt
g - (MATCH SIZE OF RETROFIT STUD) 4
= —~CENTER ON SPLICE LOCATION s i
L el
] INSTALL MINIMUM (27) 3" LONG e
FASTENERS FROM SPLICE MEMBER ¥ e B
T0 RETROFIT STUD (EACH SIDE OF 5 w3 =
SPLICE LOCATION) i o
53
gui ol B
s w1y gy
S E
|« 7
Gy
8
REQUIRED
CONNECTION TO |
HORIZONTAL BRACE \\E
al—— | 1
NOTE:

SPLICE LOCATION MAY BE REQUIRED AT TOP OF GABLE END STUD IF HEIGHT > 11'-0" T0 12'-0"

FIGURE 1604.3.8 DETAIL OF RETROFIT STUD SPLICE





1604.4 Connection between horizontal braces and retrofit studs.  Connections between horizontal braces and retrofit studs shall comply with Section 1604.4.1 or Section 1604.4.2.  Each retrofit stud shall be connected to the top and bottom horizontal brace members with a minimum of a 20 gauge 1-1/4 inch wide flat or coil metal strap with pre-punched holes for fasteners.  Straps shall be fastened with 1-1/4 inch long fasteners (#8 wood screws or 8d nails) with the number of fasteners as indicated on Table 1604.4.1 and Table 1604.4.2.  Fasteners shall be no closer to the end of lumber than 2-1/2 inches. 
1604.4.1  L-bent strap method.  Retrofit studs shall be connected to horizontal braces or to strong backs in accordance with Figure 1604.2(1), Figure 1604.2(2), or Figure 1604.2.3, and shall comply with the following conditions.

1.
Straps:  A strap shall be applied to the edges of a retrofit stud nearest the gable end wall and to the face of horizontal braces using at each end of the straps the number of fasteners specified in Table 1604.4.1.  Straps shall be long enough so that each strap extends sufficient distance onto the vertical face of the retrofit stud that the fastener closest to the ends of the studs is a minimum of 2-1/2 inches from the end of the stud.  Straps shall be allowed to be twisted to accommodate the transition between the tops of retrofit studs and horizontal bracings following roof pitches.

2.
Compression Blocks:  Compression blocks shall be installed on the horizontal braces directly against either the existing vertical gable end wall stud or the retrofit stud.  Figure 1604.2(1) (trusses) and Figure 1604.2(2) (conventionally framed) show the installation of the compression block against the existing vertical gable end wall stud with the strap from the retrofit stud running beside the compression block.  Compression blocks shall be allowed to be placed over straps.  Compression blocks shall be fastened to the horizontal braces with at least the minimum number of 3 inch long fasteners (#8 wood screws or 10d nails) specified in Table 1604.4.1. End and edge distances for fasteners shall be in accordance with Section 1603.6.3. 
TABLE 1604.4.1

ELEMENT SIZING AND SPACING FOR L-BENT RETROFIT METHOD
	
	Retrofit
	Retrofit
	Retrofit
	Retrofit

	
	Config.
	Config.
	Config.
	Config.

	Retrofit Elements
	A
	B
	C
	D

	Minimum size and number of
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Horizontal Braces
	2x4
	2x4
	2x4
	2 each  2x4

	Minimum size and number of
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Retrofit Studs
	 2x4
	2x6
	2x8
	2 each  2x8

	Minimum number of fasteners
	 
	 
	 
	 

	connecting each end of
	 
	 
	 
	 

	straps to Retrofit Studs or to
	6
	9
	12
	8 on each

	Horizontal Braces
	 
	 
	 
	strap

	#8 screws or 10d nails 1-1/4" long
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Minimum number of fasteners
	 
	 
	 
	 

	to connect
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Compression Blocks to
	6
	8
	10
	12

	Horizontal Braces
	 
	 
	 
	 

	#8 screws or 10d nails 3" long
	 
	 
	 
	 

	For SI:  1 Inch = 25.4mm, 1 Foot = 304.8mm
	
	
	


1604.4.2  U-bent strap method.  Retrofit studs shall be connected to horizontal braces in accordance with Figure 1604.2(3) or Figure 1604.2(4), shall be limited to Retrofit Configurations A and B (Table 1604.4.2), and shall comply with the following conditions.

1. Straps of sufficient length to meet the requirements for the number of fasteners in accordance with Table 1604.4.2 and meet the end distance requirements of Section 1603.6.3 shall be shaped around retrofit studs and fastened to the edges of horizontal braces.  Straps shall wrap the back edge of the retrofit stud snuggly with a maximum gap of ¼ inches.  Rounded bends of straps shall be allowed.  One fastener shall be installed that connects each strap to the side of the associated retrofit stud. 

2. The horizontal brace shall butt snugly against the retrofit stud with a maximum gap of ¼ inches.

3. Straps shall be allowed to be twisted to accommodate the transition between the tops of retrofit studs and horizontal braces that follow the roof pitch.
TABLE 1604.4.2

ELEMENT SIZING AND SPACING FOR U-BENT RETROFIT METHOD
	
	Retrofit
	Retrofit
	Retrofit
	Retrofit

	
	Config.
	Config.
	Config.
	Config.

	Retrofit Elements
	A
	B
	C
	D

	Minimum size and number 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	of Horizontal Braces
	2x4
	2x4
	2x4
	2 each  2x4

	Minimum size and number 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	of Retrofit Studs
	 2x4
	2x6
	2x8
	2 each  2x8

	Minimum number of fasteners
	 
	 
	 
	 

	connecting
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Straps to each edge of
	6
	7
	7
	6 on side of

	Horizontal Braces
	 
	 
	 
	each strap

	#8 screws or 10d nails 1-1/4" long
	 
	 
	 
	 

	For SI:  1 Inch = 25.4mm, 1 Foot = 304.8mm
	
	
	
	


1604.5 Connection of gable end wall to wall below. The bottom chords or bottom members of wood framed gable end walls shall be attached to the wall below using one of the methods prescribed in Sections 1604.5.1 or 1604.5.2.  The particular method chosen shall correspond to the framing system and type of wall construction encountered.  

1604.5.1 Truss gable end wall.  The bottom chords of the gable end wall shall be attached to the wall below using right angle brackets.  A minimum of two fasteners shall be installed into the bottom chord.  The right angle brackets shall be installed throughout the portion of the gable end where the gable end wall height is greater than 3 feet at the spacing specified in Table 1604.5.1.  Connection to the wall below shall be by one of the methods listed below:  
1. For a wood frame wall below, a minimum of two fasteners shall be installed.  The fasteners shall be of the same diameter and style specified by the bracket manufacturer and sufficient length to extend through the double top plate of the wall below. 

2. For a concrete or masonry wall below without a sill plate, the type and number of fasteners into the wall shall be consistent with the bracket manufacturer’s specifications for fasteners installed in concrete or masonry. 
3. For a concrete or masonry wall below with a 2x sill plate, the fasteners into the wall below shall be of the diameter and style specified by the bracket manufacturer for concrete or masonry connections; but, long enough to pass through the wood sill plate and provide the required embedment into the concrete or masonry below.  Alternatively, the bracket can be anchored to the sill plate using 4 each 1-1/2 inch long fasteners of the same type as specified by the bracket manufacturer for wood connections, provided that the sill plate is anchored to the wall on each side of the bracket by a 1/4-inch diameter masonry screw with a 2-3/4 inches of embedment into the concrete or masonry wall.  A ¼ inch washer shall be placed under the heads of the masonry screws.  
	Table 1604.5.1 Spacing of Right Angle Brackets

	
	
	

	Exposure
	Maximum 3-Sec. Gust
	Spacing of

	Category
	Wind Speed - V
	Right Angle

	 
	mph
	Brackets a.

	C
	110
	38-inches

	C
	120
	32-inches

	C
	130
	28-inches

	C
	140
	24-inches

	C
	150
	20-inches

	B
	110
	48-inches

	B
	120
	40-inches

	B
	130
	36-inches

	B
	140
	30-inches

	B
	150
	26-inches

	a.  See Section 1602 1202 for definition of right angle bracket.

 


[Mod 3159 comment 1]
1604.5.2 Conventionally framed gable end wall. Each stud in a conventionally framed gable end wall, throughout the length of the gable end wall where the wall height is greater than 3 feet, shall be attached to the bottom or sill plate using a stud to plate connector with minimum uplift capacity of 175 pounds.  The bottom or sill plate shall then be connected to the wall below using one of the methods listed below:  
1. For a wood frame wall below, the sill or bottom plate shall be connected to the top plate of the wall below using ¼ inch diameter lag bolt fasteners of sufficient length to penetrate the bottom plate of the upper gable end wall and extend through the bottom top plate of the wall below.  A washer sized for the diameter of the lag bolt shall be placed under the head of each lag bolt.  The fasteners shall be installed at the spacing indicated in Table 1604.5.2. 

2. For a concrete or masonry wall below, the sill or bottom plate shall be connected to the concrete or masonry wall below using ¼ inch diameter concrete or masonry screws of sufficient length to provide 2-3/4 inches of embedment into the top of the concrete or masonry wall.  A washer sized for the diameter of the lag bolt shall be placed under the head of each lag bolt.   The fasteners shall be installed at the spacing indicated in Table 1604.5.2.  

	TABLE 1604.5.2 SPACING OF LAG OR MASONRY SCREWS USED TO

	CONNECT SILL PLATE OF GABLE END WALL TO TOP OF THE WALL BELOW

	
	
	

	Exposure
	Maximum 3-Sec. Gust
	Spacing of

	Category
	Wind Speed - V
	Lag Screws or

	 
	mph
	Masonry Screws

	C
	110
	19-inches

	C
	120
	16-inches

	C
	130
	14-inches

	C
	140
	14-inches

	C
	150
	10-inches

	B
	110
	24-inches

	B
	120
	20-inches

	B
	130
	18-inches

	B
	140
	15-inches

	B
	150
	13-inches


[Mod 3159]
PAGE  
2
C:\Documents and Settings\bettys\My Documents\2007 glitch\2007glitch supplement103108\Supplement to the 2007 Florida Building Code exist rev oct08.doc
Last printed 11/13/2008 1:40:00 PM 


[image: image19.emf][image: image20.emf][image: image21.emf][image: image22.emf]