Comments on the 2013 Update to the Florida Building Code to considered by the

Energy TAC
Meeting Date: August 6, 2013

Tracking
ID

Florida Building Code, Energy Conservation
Proposed Changes

Comments

TAC Action

EN 1

Proponent: Staff

Section 553.912, Florida Statutes

553.912 Air conditioners.— All air conditioners that are sold or installed in the state must shall meet the minimum
efficiency ratings of the Florida Building Code-Energy Conservation ErergyEffieieney-CodeforBuilding
Censtraetion. These efficiency ratmgs must s-h-a-l-l be minimums and may be updated in the Florida Building
Code-Energy Conservation Fletid y v-Cod : 3 i by the department in
accordance with s. 553.901, followmg its determmatlon that more cost-effectlve energy-saving equipment and
techniques are available. It is the intent of the Legislature that all replacement air-conditioning systems in
residential applications be installed using energy-saving, quality installation procedures, including, but not
limited to, equipment sizing analysis and duct inspection. Notwithstanding this section, existing heating and
cooling equipment in residential applications need not meet the minimum equipment efficiencies, including

systemsizing and duct sealing.
Section R101.4.7 is changed by HB 269 (passed by the 2013 Florida Legislature) to read as follows:

R101.4.7 Building systems and components. Thermal efficiency standards are set for the following building
systems and components where new products are installed or replaced in existing buildings, and for which a
permit must be obtained. New products shall meet the minimum efficiencies allowed by this code for the
following systems and components:

Heating, ventilating or air conditioning systems;

Service water or pool heating systems;

Lighting systems.

Replacement Fenestration.

RlOl 4 7.1 Exnstmg egylpment efﬁclencles E)ostmg coo]mg and heatmg equipment in resuientlal

applications need not meet the minimum egulpment efficiencies ef—SeeHeﬂ—IBé}}i% mcludlng system
sizing and duct sealing. ep siral-approva 8

Glitch —

(e) Changes to or
inconsistencies
with federal or

state law. HB 269.

Glitch? Yes
Unanimous.

Technical
correction: As
Submitted
Unanimous

EN2

Proponent: Staff
Section R103.1.1 is changed by HB 269 (passed by the 2013 Florida Legislature) to read as
shown:
R103.1.1 Compliance certification.
R103.1.1.1 Code compliance demonstration.
R103.1.1.1.1 Residential. No license or registration is required to prepare the code compliance form for
single-family residential dwellings, duplexes and townhouses.

RI1N 1117 Cammarcial and multinle_familv racidential Camnletinn afnracednrec demnanctratine

Glitch —

(e) Changes to or
inconsistencies
with federal or
state law. HB 269.

Glitch? Yes
Unanimous.

Technical
correction: As
Submitted
Unanimous




A UL ekeaem CUamiiava vass SAis AARAIEPAS ASALIEL] & SUAvALIeE VAL SUSIUAL UL PAvS YUy ity s
compliance with this code for multiple-family residential building shall be in accordance with the
provisions of Section 481.229, Florida Statutes, or Section 471.003, Florida Statutes.

Exceptlon Where HVAC systems are nominal 15 tons per systemor Smaller aﬂ"—eeﬂd»ﬁieﬁmg—ef

eeft-lﬁed—cormnermal bulldmg energy raters cemﬁed in accordance with Sectlon 553 99, Florida
Statutes or as authorized by Florida Statutes. may prepare the code compliance form.

R103.1.1.2 Code compliance certification. The building’s owner, the owner’s architect, or other authorized
agent legally designated by the owner shall certify that the building is in compliance with the code, as per
Section 553.907, Florida Statutes, prior to receiving the permit to begin construction or renovation.

EN3 Proponent: Staff Glitch — Glitch? Yes.
Section R403.2.2 is changed by HB 269 (passed by the 2013 Florida Legislature) to read as (e) Changes to or Unanimous.
shown: inconsistencies
R403.2.2 Sealing (Mandatory). All ducts, air handlers, and filter boxes and building cavities that form | Wwith federal or Technical
the primary air containment passageways for air distribution systems shall be considered ducts or plenum state law. HB 269. correction: As
chambers, shall be constructed and sealed in accordance with Section C403.2.7.2 of the Commercial Provisions of Submitted.
this code and shall be shown to meet duct tightness criteria below. Unanimous
Duct tightness shall be verified by testing to Section 803 of the RESNET Standards by either.an Slass+BERS
energy rater certified in accordance with Section 553.99, Florida Statutes. or as authorized by Florida Statutes
to be “substantially leak free” by either of the following:

1. Postconstruction test: Total leakage shall be less than or equal to 4 cfim (113.3 L/min) per 100 square feet
(9.29 mz) of conditioned floor area when tested at a pressure differential of 0.1 inches w.g. (25 Pa) across the
entire system, including the manufacturer’s air handler enclosure. All register boots shall be taped or
otherwise sealed during the test.

2. Rough-in test: Total leakage shall be less than or equal to 4 cfim (113.3 L/min) per 100 square feet (9.29
n12) of conditioned floor area when tested at a pressure differential of 0.1 inches w.g. (25 Pa) across the
system, including the manufacturer’s air handler enclosure. All registers shall be taped or otherwise sealed
during the test. If the air handler is not installed at the time of the test, total leakage shall be less than or
equal to 3 c¢fim (85 L/min) per 100 square feet (9.29 mz) of conditioned floor area.

Exceptions:

1. The total leakage test is not required for ducts and air handlers located entirely within the building thermal
envelope.

2. Duct testing is not mandatory for buildings complying by Section 405 of this code

EN4 Proponent: Staff General comment — | Glitch? No.

Florida Statutes Cost to the state — | 8Aye/3Nay.
553.907 Compliance.—Each local enforcement agency shall report to the department any information 30K to archive and
concerning compliance certifications and amendments at such intervals as the department designates by rule analyze the data.
adopted in accordance with chapter 120. There has been no
SECTION R110 demand or use for
REPORTING the data that would
oridaBuilding justify
continuation of
this provision.
Reporting
requirements for
commercial
compliance has
been removed from
the code.
Glitch — Conflicts
- within the updated
Gretpt GroupH GroupH: code.
Quartert 12/31 134 2/28
Quarter2 3431 4136 5431
Qusatter3 6436 3+ %131
Quarter4 9130 16134 H/36

ENS Proponent: Staff Glitch — Glitch? Yes.
Section C103.1.1 is changed by HB 269 (passed by the 2013 Florida Legislature) to read as follows: (e) Changes to or Unanimous.
C103.1.1 Compliance certification. inconsistencies

C103.1.1.1 Code compliance demonstration. with federal or Technical
C103.1.1.1.1 Residential. See Florida Building Code, Energy Conservation: Residential Provisions. state law. HB 269. correction: As
C103.1.1.1.2 Commercial and multiple-family residential. Completion of procedures demonstrating Submitted.
compliance with this code for multiple-family residential building shall be in accordance with the Unanimous

provisions of Section 481.229, Florida Statutes, or Section 471.003, Florida Statutes.
Exceptlon Where HVAC systems are<15 tons per system, air condltlonmg or mechamcal contractors




hicensed mn accordance with Chapter 489, Florida dStatutes, or dtate-otHtoridaeerttied commercial

building energy raters certified in accordance with Section 553.99, Florida Statutes, may prepare the

code compliance form.

Design professionals responsible under Florida law for the design of lighting, electrical, mechanical, and

plumbing systems and the building shell, shall certify compliance of those building systems with the

code by signing and providing their professional registration number on the energy code formprovided

as part of the plans and specifications to the building department.
C103.1.1.2 Code compliance certification. The building’s owner, the owner’s architect, or other authorized
agent legally designated by the owner shall certify that the building is in compliance with the code, as per
Section 553.907, Florida Statutes, prior to receiving the permit to begin construction or renovation.

EN6 Proponent: Staff Glitch — Glitch? Yes.
APPENDIX A (both Commercial and Residential code provisions) is changed by SB 1514 and HB 209 (e) Changes to or Unanimous.
(passed by the 2013 Florida Legislature) to read (in part) as shown: inconsistencies
with federal or Technical
BREVARD COUNTY 151000 state law. HB 1514 | correction: As
I and HB 209. Submitted.
EASTERN FLORIDA STATE BREVARBD-COMMUNAY-COLLEGE 152700 I Unanimous
LAKE COUNTY 451000
1T
LAKE SUMTER STATE coMMIMNFY. COLLEGE 452600
I
EN7 Proponent: Jennifer Hatfield Glitch— Glitch? Yes.
Section R101.4.3 is changed to clarify “unintended results from the integration of previously adopted (c)  Unintended | Unanimous.
Florida-specific amendments with the model code” to read as follows: results from the
R101.4.3 Additions, alterations, renovations or repairs. Additions, integration ~ of | Technical
alterations, renovations or repairs to an existing building, building system or portion thereof shall previously cormection: As
. . . . - adopted Florida- | Submitted.
conform to the provisions of this code as they relate to new construction without requiring the specific Unanimous.

unaltered portion(s) of the existing building or building system to comply with this code. Additions,
alterations, renovations or repairs shall not create an unsafe or hazardous condition or overload

existing building systems. An addition shall be deemed to comply with this code if the addition alone

complies or if the existing building and addition comply with this code as a single building.
Exception: The following need not comply provided the energy use of the building is not
increased:
1. Storm windows installed over existing fenestration.
2. Glass only replacements in an existing sash and frame.
3. Surface applied window film on existing fenestration assemblies.

4. Existing ceiling, wall or floor cavities exposed during construction provided that these cavities

are filled with insulation.

5. Construction where the existing roof, wall or floor cavity is not exposed.

6. Reroofing for roofs where neither the sheathing nor the insulation is exposed. Roofs without
insulation in the cavity and where the sheathing or insulation is exposed during reroofing shall be
msulated either above or below the sheathing.

7. Replacement of existing doors that separate conditioned space from the exterior shall not
require the installation of'a vestibule or revolving door, provided, however, that an existing
vestibule that separates a conditioned space from the exterior shall not be removed,

8. Alterations that replace less than 50 percent of the luminaires in a space, provided that such
alterations do not increase the installed interior lighting power.

9. Alterations that replace only the bulb and ballast within the existing luminaires in a space
provided that the alteration does not increase the installed interior lighting power.

10. Swimming pool filtration pumps and motors.

amendments with
the model code.




