Florida Supplement to the 2012 IBC

Note 1:  Throughout the document, change International Building Code to Florida Building Code, Building; change the ICC Electrical Code to Chapter 27 of the Florida Building Code, Building; change the International Energy Conservation Code to the Florida Building Code, Energy Conservation; change the International Existing Building Code to Florida Building Code, Existing Building; change the International Fire code to Florida Fire Prevention Code; change International Fuel Gas Code to Florida Building Code, Fuel Gas; change the International Mechanical Code to Florida Building Code, Mechanical; change the International Plumbing Code to Florida Building Code, Plumbing; change the International Residential Code to Florida Building Code, Residential.

Note 2:  Criteria blocked in yellow indicate Florida specific language from the 2010 FBC. 

Chapter 1, Scope and  Administration
101.4.7 Manufactured buildings.  Add to read as shown.

101.4.7 Manufactured buildings.  For additional administrative and special code requirements, see section 428, Florida Building Code, Building, and Rule 9B-1 F.A.C.
102.2.1 Add to read as shown.

102.2.1 In addition to the requirements of Section 553.79 and 553.80, Florida Statutes, facilities subject to the provisions of Chapter 395, Florida Statutes, and Part II of Chapter 400, Florida Statutes, shall have facility plans reviewed and construction surveyed by the state agency authorized to do so under the requirements of Chapter 395, Florida Statutes, and Part II of Chapter 400, Florida Statutes, and the certification requirements of the federal government.
102.2.3 This section does not apply to the jurisdiction and authority of the Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services to inspect amusement rides or the Department of Financial Services to inspect state-owned buildings and boilers.
102.7 Relocation of manufactured buildings.  Add to read as shown.

102.7 Relocation of manufactured buildings. 

(1)
Relocation of an existing manufactured building does not constitute an alteration.

(2)
A relocated building shall comply with wind speed requirements of the new location, using the appropriate wind speed map.  If the existing building was manufactured in compliance with the Standard Building Code (prior to March 1, 2002), the wind speed map of the Standard Building Code shall be applicable. If the existing building was manufactured in compliance with the Florida Building Code (after March 1, 2002), the wind speed map of the Florida Building Code shall be applicable.
105.1.3 Food permits.  Add to read as shown.

105.1.3 Food permit.  As per Section 500.12, Florida Statutes, a food permit from the Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services is required of any person who operates a food establishment or retail store.
105.3.1.1 Add text to read as shown.

105.3.1.1  If a state university, Florida college or public school district elects to use a local government’s code enforcement offices, fees charged by counties and municipalities for enforcement of the Florida Building Code on buildings, structures, and facilities of state universities, state colleges, and public school districts shall not be more than the actual labor and administrative costs incurred for plans review and inspections to ensure compliance with the code.
105.3.3 Applicable Code for Manufactured Buildings. Manufacturers should be permitted to complete all buildings designed and approved prior to the effective date of a new code edition, provided a clear signed contract is in place. The contract shall provide specific data mirroring that required by an application for permit, specifically, without limitation, date of execution, building owner or dealer, and anticipated date of completion. However, the construction activity must commence within 6 months of the contract's execution. The contract is subject to verification by the Department of Community Affairs.
105.3.4 Asbestos removal.  Add text to read as shown.

105.3.4 Asbestos removal.  Moving, removal or disposal of asbestos-containing materials on a residential building where the owner occupies the building, the building is not for sale or lease, and the work is performed according to the owner-builder limitations provided in this paragraph. To qualify for exemption under this paragraph, an owner must personally appear and sign the building permit application. The permitting agency shall provide the person with a disclosure statement in substantially the following form:
Disclosure Statement: State law requires asbestos abatement to be done by licensed contractors. You have applied for a permit under an exemption to that law. The exemption allows you, as the owner of your property, to act as your own asbestos abatement contractor even though you do not have a license. You must supervise the construction yourself. You may move, remove or dispose of asbestos-containing materials on a residential building where you occupy the building and the building is not for sale or lease, or the building is a farm outbuilding on your property.  If you sell or lease such building within 1 year after the asbestos abatement is complete, the law will presume that you intended to sell or lease the property at the time the work was done, which is a violation of this exemption.  You may not hire an unlicensed person as your contractor.  Your work must be done according to all local, state and federal laws and regulations which apply to asbestos abatement projects.  It is your responsibility to make sure that people employed by you have licenses required by state law and by county or municipal licensing ordinances.
105.8  Asbestos.  Add text to read as shown.
105.8 Asbestos.  The enforcing agency shall require each building permit for the demolition or renovation of an existing structure to contain an asbestos notification statement which indicates the owner’s or operator’s responsibility to comply with the provisions of Section 469.003, Florida Statutes, and to notify the Department of Environmental Protection of his or her intentions to remove asbestos, when applicable, in accordance with state and federal law.
105.9 Certificate of protective treatment for prevention of termites.  Add text to read as shown.
105.9 Certificate of protective treatment for prevention of termites.   A weather-resistant job-site posting board shall be provided to receive duplicate treatment certificates as each required protective treatment is completed, providing a copy for the person the permit is issued to and another copy for the building permit files. The treatment certificate shall provide the product used, identity of the applicator, time and date of the treatment, site location, area treated, chemical used, percent concentration and number of gallons used, to establish a verifiable record of protective treatment. If the soil chemical barrier method for termite prevention is used, final exterior treatment shall be completed prior to final building approval.
105.10 Notice of termite protection.  Add text to read as shown.
105.10 Notice of termite protection.  A permanent sign which identifies the termite treatment provider and need for reinspection and treatment contract renewal shall be provided. The sign shall be posted near the water heater or electric panel.
107.3 Examination of documents.  Change to read as shown.

107.3 Examination of documents.  The building official shall examine or cause to be examined the accompanying submittal documents and shall ascertain by such examinations whether the construction indicated and described is in accordance with the requirements of this code and other pertinent laws or ordinances.

Exception:

1.
Building plans approved pursuant to Section 553.77(5), Florida Statutes, and state-approved manufactured buildings are exempt from local codes enforcing agency plan reviews except for provisions of the code relating to erection, assembly or construction at the site. Erection, assembly and construction at the site are subject to local permitting and inspections.  Photocopies of plans approved according to FAC 9B-1.009, F.A.C., shall be sufficient for local permit application documents of record for the modular building portion of the permitted project. 
Add section 110.3.11 Termites to read as follows

110.3.11 Termites.  Building components and building surroundings required to be protected from termite damage in accordance with Section 1503.6, Section 2304.13 or Section 2304.11.6, specifically required to be inspected for termites in accordance with Section 2114, or required to have chemical soil treatment in accordance with Section 1816 shall not be covered or concealed until the release from the building official has been received.
Chapter 2 Definitions

Add to read as shown.

BURIAL CHAMBER MAUSOLEUM. A family mausoleum consisting of 6 or fewer casket placement crypts plus a chamber to be used for loading of caskets from the interior of the mausoleum which is not below the level of the ground and which is substantially exposed above ground.
Add to read as shown.

CHAPEL MAUSOLEUM. A mausoleum for the public that has heat or air conditioning, with or without a committal area or office.

Add to read as shown.

COLUMBARIUM. A permanent structure consisting of niches.
Add to read as shown.

COMMISSION. The Florida Building Commission.

Add to read as shown.

COMPANION CRYPT. A permanent chamber in a mausoleum for the containment of human remains of more than one individual.

Add to read as shown.

CRYPT. A permanent chamber in a mausoleum for the containment of human remains.
Add to read as shown.

State enforcement agency. Means the agency of state government with authority to make inspections of buildings and to enforce the codes, as required by this part, which establish standards for design, construction, erection, alteration, repair, modification or demolition of public or private buildings, structures or facilities.

Add to read as shown.

Family mausoleum.  A mausoleum for the private use of a family or group of family members.

Add to read as shown.

GARDEN MAUSOLEUM. A mausoleum for the public built without heat or air conditioning but may contain an open-air committal area.

Add to read as shown.

HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE. This zone consists of Broward and Dade counties.

Change to read as shown.

HISTORIC BUILDINGS. Buildings that are listed in or eligible for listing in the National Register of Historic Places, or designated as historic under an appropriate state or local law (see Chapter 12 of the Florida Existing Building Code).

Add to read as shown.

MAUSOLEUM. A permanent structure or building which is substantially exposed above the ground and is intended for the interment, entombment, or inurnment of human remains.

Add to read as shown.

Niche.  A permanent chamber in a columbarium or mausoleum to hold the cremated remains of one or more individuals.

Add to read as shown.

NON-VISITATION CRYPT MAUSOLEUM. A mausoleum for the public where the crypts are not accessible to the public.

Add to read as shown.

Registered termiticide.  Product listed as registered for use as a preventative treatment for termites for new construction by the Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services under authority of Chapter 487, Florida Statutes.

Chapter 3, Use and Occupancy Classification

Section 304 Business Group B

304.3 and 304.4 Add to read as shown.

304.3 Public and private colleges and universities shall comply with Section 443.
 304.4 Florida colleges shall comply with Section 423.
Section 305 Educational Group E

305.3 and 305.4 add to read as shown.

305.3  Public and private educational occupancies shall comply with Section 443.

305.4 Public education occupancies shall comply with Section 423.
Chapter 5  General Building Heights and Areas
507.10 Group E buildings, Item 1.  Change to read as shown.

507. 10 Group E buildings.  The area …..

1.
Each classroom shall have not less than two means of egress, with one of the means of egress being a direct exit to the outside of the building complying with Section 1020 or the building is provided with smoke barriers having a minimum 1-hour fire-resistance rating dividing the building into areas not to exceed 30,000 square feet (2,787 m2) in floor area.
2 – 3 no change.


Chapter 8 Interior Finishes – No Change
Chapter 9 Fire Protection Systems
Section 903 Automatic Sprinkler Systems

903.2.3 Group E.  Change to read as shown.  

903.2. 3 Group E.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E occupancies as follows:

1 – 2 No change


Exception: An automatic fire sprinkler system is not required in existing educational buildings unless 50 percent of the aggregate area of the building is being remodeled.
Chapter 10 Means of Egress – No changes
CHAPTER 11 Accessibility
SECTION 1101 GENERAL 

Revise 1101.1 Scope to read as follows: 

1101.1 Scope. This chapter governs the design and construction of buildings for accessibility. 
1101.1.1 Criteria. 

Buildings shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the Florida Building Code, Accessibility. 

The remaining text is reserved.

Chapter 12 Interior Environment –No change

Chapter 13 Energy Efficiency

Revise 1301.1.1 Criteria, to read as follows:

1301.1.1 Criteria. Buildings shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the Florida Building Code, Energy Conservation
Chapter 14 Exterior Walls

Section 1401 General

1401.1 Scope.  Change to read as shown.
1401.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter shall establish the minimum requirements for exterior walls, exterior wall coverings, exterior wall openings, exterior windows and doors, architectural trim, balconies and similar projections; and bay and oriel windows. 

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Sections 1403.8 and 1410.
1403.8.  Add to read as shown.

1403.7  In order to provide for inspection for termite infestation, clearance between exterior wall coverings and final earth grade on the exterior of a building shall not be less than 6 inches (152 mm).

Exceptions:

1.
Paint or decorative cementitious finish less than 5/8 inch (17.1 mm) thick adhered directly to the masonry foundation sidewall. 

2.
Access or vehicle ramps which rise to the interior finish floor elevation for the width of such ramps only. 

3.
A 4-inch (102 mm) inspection space above patio and garage slabs and entry areas. 

4.
If the patio has been soil treated for termites, the finish elevation may match the building interior finish floor elevations on masonry construction only. 

5.
Masonry veneers constructed in accordance with Section 2114.2.
Chapter 15 Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures

Section 1501 General.  

1501.1 Scope.  Change to read as shown.

1501.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter shall govern the design, materials, construction and quality of roof assemblies, and rooftop structures. 

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Section 1503.6 and Sections 1512 through 1525.
1503.7 Protection against decay and termites.  Add to read as shown.

1503.7 Protection against decay and termites.  Condensate lines and roof downspouts shall discharge at least 1 foot (305 mm) away from the structure sidewall, whether by underground piping, tail extensions, or splash blocks. Gutters with downspouts are required on all buildings with eaves of less than 6 inches (152 mm) horizontal projection except for gable end rakes or on a roof above another roof.
Chapter 16 Structural Design

Section 1601 General

1601.1 Scope.  Change to read as shown.
1601.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter shall govern the structural design of buildings, structures and portions thereof regulated by this code.

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Sections 1615 through 1626.
Chapter 17 Special Inspection and Tests – No change
Chapter 18 Soils and Foundations

Section 1801 General

1801.1 Scope.  Change to read as shown.
1801.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter shall apply to building and foundation systems. 

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Section 1805, and Sections 1816 through 1834.
1816.1 Termite protection.  Add to read as shown.
1816.1 Termite protection.  Termite protection shall be provided by registered termiticides, including soil applied pesticides, baiting systems, and pesticides applied to wood, or other approved methods of termite protection labeled for use as a preventative treatment to new construction. See Section 202, Registered Termiticide. Upon completion of the application of the termite protective treatment, a certificate of compliance shall be issued to the building department by the licensed pest control company that contains the following statement: “The building has received a complete treatment for the prevention of subterranean termites. Treatment is in accordance with rules and laws established by the Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services.”
1816.1.1 If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite prevention, the initial chemical soil treatment inside the foundation perimeter shall be done after all excavation, backfilling and compaction is complete.
1816.1.2 If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite prevention, soil area disturbed after initial chemical soil treatment shall be retreated with a chemical soil treatment, including spaces boxed or formed.
1816.1.3 If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite prevention, space in concrete floors boxed out or formed for the subsequent installation of plumbing traps, drains or any other purpose shall be created by using plastic or metal permanently placed forms of sufficient depth to eliminate any planned soil disturbance after initial chemical soil treatment.
1816.1.4 If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite prevention, chemically treated soil shall be protected with a minimum 6 millimeter vapor retarder to protect against rainfall dilution. If rainfall occurs before vapor retarder placement, retreatment is required. Any work, including placement of reinforcing steel, done after chemical treatment until the concrete floor is poured, shall be done in such manner as to avoid penetrating or disturbing treated soil.
1816.1.5 If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite prevention, concrete overpour or mortar accumulated along the exterior foundation perimeter shall be removed prior to exterior chemical soil treatment, to enhance vertical penetration of the chemicals.
1816.1.6 If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite prevention, chemical soil treatments shall also be applied under all exterior concrete or grade within 1 foot (305 mm) of the primary structure sidewalls. Also, a vertical chemical barrier shall be applied promptly after construction is completed, including initial landscaping and irrigation/sprinkler installation. Any soil disturbed after the chemical vertical barrier is applied shall be promptly retreated.
1816.1.7 If a registered termiticide formulated and registered as a bait system is used for subterranean termite prevention, Sections 1816.1.1 through 1816.1.6 do not apply; however, a signed contract assuring the installation, maintenance and monitoring of the baiting system for a minimum of five years from the issue of the certificate of occupancy shall be provided to the building official prior to the pouring of the slab, and the system must be installed prior to final building approval. If the baiting system directions for use require a monitoring phase prior to installation of the pesticide active ingredient, the installation of the monitoring phase components shall be deemed to constitute installation of the system.
1816.1.8   If a registered termiticide formulated and registered as a wood treatment is used for subterranean termite prevention, Sections 1816.1.1 through 1816.1.6 do not apply.  Application of a wood treatment termiticide shall be as required by label directions for use, and must be completed prior to final building approval.  Changes in framing or additions to  framing in areas of the structure requiring treatment that occur after the initial wood treatment must be treated prior to final building approval.  
Section 1816.2 Penetration, add text to read as follows:

1816.2 Penetration. Protective sleeves around piping penetrating concrete slab-on-grade floors shall not be of cellulose-containing materials. If soil treatment is used for subterranean termite protection, the sleeve shall have a maximum wall thickness of 0.010 inch, and be sealed within the slab using a non-corrosive clamping device to eliminate the annular space between the pipe and the sleeve. No termiticides shall be applied inside the sleeve.
Chapter 19 Concrete

Section 1901 General

1901.1 Scope.  Change to read as shown.

1901.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter shall govern the materials, quality control, design and construction of concrete used in structures.

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Sections 1917 and 1919 through 1929.
Chapter 20  Aluminum.
2001.1 Scope. This chapter shall govern the quality, design, fabrication and erection of aluminum.

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Section 2003.
Chapter 21 Masonry

Section 2101 General

2101.1 Scope.  Change to read as shown.

2101.1 Scope.  This chapter shall govern the materials, design, construction and quality of masonry.

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Sections 2114 and Sections 2118 through 2122. 
Section 2114 TERMITE INSPECTION.  Add to read as shown.

Section 2114 TERMITE INSPECTION

2114.1 Cleaning.   Add to read as shown.

2114.1 Cleaning.  Cells and cavities in masonry units and air gaps between brick, stone or masonry veneers and the structure shall be cleaned of all nonpreservative treated or nonnaturally durable wood, or other cellulose-containing material prior to concrete placement.

Exception: Inorganic material manufactured for closing cells in foundation concrete masonry unit construction or clean earth fill placed in concrete masonry unit voids below slab level before termite treatment is performed.
2114.2 Concrete bearing ledge.  Add to read as shown.
2114.2 Concrete bearing ledge.  Brick, stone or other veneer shall be supported by a concrete bearing ledge at least equal to the total thickness of the brick, stone or other veneer, which is poured integrally with the concrete foundation. No supplemental concrete foundation pours which will create a hidden cold joint shall be used without supplemental treatment in the foundation unless there is an approved physical barrier. An approved physical barrier shall also be installed from below the wall sill plate or first block course horizontally to embed in a mortar joint. If masonry veneer extends below grade, a termite protective treatment must be applied to the cavity created between the veneer and the foundation, in lieu of a physical barrier.

Exception: Veneer supported by a shelf, angle or lintel secured to the foundation sidewall in accordance with TMS 402/ ACI 530/ASCE 5 /TMS 402, provided at least a 6-inch (152 mm) clear inspection space of the foundation sidewall exterior exist between the veneer and the top of any soil, sod, mulch or other organic landscaping component, deck, apron, porch, walk or any other work immediately adjacent to or adjoining the structure. 

Chapter 22 Steel

Section 2201 General

2201.1 Scope.  Change to read as shown.
2201.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter govern the quality, design, fabrication and erection of steel used structurally in buildings or structures.
Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provision of 2214 through 2224.
Chapter 23 Wood

Section 2301 General

2301.1 Scope.  Change to read as shown.

2301.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter shall govern the materials, design, construction and quality of wood members and their fasteners.
Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Sections 2314 through 2330.
2304.11.10 Foam-plastic insulation.  Add to read as shown.

2304.11.10 Foam-plastic insulation.

2304.11.10.1 Add to read as shown.

2304.11.10.1  The provisions of Section 2603. 9 shall apply to the installation of foam plastic insulation in close proximity to the ground.

Exception: Materials which are of naturally durable wood or are pressure treated for ground contact, and which are installed with at least 6 inches (152 mm) clear space from the structure to allow for inspection and treatment for termites.

In order to reduce chances of termite infestation, no wood, vegetation, stumps, dead roots, cardboard, trash, or other cellulose-containing material shall be buried on the building lot within 15 feet (4.6 m) of any building or the position of any building proposed to be built.
2304.13 Preparation of building site and removal of debris.  Add to read as shown.

2304.13  Preparation of building site and removal of debris.

2304.13.1 Add to read as shown.

2304.13.1 All building sites shall be graded to provide drainage under all portions of the building not occupied by basements.

2304.13.2 Add to read as shown.

2304.13.2  The foundation and the area encompassed within 1 foot (305 mm) therein shall have all vegetation, stumps, dead roots, cardboard, trash, and foreign material removed and the fill material shall be free of vegetation and foreign material. The fill shall be compacted to assure adequate support of the foundation.

2304.13.3 Add to read as shown.

2304.13.3  After all work is completed, loose wood and debris shall be completely removed from under the building and within 1 foot (305 mm) thereof. All wood forms and supports shall be completely removed. This includes, but is not limited to: wooden grade stakes, forms, contraction spacers, tub trap boxes, plumbing supports, bracing, shoring, forms, or other cellulose-containing material placed in any location where such materials are not clearly visible and readily removable prior to completion of the work. Wood shall not be stored in contact with the ground under any building.
Chapter 24 Glass and Glazing

Section 2401 General.

2401.1. Scope.  Change to read as shown.

2401.1 Scope.  The provisions of this chapter shall govern the materials, design, construction and quality of glass, light-transmitting ceramic and light-transmitting plastic panels for exterior and interior use in both vertical and sloped applications in buildings and structures. 
Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Sections 2410 through 2415.
Chapter 25 Gypsum Board and Plaster

Section 2501 General

2501.1.1 General.  Change to read as shown.
2501.1.1 General.  Provisions of this chapter shall govern the materials, design, construction and quality of gypsum board, lath, gypsum plaster and cement plaster.
Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Sections 2514 through 2520.
Chapter 26 Plastic

Section 2601 General

Section 2601.1 Scope, revise text to read as follows:

2601.1 Scope. These provisions shall govern the materials, design, application, construction and installation of foam plastic, foam plastic insulation, plastic veneer, interior plastic finish and trim and light-transmitting plastics. See Chapter 14 for requirements for exterior wall finish and trim.

Exception: Buildings and structures located within the high-velocity hurricane zone shall comply with the provisions of Sections 2603.8 and 2612.
2603.8 Protection from termite damage.  Change to read as shown.

2603.8 Protection against termites.

2603.8 Protection against termites. In Florida areas where the probability of termite infestation is very heavy in accordance with Figure 2603.9, extruded and expanded polystyrene, polyisocyanurate and other foam plastics shall not be installed on the exterior face or under interior or exterior foundation walls or slab foundations located below grade. The clearance between foam plastics installed above grade and exposed earth shall be at least 6 inches (152 mm).

Exceptions:
1. Buildings where the structural members of walls, floors, ceilings and roofs are entirely of noncombustible materials or preservative-treated wood.

2. An approved method of protecting the foam plastic and structure from subterranean termite damage is provided.

3. On the interior side of basement walls.

 
Chapter 27 Electrical – No change
Chapter 28 Mechanical Systems – No change.

Chapter 29 Plumbing Systems – No change.
Chapter 30 Elevators and Conveying Systems

Section 3001 General

3001.1 Scope.  Change to read as shown.
3001.1 Scope. This chapter governs the design, construction, installation, alteration, and repair and maintenance of elevators and conveying systems and their components.

Note: Other administrative and programmatic provisions may apply. See the Department of Business and Professional Regulation [DBPR] Chapter 399, Florida Statutes, and 61C-5, Florida Administrative Code. The regulation and enforcement of the following sections of the adopted codes, and their addenda, are preempted to the Bureau of Elevator Safety of the Department of Business and Professional regulation: ASME A17.1, Part 8, ASME A17.3, Sections 1.2, 1.5, ASME A18.1, Part 10.
3001.2 Referenced standards.  Change to read as shown.
3001.2 Referenced standards. Except as otherwise provided for in this code, the design, construction, installation, alteration, repair and maintenance of elevators and conveying systems and their components shall conform to ASME A17.1/CSA B44, ASME A17.3 and ASME A18.1, ASME A90.1, ASME B20.1, ALI ALCTV, and ASCE 24 for construction in flood hazard areas established in Section 1612.3. 

The Division of Hotels and Restaurants may grant exceptions, variances and waivers to the Elevator Safety Code as authorized by the Elevator Safety Code Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators (ASME A17.1, Section 1.2) and Florida Statutes (Chapter 120.)
3001.3 Accessibility.  Change to read as shown.
3001.3 Accessibility. Passenger elevators are required to be accessible by the Florida Building Code, Accessibility Chapter 11. shall conform to ICC A117.1.
3001.5 Design, installation and alteration of elevators.  Add to read as shown.

3001.5 Design, installation and alteration of elevators.
3001.5.1   Each new elevator shall comply with the Florida Elevator Safety Code that was in effect at the time of receipt of application for the construction permit for the elevator.

3001.5.2   Each alteration to, or relocation of, an elevator shall comply with the Florida Elevator Safety Code that was in effect at the time of receipt of the application for the construction permit for the alteration or relocation.

3001.5.3   All existing elevators shall comply with ASME A17.3
3001.6  Add to read as shown.
3001.6  As used in this chapter, the term:

ALTERATION.  Any change to equipment, including its parts, components, and/or subsystems, other than maintenance, repair, or replacement.
CERTIFICATE OF OPERATION means a document issued by the department which indicates that the conveyance has had the required safety inspection and tests and that fees have been paid as provided in this Chapter 399, FS.

CONVEYANCE. An elevator, dumbwaiter, escalator, moving sidewalk, platform lift and stairway chairlift.

DEPARTMENT. For the purpose of this section, means the Department of Business and Professional Regulation.

DIVISION. For the purpose of this section, means the Division of Hotels and Restaurants of the Department of Business and Professional Regulation.
ELEVATOR. One of the following mechanical devices:

(a) A hoisting and lowering mechanism, equipped with a car and platform that moves in guide rails and serves two or more landings to transport material or passengers or both. 

(b) An escalator, which is a power-driven, inclined continuous stairway used for raising or lowering passengers.

(c) A dumbwaiter, which is a hoisting and lowering mechanism equipped with a car of limited size which moves in guide rails and serves two or more landings. 

(d) A moving walk, which is a type of passenger-carrying device on which passengers stand or walk and in which the passenger-carrying surface remains parallel to its direction of motion and is uninterrupted. 

(e) An inclined stairway chairlift, which is a device used to transport physically handicapped persons over architectural barriers. 

(f) An inclined or vertical wheelchair lift, which is a device used to transport wheelchair handicapped persons over architectural barriers.
Exceptions:

Personnel hoists and material hoists within the scope of ASME A10.

Man lifts within the scope of ASME A90.1.

Mobile scaffolds, towers, and platforms within the scope of ANSI A92.

Powered platforms and equipment for exterior and interior maintenance within the scope of ASME A120.1.

Conveyors and related equipment within the scope of ASME B20.1.

Cranes, derricks, hoists, hooks, jacks and slings within the scope of ASME B30.

Industrial trucks within the scope of ASME B56.

Portable equipment, except for portable escalators that are covered by this code.

Tiered or piling machines used to move materials to and from storage located and operating entirely within one story.

Equipment for feeding or positioning materials at machine tools and printing presses.

Skip or furnace hoists.

Wharf ramps.

Railroad car lifts or dumpers. 

Line jacks, false cars, shafters, moving platforms and similar equipment used for installing an elevator by a contractor licensed in this state.

Automated people movers at airports.

Elevators in television and radio towers.

Hand-operated dumbwaiters.

Sewage pump station lifts.

Automobile parking lifts.

Equipment covered in Section 1.1.2 of the Elevator Safety Code ASME A17.1 Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators.
Elevators, inclined stairway chairlifts, and inclined or vertical wheelchair lifts located in private residences.
ESCALATOR. An installation defined as an escalator in the Florida Building Code.

EXISTING INSTALLATION. An installation defined as an “installation, existing” in the Florida Building Code.

PRIVATE RESIDENCE. A separate dwelling or a separate apartment in a multiple dwelling which is occupied by members of a single family.
Section 3002 Hoistway Enclosures

Section 3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate an ambulance stretcher, revise text to read as follows:

3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate an ambulance stretcher.  Where elevators are provided in buildings four or more stories above, or four or more stories below, grade plane, or where the rise exceeds 25 feet, at least one elevator shall be provided for Any building that is more than three stories high or in which the vertical distance between the bottom terminal landing and the top terminal landing exceeds 25 feet,must be constructed to contain at least one passenger elevator that is operational for building occupants and fire department emergency access to all floors.  The elevator car shall be of such a size and arrangement to accommodate an ambulance stretcher 24-inches by 76-inches (610 mm by 1950 mm) with not less than 5-inch radius corners in the horizontal, open position and shall be identified by the international symbol for emergency medical services (star of life). The symbol shall not be less than 3 inches (76 mm) high and shall be placed inside on both sides of the hoistway door frame.
3002.9  Add to read as shown.
3002.9 Automatic fire alarm initiating devices shall be located and installed in accordance with ASME A 17.1 and NFPA 72. 
Section 3004 Hoistway Venting

3004.3.1 Reduced vent area. Change to read as shown.

3004.3.1 Reduced vent area. Where mechanical ventilation conforming to the International Florida Building Code, Mechanical Code is provided, a reduction in the required vent area is allowed provided that all of the following conditions are met:

1. The occupancy is not in Group R-1, R-2, I-1 or I-2 or of a similar occupancy with overnight sleeping units.

2. The vents required by Section 3004.2 do not have outside exposure.

3. The hoistway does not extend to the top of the building.

4. The hoistway and machine room exhaust fan is automatically reactivated by thermostatic means.

5. Equivalent venting of the hoistway is accomplished.
Section 3005 Conveying Systems

3005.4 Personnel and material hoists.  Change to read as shown.

3005.4 Personnel and material hoists. Personnel and material hoists shall be designed utilizing an approved method that accounts for the conditions imposed during the intended operation of the hoist device. The design shall include, but is not limited to, anticipated loads, structural stability, impact, vibration, stresses and seismic restraint. The design shall account for the construction, installation, operation and inspection of the hoist tower, car, machinery and control equipment, guide members and hoisting mechanism. Additionally, the design of personnel hoists shall include provisions for field testing and maintenance which will demonstrate that the hoist device functions in accordance with the design. Field tests shall be conducted upon the completion of an installation or following a major alteration of a personnel hoist.

Section 3008 Occupant Evacuation Elevators

3008.2 Fire safety and evacuation plan. The building shall have an approved fire safety and evacuation plan in accordance with the applicable requirements of Section 404 of the International Florida Fire Prevention Code. The fire safety and evacuation plan shall incorporate specific procedures for the occupants using evacuation elevators.
Section 3009 Elevator Accessibilty Requirments for the Physically Handicapped.  Add to read as shown.

SECTION 3009

ELEVATOR ACCESSIBILITY REQUIREMENTS FOR THE PHYSICALLY HANDICAPPED

3009.1             In a building having any elevators that do not provide access to every floor level, elevator hallway call buttons on all main levels of ingress and on any floor that is commonly served by more than one group of elevators must be marked with Arabic and braille symbols that indicate floor levels to which access is provided. The symbols must be placed directly above each call button.

3009.2             Each elevator car interior must have a support rail on at least one wall. All support rails must be smooth and have no sharp edges and must not be more than 1½ inches (38 mm) thick or 2½ inches (63 mm) in diameter. Support rails must be continuous and a minimum length of 42 inches (1067 mm) overall.

The inside surface of support rails must be 1½ inches (38 mm) clear of the car wall. The distance from the top of the support rail to the finished car floor must be at least 31 inches (787 mm) and not more than 33 inches (838 mm). Padded or tufted material or decorative materials such as wallpaper, vinyl, cloth or the like may be not be used on support rails.

3009.3         A bench or seat may be installed on the rear wall of the elevator car enclosure, if the bench or seat does not protrude beyond the vertical plane of the elevator car enclosure wall when folded into a recess provided for the bench or seat and, when not in use, the bench or seat automatically folds into the recess. The bench or seat must be capable of supporting a live load of at least 250 pounds (113.4 kg) on any 12-inch by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) area. A padded, tufted or other decorative material may not be used to cover the bench or seat; or may the bench or seat encroach on the minimum clear inside-car dimensions specified in this section.

This section applies only to elevators available for the transportation of the public. This section does not apply to elevators restricted by key or similar device to a limited number of persons in a building that has an elevator that otherwise meets the requirements of this section or to elevators used only for the transportation of freight. However, elevators that are used as freight and passenger elevators for the public and employees must comply with this section. This section does not apply to dumbwaiters or escalators.

This section supersedes all other state regulations and local ordinances and rules affecting the accessibility of passenger elevators to the physically handicapped, and the standards established by this section may not be modified by municipal or county ordinance.
Section 3010 Serial Numbers.  Add to read as shown.

SECTION 3010 SERIAL NUMBERS
3010.1 Serial numbers. Each elevator shall have a serial number assigned by the division or authority having jurisdiction  painted on or  attached to the elevator car in plain view and also to the driving mechanism. This serial number shall be shown on all required certificates and permits.
3010.1.1.   Certificates of operation must be posted in a conspicuous location in the elevator and shall contain the text of Section 823.12, Florida Statutes relating to the prohibition against smoking in elevators. The certificate must be framed with a transparent cover.
3010.1.2.         The designation “NO SMOKING” along with the international symbol for no smoking shall be conspicuously displayed within the interior of the elevator in the plain view of the public.
3010.1.3.         The following ASME A17.1, rule is hereby amended to read as follows:

a.          Rule 2.29.1 amend to add the following to the rule: "Each car in a multicar group shall be sequentially identified from left to right, as viewed from the elevator lobby."

b.         Rule 2.7.3.1 of the ASME A17.1, which is amended to read as follows: “Rule 2.7.3.1 General Requirements. A permanent, safe and convenient means of access to elevator machine rooms and overhead machinery spaces shall be provided for authorized persons. The key to the machine rooms and overhead machinery spaces shall be kept on the premises at all times and readily available for use by State of Florida certified Elevator Inspectors.”
c.           Rule 3.11.3 of ASME A17.3 is amended to read as follows:

NOTE: Updates to the Safety Code for Existing Elevators and Escalators ASME A17.1 and ASME A17.3 which require Phase II Firefighters’ Service shall apply except where section 399.02(9) Florida Statute states Phase II Firefighters' Service on elevators may not be enforced until July 1, 2015, or until the elevator is replaced or requires major modification, whichever occurs first, on elevators in condominiums or multifamily residential buildings, including those that are part of a continuing care facility licensed under chapter 651, or similar retirement community with apartments, having a certificate of occupancy by the local building authority that was issued before July 1, 2008. This exception does not prevent an elevator owner from requesting a variance from the applicable codes before or after July 1, 2015. This subsection does not prohibit the division from granting variances pursuant to s. 120.542, Florida Statute. 
Section 3011  Electrolysis Protection for Underground Hydraulic elevator Cylinders.  Add to read as shown.

SECTION 3011 ELECTROLYSIS PROTECTION FOR UNDERGROUND HYDRAULIC ELEVATOR CYLINDERS
	3011.1 Electrolysis protection for underground hydraulic elevator cylinders.  All newly installed underground hydraulic pressure cylinders shall be encased in outer plastic containment to minimize electrolytic corrosion between the metal cylinder and ground cathode.

3011.1.1         The plastic casing shall be capped at the bottom, and all joints must be solvent or heat welded to ensure water tightness.

3011.1.2         The plastic casing shall be constructed of polyethylene or polyvinyl chloride (PVC). The plastic pipe wall thickness must not be less than 0.125 inch (3.175 mm).

3011.1.3         The neck of the plastic casing shall have a means of inspection provided to monitor the annulus between the pressurized hydraulic cylinder and the protective plastic casing.

3011.1.4        Replacements of existing hydraulic cylinders shall be protected by the aforementioned method where existing physical dimensions permit.




Section 3013 Alterations to Electric and Hydraulic Elevators and Escalators.  Add to read as shown.

SECTION 3013 ALTERATIONS TO ELECTRIC AND HYDRAULIC ELEVATORS AND ESCALATORS
3013.1 Alterations to electric and hydraulic elevators and escalators.

Alterations set forth in Part 8, ASME A17.1 to include any change to equipment, including its parts, components, and/or subsystems, other than maintenance, repair, or replacement; require an elevator construction permit, along with documented performance of inspections and tests to determine conformance with ASME A17.1.  A repair or replacement of equipment, parts, components or subsystems that requires inspection, tests and independent witnessing in other sections of ASME A17.1,  A17.3  and A18.1 shall require an elevator construction permit.
Chapter 31 Special Construction 

Revise 3109 Swimming Pool Enclosures and Safety Devices  to read as follows:

SECTION 3109 STRUCTURES SEAWARD OF A COASTAL CONSTRUCTION CONTROL LINE
301.9.1 General.  Add to read as shown.

3109.1 General.
3109.1.1 Scope.  Add to read as shown.

3109.1.1 Scope. The provisions of Section 3109 shall ensure that structures located seaward of the coastal construction control line are designed to resist the predicted forces associated with a 100-year storm event and shall apply to the following:

1.   All habitable structures which extend wholly or partially seaward of a coastal construction control line (CCCL) or 50-foot (15.3 m) setback line.

2.   Substantial improvement of or additions to existing habitable structures.

3.        Swimming pools that are located in close proximity to a habitable structure or armoring. An environmental permit from the Florida Department of Environmental Protection, requiring special siting considerations to protect the beach-dune system, proposed or existing structures and public beach access, is required prior to the start of construction. The environmental permit may condition the nature, timing and sequence of construction of permitted activities to provide protection to nesting sea turtles and hatchlings and their habitat, including review, submittal and approval of lighting plans.

Exception: The standards for buildings seaward of a CCCL area do not apply to any modification, maintenance or repair of any existing structure within the limits of the existing foundation which does not require, involve or include any additions to, or repair or modification of, the existing foundation of that structure.
3109.1.2 Certification.  Add to read as shown.

3109.1.2 Certification.  As part of the permit process and upon placement of the lowest horizontal structural member, the applicant shall submit to the building official certification of the elevation of the lowest horizontal structural member of the lowest floor as built in relation to National Geodetic Vertical Datum (N.G.V.D.). Said certification shall be prepared by or under the direct supervision of a registered land surveyor or professional engineer or architect and certified by same and be submitted prior to commencing any addition work. Any work undertaken prior to submission of the certification shall be at the applicant’s risk. The building official shall review the submitted elevation data, and any deficiencies found shall be corrected by the permit holder immediately and prior to any further work being permitted to proceed.
3109.2 Definitions.  Add to read as shown.

3109.2 Definitions.

ARMORING. A manmade structure designed to either prevent erosion of the upland property or protect upland structures from the effects of coastal wave and current action. Armoring includes certain rigid coastal structures such as geotextile bags or tubes, seawalls, revetments, bulkheads, retaining wall or similar structures, but does not include jetties, groins or other construction whose purpose is to add sand to the beach and dune system, alter the natural coastal currents or stabilize the mouths of inlets.

BREAKAWAY WALL. A partition independent of supporting structural members that is intended to withstand design wind forces but to collapse from a water load less than that which would occur during a 100 year storm event without causing collapse, displacement or other structural damage to the elevated portion of the building or supporting foundation system.

COASTAL CONSTRUCTION CONTROL LINE. The line established by the State of Florida pursuant to Section161.053, Florida Statutes, and recorded in the official records of the county which defines that portion of the beach-dune system subject to severe fluctuations based on a 100-year storm surge, storm waves or other predictable weather conditions.

DESIGN GRADE. The predicted eroded grade caused by the 100-year storm.

FIFTY-FOOT SETBACK LINE. A line of jurisdiction, established pursuant to the provisions of Section161.052, Florida Statutes, in which construction is prohibited within 50 feet  (15.13 m) of the line of mean high water at any riparian coastal location fronting the Gulf of Mexico or the Atlantic coast shoreline.

HABITABLE STRUCTURE. Structures designed primarily for human occupancy and are potential locations for shelter from storms. Typically included within this category are residences, hotels and restaurants.

LOWEST HORIZONTAL STRUCTURE MEMBER. Any shore-parallel structural member which supports floor, wall or column loads and transmits them to the pile foundation.

ONE-HUNDRED-YEAR STORM ELEVATION. The height of the breaking wave crest or wave approach as superimposed on the storm surge with dynamic wave set-up of a 100-year storm. This 100-year storm elevation is determined by the Florida Department of Environmental Protection based on studies published as part of the coastal construction control line establishment process and an analysis of topographic and other site specific data.

REBUILDING. See definition of “Substantial improvement.”

SUBSTANTIAL IMPROVEMENT.. See Section 1612. 

3109.3 Elevation standards.  Add to read as shown.

3109.3 Elevation standards.  All habitable structures shall be elevated at or above an elevation which places the lowest horizontal structural member above the 100-year storm elevation as determined by the Florida Department of Environmental Protection in the report titled “One-Hundred-Year Storm Elevation Requirements for Habitable Structures Located Seaward of a Coastal Construction Control Line.”

An applicant may request the Department of Environmental Protection to determine a site-specific 100-year storm elevation for the applicant’s proposed habitable structure as part of the environmental permit application process. The elevation will be provided as part of the applicant’s environmental permit and shall be subject to review under the provisions of Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

Exceptions:

1.
Additions, repairs or modifications to existing nonconforming habitable structures that do not advance the seaward limits of the existing habitable structure and do not constitute rebuilding of the existing structure.

2.
Habitable structures located landward of existing armoring which is capable of protecting buildings from the effects of erosion from a 100-year storm surge. The applicant shall provide scientific and engineering evidence that the armoring has been designed, constructed and maintained to survive the effects of the design storm and provide protection to existing and proposed structures from the erosion associated with that event. Evidence shall include a report with data and supporting analysis, and shall be certified by a professional engineer registered in this state, that the armoring was designed and constructed and is in adequate condition to meet the following criteria:
a.
The top must be at or above the still water level, including setup, for the design storm plus the breaking wave calculated at its highest achievable level based on the maximum eroded beach profile and highest surge level combination, and must be high enough to preclude runup overtopping.
b.
The armoring must be stable under the design storm including maximum localized scour, with adequate penetration and toe protection to avoid settlement, toe failure, or loss of material from beneath or behind the armoring.

c.
The armoring must have sufficient continuity or return walls to prevent flanking under the design storm from impacting the proposed construction.

d.
The armoring must withstand the static and hydrodynamic forces of the design storm.

3.
A higher elevation standard is required by either the National Flood Insurance Program (NFIP), as found on a community’s Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM), or the local flood damage prevention ordinance. In such instances, the higher elevation standard shall apply.
3109.4 Construction standards.  Add to read as shown.

3109.4 Construction standards.
3109.4.1 Pile foundations.  Add to read as shown.

3109.4.1 Pile foundations.  All habitable structures shall be elevated on, and securely anchored to, an adequate pile foundation. Pile foundations for habitable structures shall be designed to withstand all reasonable anticipated erosion, scour and loads resulting from a 100-year storm including wind, wave, hydrostatic and hydrodynamic forces acting simultaneously with typical structural (live and dead) loads. All habitable structures should be anchored to their pile foundation in such a manner as to prevent flotation, collapse or lateral displacement. The elevation of the soil surface to be used in the calculation of pile reactions and bearing capacities for habitable structures shall not be greater than that which would result from erosion caused by a 100-year storm event. Calculation of the design grade shall account for localized scour resulting from the presence of structural components. Design ratio or pile spacing to pile diameter should not be less than 8:1 for individual piles located above the design grade. Pile caps shall be set below the design grade unless designed to resist increased flood loads associated with setting the cap above the design grade, but at or below the natural grade. Pile penetration shall take into consideration the anticipated loss of soil above the design grade.
Exceptions:

1.
Additions, repairs or modifications to existing nonconforming habitable structures that do not advance the seaward limits of the existing habitable structure and do not constitute rebuilding of the existing structure.

2.
Habitable structures located landward of existing armoring which is capable of protecting buildings from the effects of erosion from a 100-year storm surge. The applicant shall provide scientific and engineering evidence that the armoring has been designed, constructed and maintained to survive the effects of the design storm and provide protection to existing and proposed structures from the erosion associated with that event. Evidence shall include a report with data and supporting analysis, and shall be certified by a professional engineer registered in this state, that the armoring was designed and constructed and is in adequate condition to meet the following criteria:

a.
The top must be at or above the still water level, including setup, for the design storm plus the breaking wave calculated at its highest achievable level based on the maximum eroded beach profile and highest surge level combination, and must be high enough to preclude runup overtopping.

b.
The armoring must be stable under the design storm including maximum localized scour, with adequate penetration and toe protection to avoid settlement, toe failure or loss of material from beneath or behind the armoring.
c.
The armoring must have sufficient continuity or return walls to prevent flanking under the design storm from impacting the proposed construction.

d.
The armoring must withstand the static and hydrodynamic forces of the design storm.
3109.4.2 Walls below the 100-year storm elevation.  Add to read as shown.

3109.4.2 Walls below the 100-year storm elevation.  No substantial walls or partitions shall be constructed below the level of the first finished floor of habitable structures. All other walls shall be designed to break away.

Exceptions:

1.
Stairways and stairwells;

2.
Shear walls perpendicular to the shoreline;

3.
Shear walls parallel to the shoreline, which are limited to a maximum of 20 percent of the building length in the direction running parallel to the shore;

4.
Shear walls parallel to the shoreline, which exceed 20 percent of the total building length (including any attached major structure) when they meet the following criteria:

a.
A certification is provided by a Florida-registered professional engineer that certifies that the increased length of shear walls, over 20 percent, are located landward of the 100-year erosion limit;

b.
A hydraulic analysis is provided and certified by a Florida-registered professional engineer that evaluates the potential impact of flow increase on the subject parcel and adjacent properties;

c.
The hydraulic analysis demonstrates that although the overall shearwall coverage is more than 20 percent, the increased shearwall length will not result in substantial increase of flow velocities and drag forces on the structural components of the proposed structure and neighboring structures; and
d.
The provisions under Section 3109.4.2 (Exception 4) do not include any low-rise building as defined in Section 1609.2.

5.
Wind or sand screens constructed of fiber or wire mesh;

6.
Light, open lattice partitions with individual, wooden lattice strips not greater than 3/4 inch (19 mm) thick and 3 inches (76 mm) wide;

7.
Elevator shafts;

8.
Small mechanical and electrical rooms; and

9.
Break-away or frangible walls.

3109.5 Flood loads during a 100-year storm.  Add to read as shown.

3109.5 Flood loads during a 100-year storm.

3109.5.1 Load basis.  Add to read as shown.

3109.5.1 Load basis.  The structural design shall be based on the 100-year storm as determined by the Florida Department of Environmental Protection in studies published as part of the coastal construction control line establishment process. Breaking, broken and nonbreaking waves shall be considered as applicable. Design wave loading analysis shall consider vertical uplift pressures and all lateral pressures to include impact, as well as dynamic loading and the harmonic intensification resulting from repetitive waves.
3109.5.2 Hydrostatic load.  Add to read as shown.

3109.5.2 Hydrostatic load.  Habitable structures shall be designed in consideration of the hydrostatic loads which would be expected under the conditions of maximum inundation associated with a 100-year storm event. Calculations for hydrostatic loads shall consider the maximum water pressure resulting from a fully peaked, breaking wave superimposed on the design storm surge with dynamic wave setup. Both free and confined hydrostatic loads shall be considered. Hydrostatic loads which are confined shall be determined using the maximum elevation to which the confined water would freely rise if unconfined. Vertical hydrostatic loads shall be considered as forces acting both vertically downward and upward on horizontal or inclined surfaces of major structures (e.g., floors, slabs, roofs, walls). Lateral hydrostatic loads shall be considered as forces acting horizontally above and below grade on vertical or inclined surfaces of major structures and coastal or shore protection structures. Hydrostatic loads on irregular or curving geometric surfaces may be determined in consideration of separate vertical and horizontal components acting simultaneously under the distribution of the hydrostatic pressures.

3109.5.3 Hydrodynamic loads.  Add to read as shown.

3109.5.3 Hydrodynamic loads.  Habitable structures shall be designed in consideration of the hydrodynamic loads which would be expected under the conditions of a 100-year storm event. Calculations for hydrodynamic loads shall consider the maximum water pressures resulting from the motion of the water mass associated with a 100-year storm event. Full-intensity loading shall be applied on all structural surfaces above the design grade which would affect the flow velocities.

3109.6 Wind loads.  Add to read as shown.

3109.6 Wind loads.  All habitable structures shall be designed in accordance with Chapter 16.
3109.7 Swimming pools.  Add to read as shown.

3109.7 Swimming pools.  Swimming pools located in close proximity to an existing habitable structure or armoring shall be designed with an adequate pile foundation for the erosion and scour conditions of a 100-year storm event.

3109.8 Storm debris.  Add to read as shown.

3109.8 Storm debris.  All structures will be designed to minimize the potential for wind and water-borne debris during a storm.
Section 3112 Deposit of Materials in Tidewater Regulated.  Add to read as shown.

SECTION 3112 DEPOSIT OF MATERIAL IN TIDEWATER REGULATED
3112.1  It is not lawful for any person to discharge or cause to be discharged or deposit or cause to be deposited, in the tide or salt waters of any bay, port, harbor or river of this state, any ballast or material of any kind other than clear stone or rock, free from gravel or pebbles, which said clear stone or rock shall be deposited or discharged only in the construction of enclosures in connection with wharves, piers, quays, jetties or in the construction of permanent bulkheads connecting the solid and permanent portion of wharves. It is lawful to construct three characters of bulkheads for retention of material in solid wharves.

First, clear stone or rock enclosures, or bulkheads, may be built upon all sides to a height not less than 2½ feet (762 mm) above high watermark; and after the enclosures have been made so solid, tight and permanent as to prevent any sand, mud, gravel or other material that may be discharged or deposited in them from drifting or escaping through such enclosures, any kind of ballast may be discharged or deposited within the enclosures. The enclosures may be constructed of wood, stone and rock combined, the stone and rocks to be placed on the outside of the wood to a height not less at any point than 2½ feet (762 mm) above high watermark; and after the enclosures have been made so solid, tight and permanent as to prevent any sand, mud gravel or other material that may be discharged or deposited in them from drifting or escaping through such enclosures, any kind of ballast may be discharged or deposited within the enclosures.

Second, a bulkhead may be built by a permanent wharf consisting of thoroughly creosoted piles not less than 12 inches (305 mm) in diameter at the butt end, to be driven close together and to be capped with timber not less than 10 or 14 inches drift (254 or 302 mm), bolted to each pile, and one or more longitudinal stringers to be placed on the outside of the bulkhead and securely anchored by means of iron rods to piles driven within the bulkheads, clear rock to be on the inside of the bulkhead, to a height of not less than 2½ feet (762 mm) above high water; and after this is done, ballast or other material may be deposited within the permanent enclosure so constructed.
Third, a bulkhead may be constructed to consist of creosoted piles, as described herein, driven not exceeding 4 feet (1219 mm) apart from center to center, inside of which two or more longitudinal stringers may be placed and securely bolted to the piles. Inside of these longitudinal pieces, two thicknesses of creosoted sheet piling are to be driven, each course of the sheet piling to make a joint with the other to form an impenetrable wharf; and within this permanent bulkhead so constructed, any ballast or other material may be deposited.

No such enclosure, pier, quay or jetty shall be begun until the point whereat it is to be built shall have been connected by a substantial wharf with a shore or with a permanent wharf; except that the owners of wharves may at any time, with the consent of the Board of Pilot Commissioners of the Division of Professions of the Department of Business and Professional Regulation, build wharves of clear stone or rock, or creosoted walls as hereinafter provided, on each side of their wharves from the shore to a point at which the water is not more than 15 feet (4.6 m) deep, and when such walls have attained a height of 2½ feet (762 mm) above high watermark and have been securely closed at the deepwater end by stone or creosoted walls of the same height, any kind of ballast may be deposited in them.
Nothing contained in this section shall interfere with any rights or privileges now enjoyed by riparian owners. While this section empowers those who desire to construct the several characters of wharves, piers, quays, jetties and bulkheads provided for and described herein, nothing in this section shall be so construed as to require any person not desiring to construct a permanent wharf by filling up with ballast, stone or other material to construct under the specifications contained herein; and nothing in this chapter shall be so construed as to prevent any person from constructing any wharf or placing any pilings, logs or lumber in any waters where the person would have heretofore had the right so to do.
3112.2  Add to read as shown.

3112.2 This section shall not prohibit Escambia County from placing in Pensacola Bay, on the Escambia County side, beside the old Pensacola Bay Bridge, certain materials, as recommended by the Department of Environmental Protection, in coordination with the Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission, to increase the number of fish available for persons fishing from the old Pensacola Bay Bridge.
3112.3  Add to read as shown.

3112.3 This section shall not prohibit Manatee County from placing in the Manatee County portions of Sarasota Bay and Tampa Bay and in the Manatee River, certain materials, as recommended by the Department of Environmental Protection, in coordination with the Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission, to increase the number of fish available for persons fishing in the above areas.
3112.4  Add to read as shown.

3112.4 This section shall not prohibit Pinellas County from placing in Tampa Bay certain materials as recommended by the Department of Environmental Protection, in coordination with the Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission, to increase the number of fish available for persons fishing in the bay. Deposit of material on a wharf or quay is regulated. It is not lawful for any person to deposit or cause to be deposited on any wharf or quay, any ballast, stone, earth or like material, except such wharf or quay may be so secured as to prevent such ballast or other material from washing into the waters of the harbor.
Section 3113 Lighting, Mirrors, Landscaping.  Add to read as shown.

SECTION 3113 LIGHTING, MIRRORS, LANDSCAPING
3112.1 Add to read as shown.

3113.1 Each operator of an automated teller machine that controls the access area or defined parking area to be lighted shall comply with Sections (2), (3), and (4) no later than one year after October 1, 1994. If the access area or defined parking area to be lighted is controlled by a person other than the operator, such other person shall comply with Sections (2), (3), and (4) no later than one year after October 1, 1994.
3113.2 Add to read as shown.

3113.2 Each operator, or other person responsible for an automated teller machine pursuant to Sections 655.960 through 655.965, shall provide lighting during the hours of darkness with respect to an open and operating automated teller machine and any defined parking area, access area and the exterior of an enclosed automated teller machine installation, as follows:
1.
There shall be a minimum of 10 candlefoot (108 lux) power at the face of the automated teller machine and extending in an unobstructed direction outward 5 feet (1.5 m).

2.
There shall be a minimum of 2 footcandle (21.5 lux) power within 50 feet (15.25 m) in all unobstructed directions from the face of the automated teller machine. If the automated teller machine is located within 10 feet (3 m) of the corner of the building and the automated teller machine is generally accessible from the adjacent side, there shall be a minimum of 2 footcandle (21.5 lux) power along the first 40 unobstructed feet (12 m) of the adjacent side of the building.

3.
There shall be a minimum of 2 footcandle (12.5 lux) power in that portion of the defined parking area within 60 feet (18 m) of the automated teller machine.

4.
The operator shall provide reflective mirrors or surfaces at each automated teller machine which provide the customer with a rear view while the customer is engaged in using the automated teller machine.

5.
The operator, or other person responsible pursuant to Sections 655.960 through 655.965 for an automated teller machine, shall ensure that the height of any landscaping, vegetation or other physical obstructions in the area required to be lighted pursuant to Section (2) for any open and operating automated teller machine shall not exceed 3 feet (914 mm), except that trees trimmed to a height of 10 feet (3 m) and whose diameters are less than 2 feet (610 mm) and manmade physical obstructions required by statute, law, code, ordinance or other governmental regulation shall not be affected by this section.
Chapter 34 Existing Structures
SECTION 3401 GENERAL 


3401.1 Scope Revise to read as follows:


3401.1 Scope. 

Alteration, repair, addition, relocation and change of occupancy of existing structures and buildings shall comply with the provisions of the Florida Building Code, Existing Building.

Remaining text of this chapter is reserved
Chapter 35 Referenced Standards

Change to read as shown.

AAMA


American Architectural Manufacturers Association

1827 Waldon Walden Office Square, Suite 104550
Schaumburg, IL 60173-4268


[CA4589]

Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number


Add to read as shown.  

101/I.S.2—97
Voluntary Specifications for Aluminum, Vinyl (PVC) and Wood Windows and Glass Doors

 2411.3.2.1


Add to read as shown.

103.- 09
Procedural Guide, Sec. 2 — Engineering Design Rules

2411.3.2.6


501—05

Method for Test for Exterior Wall
 2411.3.2.1.1, 2612.2


ACI

American Concrete Institute

P.O. Box 9094

Farmington Hills, MI 48333-9094

Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number

117

Standard Tolerances for Concrete Construction and Materials
1920.2
224.3R—95
Joints in Concrete Construction (Reapproved 2001)
1911.2
301

Specifications for Structural Concrete for Buildings
1920.2
315

Manual of Standard Practice for Detailing Reinforced Concrete Structures
1920.2
347

Recommended Practice for Concrete Foamwork
1920.2, 1925.1.1

506

Recommended Practice for Shotcreting
1920.2

506.2

Specification for Shotcrete

1920.2, 1929.1.2, 1929.8.1
530—11
Building Code Requirements for Masonry Structures
1405.5, 1405.5.3, 1405.9, 1604.3.4, 1605.3.1.1, 1618.9,1805.5.2, 1812.7, 2101.2.3, 2101.2.4, 2101.2.5, 2103.11.6, 2106.1, 2106.1.1.1, 2106.1.1.2, 2106.1.1.3, 2106.3, 2106.4, 2106.5, 2106.6, 2107.1, 2107.2, 2107.2.1, 2107.2.2, 2107.2.4, 2107.2.5, 2107.2.6, 2108.1, 2108.2, 2108.3, 2108.4, 2109.1, 2109.2.3.1, 2109.2.3.2, 2114.2, 2121.2.12, 2122.1
AF&PA

American Forest & Paper Association

1111 19th St, NW Suite 800

Washington, DC 20036

Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number

Add to read as shown.

AF&PA—92   Wood Structural Design Data                        2314.4.7

AF&PA—05 Design Values for Joists and Rafters            2314.4.7
PWF--07 Permanent Wood Foundation (PWF) Design Specification   1805.4.6, 1807.2, 2304.9.5, 2314.4.7

WCD 1—01    Wood Construction Data No. 1, Details for Conventional Wood Frame Construction        2314.4.7

WCD 4— 03 Wood Construction Data No. 4, Plank and Beam Framing for Residential Buildings         2306.1.2, 2314.4.7

WCD 5—89    Wood Construction Data No. 5, Heavy Timber Construction Details                                   2314.4.7

WCD 6—06 Wood Construction Data No. 6, Design of Wood Frame Structures for Permanence       314.4.7, 2326.2.11
FGI AHA


American Hardboard Association

1210 West N.W. Highway

Palatine, IL 60067



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number


A135.4—2004
Basic Hardboard





1404.3.1, 2303.1.6, 2314.4.1


A135.5—2004
Prefinished Hardboard Paneling



2303.1.6, 2304.6.2, 2314.4.1


A135.6—98
Hardboard Siding





1404.3.2, 2303.1.6, 2314.4.1


A194.1—85
Cellulosic Fiber Board





2303.1.5, 2314.4.1
IB Spec. No. 1
Recommended Product and Application Specification —Structural Insulating Roof Deck




2314.4.1


IB Spec. No. 2
Recommended Product and Application Specification —½ inch Fiberboard Nail-Base Sheathing




2314.4.1


IB Spec. No. 3
Recommended Product and Application Specification —½ inch Intermediate Fiberboard Sheathing



2314.4.1

AISC
Torsional Analysis of Steel Members
2214.3

Change to read as shown:  

AISC
Detailing for Steel Construction




2214.3

AISC
Engineering for Steel Construction




2214.3

AISC
Iron and Steel Beams - 1873 to 1952



2214.3

AISC
Serviceability Design Considerations for Low-Rise Buildings

2214.3, 2223.5.2

AISC
, Manual of Steel Construction, 2005, Thirteenth Edition

2214.3

AISC

Metal Building Certification Program, Category MB Certified

2223.11.2
AISI


American Iron and Steel Institute

1140 Connecticut Avenue, Suite 705

Washington, DC 20036



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number


Add to read as shown.

AISI
Design Manual For Cold-Formed Steel


2214.3


AISI
Design Manual for Structural Tubing


2214.3


Z—2
Designing Fire Protection for Steel Trusses


2214.3


Z—3
Designing Fire Protection for Steel Columns (Beams), No column listed 

2214.3


AISI
Fire-Resistant Steel-Frame Construction


2214.3


AISI
Fire-Safe Structural Steel - A Design Guide


2214.3


AISI
Specifications for Design of Light-Gage Cold-Formed Stainless Structural Members
2214.3


AISI
Specification for the Criteria for Structural Application of Steel Cables for Buildings
2214.3


SG02—1
North American Specification for Design of Cold-Formed Steel Structural Members 
2214.3

Change to read as shown.

AITC

American Institute of Timber Construction

7012 S. Revere Parkway, Suite 140

Englewood, CO 80112

Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number

A 190.1—07
Structural Glued Laminated Timber
   2303.1.3, 2306.1, 2314.4.2, 2315.1.1
Technical Note 7—96
Calculation of Fire Resistance of Glued Laminated Timbers
721.6.3.3, 2314.4.2
104—03
Typical Construction Details


2306.1, 2314.4.2
106
Code of Suggested Practices



2314.4.2

108—93
Standard for Heavy Timber Construction


2314.4.2

109—98
Standard for Preservative Treatment for Structural Glued Laminated Timber

2314.4.2
110—01
Standard Appearance Grades for Structural Glued Laminated Timber

2306.1, 2314.4.2
112—93
Tongue-and-Groove Heavy Timber Roof Decking
2306.1, 2314.4.2
113—01
Dimensions of Structural Glued Laminated Timber
2306.1, 2314.4.2
117—04
Standard Specifications for Structural Glued Laminated Timber of Softwood Species—Design Requirements—Standard Specifications for Structural Glued Laminated Timber of Softwood Species—Manufacturing Requirements




2306.1, 2314.4.2
119—96
Standard Specifications for Structural Glued Laminated Timber of Hardwood Species
2306.1, 2314.4.2
200—04

Inspection Manual




2306.1

ANSI

American National Standards Institute

25 West 43rd Street, Fourth Floor

New York, NY 10036

Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number

Add to read as shown.

A 41.1
Building Code Requirements for Masonry

2119.1.1, 2121.2.8

A 41.2
Building Code Requirements for Reinforced Masonry

2119.1.1
A 42.1
Specification For Gypsum Plastering


2515.1.1
A 42.4
Standard Specification for Interior Lathing and Furring
2514.1

APA

APA - Engineered Wood Association

7011 So. 19th

Tacoma, WA 98466

Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number

Add to read as shown.

APA E30

Engineered Wood Construction Guide

2314.4.3
APA PDS-Y510J—04       Plywood Design Specification (revised 1998)      2306.1, Table 2306.3.1, 2306.3.2, 2306.4.1, 2314.4.3
Change to read as shown.

APA PDS Supplement 1—90  Design and Fabrication of Plywood Curved Panels (revised1995) 2306.1, 2314.4.3
APA PDS Supplement 2—92 
Design and Fabrication of Plywood-lumber Beams (revised 1998)       2306.1, 2314.4.3
APA PDS Supplement 3—90
Design and Fabrication of Plywood Stressed-skin Panels (revised 1996)
2306.1, 2314.4.3
APA PDS Supplement 4—90
Design and Fabrication of Plywood Sandwich Panels (revised 1993)
2306.1, 2314.4.3
APA PDS Supplement 5—95
Design and Fabrication of All-plywood Beams (revised 1995)
2306.1, 2314.4.3
Add to read as shown.

APA B840

Siding Manufacturing Specifications

2314.4.3
APA L350

Design/Construction Guide Diaphragms and Shearwalls


2314.4.3
APA PRP108

Performance Standards and Policies for Structural-Use Panels
2314.4.3, 2315.1.2
APA V910

Plywood Folded Plate Laboratory Report 21

2314.4.3
ASCE/SEI

American Society of Civil Engineers

Structural Engineering Institute

1801 Alexander Bell Drive

Reston, VA 20191-4400

Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number

Change to read as shown.

3—91
Structural Design of Composite Slabs
1604.3.3, 1920.3, 2209.2, 2214.3
5—11
Building Code Requirements for Masonry Structures
1405.5, 1405.5.3, 1405.9, 1604.3.4, 1618.9, 1805.5.2, 1812.7, 2101.2.3, 2101.2.4, 2101.2.5, 2103.11.6, 2106.1, 2106.1.1.1, 2106.1.1.2, 2106.1.1.3, 2106.3, 2106.4, 2106.5, 2106.6, 2107.1, 2107.2, 2107.2.1, 2107.2.2, 2107.2.4, 2107.2.5, 2107.2.6, 2108.1, 2108.2, 2108.3, 2108.4, 2109.1, 2109.2.3.1, 2109.2.3.2, 2121.2.12, 
7-10                              Minimum Design Loads for Buildings and Other Structures (with Errata dated January 11, 2011)
8—02
Specification for the Design of Cold-formed Stainless Steel Structural Members
1604.3.3, 2209.1, 2214.3
Add to read as shown.

11
Guidelines for Structural Condition Assessment of Existing Buildings
1920.3, 2003.2, 2214.3
Facility Guidelines Institute
1919 McKinney Avenue
Dallas, Texas 75201
www.fgiguidelines.org
Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number

HHCF   10 
Guideline for the Design and Construction of  Health Care Facilities    419.2.1.2, 419.2.2, 419.3.2, 419.3.3, 419.3.4, 419.3.4.1, 419.3.4.2, 419.3.5, 419.3.5.1, 419.3.5.2, 419.3.6, 419.3.6.1, 419.3.7, 419.3.8.8, 419.3.8.9, 419.3.9, 419.3.10, 419.3.11, 419.3.13, 419.3.15, 419.3.17, 420.2.2, 420.2.5, 421.2.1.2, 421.2.2, 421.3.2, 421.3.2.1,  421.3.2.2, 421.3.3, 421.3.3.2.2, 421.3.3.3, 421.3.4, 421.3.5, 421.3.10
Illuminating Engineering Society of North America, 
120 Wall Street, 17th Floor, 
New York, NY 10005-4001.

ANSI/IESNA RP-28-07 Lighting and the Visual Environment for Senior Living 
……420.3.22.3
Add to read as shown.

ASHRAE


American Society of Heating, Refrigerating and Air-Conditioning Engineers, Inc.

1791 Tullie Circle NE

Atlanta, GA 30329-2305



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number


52.1—92
Gravimetric and Dust-Spot Procedures for Testing Air-Cleaning Devices Used in General Ventilation for Removing Particulate Matter ASHRAE Handbook—HVAC Applications 


Table 420.3.13.7


62—01
Ventilation for Acceptable Indoor Air Quality
Table 420.3.13.7

Change to read as shown.

A 17.1/CSA B44—07
Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators includes A17.1a in 2008 and A17.1b-2009 Addenda 1607.8.1, 3001.1, 3001.2, 3001.4, 3002.5, 3003.2, 3007.1, 3008.3,  3008.11.5, 308.14.1, 3008.1, 3010.1, 3011.1 
ASME

Add to read as shown.

A 17.3—96
Safety Code for Existing Elevators and Escalators
3001.1, 3001.2, 3001.5
Change to read as shown.

A18.1—08                      
Safety Standard for Platform Lifts and Stairway Chairlifts              3001.1, 3001.2
Delete text to read as follows:

Add to read as shown.

A 120.1—01
Safety Requirements
A90.1 - 09                                           Safety Standard for Belt Manlifts                 3001.2
A120.1—01                                          Safety Requirements for Powered Platforms for Building Maintenance                 3001.6

B20.1 - 2009                                           Safety Standard for Conveyors and related equipment                                         3001.2,  3005.3
 E 108—07a
Test Methods for Fire Tests of Roof Coverings
423.12.1, 1505.1, 1513.1, 1516.1, 1523.1.2, 2329.1, 2603.6, 2610.2, 2610.3

F1346—91 (2003)
Performance Specification for Safety Covers and Labeling Requirements for All Covers for Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs

424.1.3.9, 424.2.2, 424.2.17, 
G53—96
Practice for Operating Light-and Water-Exposure Apparatus (Fluorscent UV-Condensation Type) for Exposure of Nonmetallic Materials
Add to read as shown.

Pub. No. 362

Safety Barrier Guidelines for Home Pools

424.1.3.1.9
ASTM

ASTM International

100 Barr Harbor Drive

West Conshohocken, PA 19428-2959

Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in code section number

A1760—76
Standard Specification for Pressure Treatment of Timber Products

Table 1823
A 6/A 6M— 04a
Specification for General Requirements for Rolled Steel, Structural Steel Bars, Plates, Shapes, and Sheet Piling


2214.3
A 29
Standards for General Requirements for Hot-Rolled and Cold-Finished Carbon and Alloy Steel Bars

1827.1
A 252—98(2007)
Specification for Welded and Seamless Steel Pipe Piles
1809.3.1, 1810.6.1, 1826.1.5.3
A 306
Carbon Steel Bars Subject to Mechanical Property Requirements

1827.1
A 325—94
Specification for Structural Bolts, Steel, Heat-Treated, 120/105 Ksi Minimum Tensile Strength


2214.3

A 361
Specification for Steel Sheet Zinc-Coated (Withdrawn)
2319.17.1.1
A 421/A 421M—02     Specification for Uncoated Stress-Relieved Steel Wire for 

                                      Prestressed Concrete    1922.4.2, 2103.11.6

A 446
Specification for Steel Sheet, Zinc-coated (Galvanized) by the Hot-Dip Process, Structural (Physical) Quality


1917.4.4

A 490—93          Specification for Heat-Treated, Steel Structural Bolts, 150 ksi 

                            Minimum Tensile Strength                                                 2214.3

A 525—87
Specification for General Requirements for Steel Sheet, Zinc-Coated (Galvanized) by the Hot-Dip Process
1917.4.4, 2214.3, 2517.2, 2517.5.1, 2517.5.4
A570/A570M-98
Specification for Steel, Sheet and Strip, Carbon, Hot-Rolled (withdawn)
1826.1.5.3
A 611
Standard Specification for Structural Steel (SS), Sheet, Carbon, Coil-Rolled
1826.1.5.3, 1917.4.4
A 615/A 615M—09
Specification for Deformed and Plain Billet-Steel Bars for Concrete Reinforcement
1908.1.8, 1920.2, 1920.4, 1922.4.6, 2103.11.1, 2103.11.6
A616/A616M-96a
Specification for Rail-Steel Deformed and Plain Bars for Concrete Reinforcement (withdrawn)


1922.4.6

A 617
Standard Specification for Axle-Steel Reformed and Plain Bars for Concrete Reinforcement




1922.4.6
A 653/A 653M—08
Specification for Steel Sheet, Zinc-Coated Galvanized or Zinc-Iron Alloy-Coated Galvannealed by the Hot-Dip Process
Table 1507.4.3, 2211.2, 2211.2.2.1, 2319.17.2.2.7
A 706/A 706M—09
Specification for Low-Alloy Steel Deformed and Plain Bars for Concrete Reinforcement
1903.5.2, 1908.1.3, 1922.4.6
A 722/A 722M—07     Specification for Uncoated High-Strength Steel Bar for Prestressing Concrete
1922.4.2, 2103.11.6, 2106.1.1.3.1

A 767/A 767M—00b
Specification for Zinc-Coated (Galvanized) Steel Bars for Concrete Reinforcement
1922.4.6, 1926.5.5, 2103.11.1

A 775/A 775M—03(2008)Specification for Epoxy-Coated Steel Reinforcing Bars

1922.4.6, 2103.11.1

Revise text to read as follows:

ASTM A 924 /A924M—08a  Standard Specification for General Requirements for Steel Sheet, Metallic-coated by the Hot-dip Process . . . . . . . . . . . Table 1507.4.3(1). 2319.17.2.2.7. 
B 370-09              Specification for Copper Sheet and Strip for Building Construction        Table 1507.4.3
C 5—03
Specification for Quicklime for Structural Purposes
Table 2507.2, 2525.2.3
C 28/C 28M—00 (2005) Specification for Gypsum Plasters

Table 2507.2, 2515.2.2
C 31/C 31M—08b
Practice for Making and Curing Concrete Test Specimens in the Field.
1905.6.3.2, 1905.6.4.2, 1923.2.2.3, 1923.2.3.2
C 33—08
Specification for Concrete Aggregates 
721.3.1.4, 721.4.1.1.3, Table 1904.2.1, 1922.1, 1922.2, 1922.2.2
C 34—03
Specification for Structural Clay Load-Bearing Wall Tile
2103.2, 2119.8.3
C 35—01(2005)
Specification for Inorganic Aggregates for Use in Gypsum Plaster 
Table 2507.2, 2515.2.1.1
C 36/C 36M—03
Specification for Gypsum Wallboard 

Figure 721.5.1(2), Figure 721.5.1(3), Table 721.5.1(2), Table 2506.2, 2517.2
C 37/C 37M—-01
Specification for Gypsum Lath

Table 2507.2, 2514.2
C 39—99ae1
Test Method for Compressive Strength of Cylindrical Concrete Specimens 
1905.6.3.2, 1923.2.2.3
C 42/C 42M—99
Test Method for Obtaining and Testing Drilled Cores and Sawed Beams of Concrete
1923.2.4.1, 1923.2.4.3
C 52-01A
Specification for Gypsum Partition Tile or Block




2119.9.3
C 55—06e01
Specification for Concrete Brick
Table 721.3.2, 2103.1, 2105.2.2.1.2, 2119.4.3.2, 2119.4.3.3
C 56—05
Specification for Structural Clay Non-Load-Bearing Tile

2103.2, 2119.8.3.3
C 57
Specification for Structural Clay Floor Tile


2119.8.3.2
C 61/C 61M—00 (2006)
Specification for Gypsum Keene’s Cement


Table 2507.2, 2515.2.4
C 62—08
Specification for Building Brick (Solid Masonry Units Made from Clay or Shale)

2103.2, 2105.2.2.1.1, 2119.4.3.1
C 67—08
Test Methods of Sampling and Testing Brick and Structural Clay Tile 
721.4.1.1.1, 1507.3.5, 2104.5, 2105.2.2.1.1, 2109.8.1.1, 2119.4.2
C 90—08
Specification for Loadbearing Concrete Masonry Units
Table 721.3.2, 1805.5.2, 2103.1, 2105.2.2.1.2, 2119.7.2
C 91—05
Specification for Masonry Cement


Table 2103.7(1), Table 2507.2, 2515.2.6
C 94/C 94M—07
Specification for Ready-Mixed Concrete

109.3.1, 1905.8.2, 1924.2.2, 1924.2.3
C 144—03
Standard Specification for Aggregate for Masonry Mortar

1928.7.2, 2119.12.1.1
C 150—07
Specification for Portland Cement 
1904, Table 1904.2.3, 1922.1, Table 2103.7(1), Table 2507.2, 2515.2.4
C 172—08
Practice for Sampling Freshly Mixed Concrete


1905.6.3.1, 1923.2.2.2
C 206—03
Specification for Finishing Hydrated Lime


Table 2507.2, 2525.2.3
C 212—00(2006)
Specification for Structural Clay Facing Tile




2103.2, 2119.8.2
C 216—07a
Specification for Facing Brick (Solid Masonry Units Made from Clay or Shale)
2103.2, 2105.2.2.1.1, 2119.4.3.1
C 270—08a
Specification for Mortar for Unit Masonry


2103.7, Table 2103.7(2), 2119.12.1
C 330—05
Specification for Lightweight Aggregates for Structural Concrete
721.1.1, 1905.1.4, 

                                                  1922.2.2
C 471M—01
Standard Test Methods for Chemical Analysis of Gypsum and Gypsum Products

2119.9.2
C 472—99 (2004)
Specification for Standard Test Methods for Physical Testing of Gypsum, Gypsum Plasters and Gypsum Concrete





Table 2506.2, 2119.9.2
C 473—07
Test Method for Physical Testing of Gypsum Panel Products

Table 2506.2, 2119.9.2
C 475—02(2007
Specification for Joint Compound and Joint Tape for Finishing Gypsum Wallboard

Table 2506.2, 2517.2
C 494/C494M-99
Standard Specification for Chemical Admixtures for Concrete



1917.4.5
C 495–99a
Standard Test Method for Compressive Strength of Lightweight Insulating Concrete
1917.1.1, 1917.1.2, 1917.1.3
C 509-00               Elastomeric Cellular Preformed Gaskets and Sealing Material      2411.3.4
C 578—08b
Standard Specification for Rigid, Cellular Polysturene Thermal Insulation
1917.4.12
C 595—08a
Specification for Blended Hydraulic Cements
1922.1.2, Table 2103.7(1), Table 2507.2

C 645—08a
Specification for Nonstructural Steel Framing Members
2319.17.1.3, Table 2506.2, Table 2507.2, 2517.2, 2517.5.1, 2517.5.4
C 652—09
Specification for Hollow Brick (Hollow Masonry Units Made from Clay or Shale)
2103.2, 2105.2.2.1.1, 2119.4.3.1, 2119.4.3.1
C 685/ C 685M—98a
Specification for Concrete Made by Volumetric Batching and Continuous Mixing
1905.8.2, 1924.2.2
C 794—01
Standard Test Method for Adhesion-in-Peel of Elastomeric Joint Sealants
2415.4

C 796—97
Standard Test Method for Foaming Agents For Use in Producing Cellular Concrete Using Performed Foam
1917.1.1, 1917.1.2, 1917.1.3, 1917.4.6
C 864-05               Dense Elastomeric Compression Seal Gaskets, Setting Blocks, and Spacers   ________________________________________                                                        2411.3.4
…

C 920—08 Specification for Elastomeric Joint Sealants .……………. 2415.4, 2510.8.8  

C 926—06
Specification for Application of Portland Cement-Based Plaster
2510.3, Table 2511.1, 2511.3, 2511.4, 2512.1, 2512.1.2, 2512.2, 2512.6, 2512.8.2, 2513.7, 2512.9, 2513.7, 2516.1.1, 2516.1.4
C 1036—01
Specification for Flat Glass






2411.1.1
C 1048—97b
Standard Specification for Heat-Treated Flat Glass—Kind HS, Kind FT Coated and Uncoated Glass








2411.1.5
C 1077
Standard Practice for Laboratories Testing Concrete and Congete Apparatus for Use in Construction and Criteria for Laboratory Evaluation



1920.4, 1922.6.2
C 1115-00             Dense Elastomeric Silicone Rubber Gaskets and Accessories        2411.3.4
C 1167—03
Specification for Clay Roof Tiles

1507.3.4, 1507.3.5, 1523.6.5.2
C 1225
Specification For Nanasbestos Fiber-Cement Roofing Shingles, Shakes and Slates
1518.5.1
C 1281- 03 Standard Specification for Preformed Tape Sealants for Glazing Applications …………………………………………………………. 2510.8  

D 25—99- ((2005)
Specification for Round Timber Piles

1809.1.1, 1823.1
D 41—05
Specification for Asphalt Primer Used in Roofing, Dampproofing, and Waterproofing
Table 1507.10.2, 1514.2.3.2, 1517.6.2.4, 1519.6, 1521.6, 1521.14.1
D 43-00 (2006)
Specification for Coal Tar Primer Used in Roofing, Dampproofing, and Waterproofing 
Table 

                               1507.10.2, 1521.14.2, 1517.6.2.4, 1519.6, 1521.6
D 92
Standard Test Method for Flasin and Fire Points by Cleveland Open Cup

1519.2.2
D 256—03
Standard Test Methods for Determining the Izod Pendulum Impact Resistance of Plastics
2612.2
D 312—00(2006)
 Specification for Asphalt Used in Roofing
Table 1507.10.2, 1519.3, Table 1519.3A, 1519.4, 

                                                  1521.14.1
D412—98a (2002)e1
Standard Test Methods for Vulcanized Rubber and Thermoplastic Elastomers—Tension

D 450—07
Specification for Coal-Tar Pitch Used in Roofing, Dampproofing, and Waterproofing
Table 1507.10.2, Table 1519.3B
D624—00e1
Standard Test Method for Tear Strength of Conventional Vulcanized Rubber and Thermoplastic Elastomers


2415.4
D 635—06
Test Method for Rate of Burning and/or Extent and Time of Burning of Self-Supporting Plastics in a Horizontal Position
2606.4, 2612.2
D 638-03              Test Method for Tensile Properties of Plastics          2612.2
D1079—02
Standard Terminology Relating to Roofing, Waterproofing, and Bituminous Materials
1513.1
D1143/D 1143M- 07el
Test Method for Piles Under Static Axial Compressive Load
1808.2.8.3, 1829.1.7
D1167
Methods of Testing Asphalt-Base Emulsions for Use as Protective Coatings for Built-Up Roofs
1523.6.5.2
D1556
Standard Test Method for Density of Soil In-Place by the Sandcone
1820.3.2, 1834.3.3
D1557—07
Test Method for Laboratory Compaction Characteristics of Soil Using Modified Effort (56,000 ft-lb/ft3 (2,700 kN m/m3))
1803.5, 1820.3.2
D1621
Standard Test Method for Compressive Properties of Rigid Cellular Plastics
1523.6.5.2.17.1

D1622
Standard Test Method for Apparent Pensity of Rigid Cellular Plastics
1523.6.5.2.17.2

D1623
Standard Test Method for Tersile and Tersile Adhesion Properties of Rigid Cellular Plastics
523.6.5.2.17.3

D1761—06     Test Method for Mechanical Fasteners in Wood
 1834.3.3, 2314.4.4 
D1836 
Specification for Commercial Hexanes


1519.12.1
D1863—05
Specification for Mineral Aggregate Used on Built-Up Roofs
Table 1507.10.2, 1519.2.1
D1929—96 (2000)e01
Test Method for Determining Ignition Properties of Plastics
402.14.4, 406.5.2,   

                                     1407.11.2.1, 2606.4, 2612.2
D2126
Standard Test Method for Response of Rigid Cellular Plastics to Thermal and Humid Aging
523.6.5.2.17.4

D2240—03
Standard Test Method for Rubber Property—Durometer Hardness


2415.4
Add text to read as follows:

ASTM D 2824  - 06 Standard Specification for Aluminum-Pigmented Asphalt Roof Coatings, Nonfibered Asbestos Fibered, and Fibered without Asbestos…….    Table 1507.10.2
D2565—00
Standard Practice for Xenon Arc Exposure of Plastics Intended for Outdoor Applications
2612.2
D2626—04
Specification for Asphalt-Saturated and Coated Organic Felt Base Sheet Used in Roofing
1507.3.3, Table 1507.10.2, 1518.4
D2842
Standard Test Method for Water Absorption of Rigid Cellular Plastics
1523.6.5.2.17.6
D2843—99(2004)e01
Test for Density of Smoke from the Burning or Decomposition of Plastics
2606.4, 

                                                      2612.2
D2856
Standard Test Method for Open-cell Content of Rigid Cellular Plastics by the Air- Pycnometer.
523.6.5.2.17.5 
D2898—04
Test Methods for Accelerated Weathering of Fire-Retardant-Treated Wood for Fire Testing
1505.1, 1516.1, 2303.2.1, 2303.2.3, 2314.4.4, 2327.4, 2329.1
D2922
Standard Test Method for Density of Soil and Soil Aggregate In-Place by Nuclear Methods (Shallow Depth)



1820.3.2
D3018
Standard Specification for Class A Asphalt Shingles Surfaced with Mineral Granules
1523.6.5.1
D3201—08a
Test Method for Hygroscopic Properties of Fire-Retardant Wood and Wood-Base Products





2303.2.4, 2314.4.4, 2327.5
D3441
Static Cone Soundings




1834.3.3
D3462—09
Specification for Asphalt Shingles Made from Glass Felt and Surfaced with Mineral Granules


   1507.2.5, 1523.6.5.1
D 3498—03
Standard Specifications for Adhesives for Field-Gluing Plywood to Lumber Framing for Floor Systems


2314.4.4, 2322.1.5
D3679—09
Specification for Rigid Poly (Vinyl Chloride) (PVC) Siding

1404.9, 1405.13

D3737—08
Practice for Establishing Allowable Properties for Structural Glued Laminated Timber (Glulam)
2303.1.3
D3746—85 (2008) 
Test Method for Impact Resistance of Bituminous Roofing Systems
1504.7, 1515.2.4
D3787—89
Test Method for Bursting Strength of Textiles-Constant-Rate-of-Traverse (CRT) Ball Burst Test
424.2.17.1.15
D4272—08a
Test Method for Total Energy Impact of Plastic Films by Dart Drop

1504.7, 1515.2.4
D4402
Viscosity Determinations of Unfilled Asphalt Using the Brookfield Thermoset Apparatus
1519.2.3

D4477-04a           Standard Specification for Rigid (Unplasticized) Poly (Vinyl Chloride) (PVC) Siding    

                  1404.9, 1404.9.1, 1405.13      
D5034—95
Standard Test Method for Breaking Strength and Elongation of Textile Fabrics (Grab Test)
24.2.17.1.15

D5055—09
Specification for Establishing and Monitoring Structural Capacities of Prefabricated Wood I-joists
424.2.14.1.15, 2303.1.2

D5456—09
Specification for Evaluation of Structural Composite Lumber Products

2303.1.9

D5957-98             Standard Guide for Flood Testing Horizontal Waterproofing Installation 1519.16.6    
D6083—05e01
Specification for Liquid Applied Acrylic Coating Used in RoofingTable 1507.10.2, 1507.15.2, 

                          1523.6.2.1.1, 1523.6.3.1, 1523.6.5.12.2
D6380-03(2009)
Specifications for Asphalt Roll Roofing (Organic Felt)
1507.3.3
Add text to read as follows:

D6841-08 b            Standard Practice for Calculating Design Value Treatment Adjustment Factors for Fire-Retardant-Treated Lumber                          2303.2.2.2            

D7158-08d              Standard Test Method for Wind Resistance of Sealed Asphalt Shingles (Uplift Force/Uplift 

                                   Resistance Method)                                        Table 1507.2.10      
E 84—09
Test Method for Surface Burning Characteristics of Building Materials
402.10, 402.14.4, 406.5.2, 410.3.5.3, 422.2.16.3, 423.11.5, 703.4.2, 719.1, 719.4, 802.1, 803.1, 803.5, 803.6.1, 803.6.2, 1407.10, 1407.10.1, 2303.2, 2314.4.4, 2327.1, 2603.3, 2603.4.1.13, 2603.5.4, 2604.2.4, 2606.4, 2612.2, 2612.3
E 96/E 96M—05
Test Method for Water Vapor Transmission of Materials

1203.2, 1523.6.5.2.17.7
E 108—07a
Test Methods for Fire Tests of Roof Coverings
423.12.1, 1505.1, 1513.1, 1516.1, 1523.1.2, 2329.1, 2603.6, 2610.2, 2610.3

E 119—08a
Test Methods for Fire Tests of Building Construction and Materials
410.3.5.2, 703.2, 703.2.1, 703.2.3, 703.3, 704.7, 704.9, 706.7, 711.3.2, 712.3.1, 712.4.1, 712.4.6, 713.1, 713.4, 714.7, 715.2, 716.5.2, 715.5.3.1, 715.6.2, 716.5.2, 716.5.3.1, 716.6.2, Table 721.1(1), 1407.10.2, 2103.2, 2603.3, 2603.4, 2603.4.1.13, 2603.5.4, 2604.2.4, 2606.4, 2612.2, 2612.3.1.1, 2612.3.1.4
E163-84E01
Methods of Fire Tests For Window Assemblies (withdrawn)


2121.2.1.2.8
Add text to read as follows:

E 330—02
Test Method for Structural Performance of Exterior Windows, Curtain Walls, and Doors by Uniform Static Air Pressure Difference



1714.5.3, 2415.4, 2415.7.1
E 331—00(2009)
Test Method for Water Penetration of Exterior Windows, Skylights, Doors, and Curtain Walls by Uniform Static Air Pressure Difference




1403.2, 2415.4
E1300—04e01,07e01, 09a or 98 (HVHZ)
Practice for Determining Load Resistance of Glass in Buildings
1714.5.2.1, 2404.1, 2404.2, 2404.3, 2411.2.1.1, 2411.2.1.2, 2411.3.1.2 

E1592—01
Test Method for Structural Performance of Sheet Metal Roof and Siding Systems by Uniform Static Air Pressure Difference




1504.3.2, 2411.2.1.2
E 2203-02             Dense Thermoplastic Elastomers Used for Compression Seals, Gaskets, Setting Blocks, Spacers and Accessories                                                                                             2411.3.4
F851—87 (2000)
Standard Test Method for Self-Rising Seat Mechanisms
1024.10
F1346—91 (2003)
Performance Specification for Safety Covers and Labeling Requirements for All Covers for Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs

424.1.3.9, 424.2.2, 424.2.17, 
G53—96
Practice for Operating Light-and Water-Exposure Apparatus (Fluorscent UV-Condensation Type) for Exposure of Nonmetallic Materials




424.17.1.15.2

G85
Standard Practice for Modified Salt Spray (Fog) Testing
1517.5.1, 1517.5.2, 1523.6.5.2.10, 1523.6.5.2.11

G60—01
Standard Practice for Conducting Cyclic Humidity Tests


2319.17.2.2.8
ASTM G 155 Add to read as shown: 

ASTM G 155 – 05a Standard Practice for Operating Xenon Arc Light Apparatus for Exposure of Non-Metallic Materials………….2612.2
AWPA

American Wood-Preservers’ Association

P.O. Box 5690

Grandbury, TX 76049

Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number

Change to read as shown.

C1—03
All Timber Products—Preservative Treatment by Pressure Processes
1505.6, 2303.1.8, 2314.4.5
C2—01
Lumber, Timber, Bridge Ties and Mine Ties—Preservative Treatment by Pressure Processes


Table 1507.9.5, 1805.4.5, 1805.7.1, 2303.1.8, 2304.11.2, 2304.11.4, 2304.11.7, 2314.4.5
C3—99
Piles—Preservative Treatment by Pressure Processes
1805.4.5, 1809.1.2, 1823.1.3, 2303.1.8, 2314.4.5
C4—99
Poles—Preservative Treatment by Pressure Processes

1805.7.1, 1808.1.2, 2303.1.8, 2314.4.5
Add to read as shown.

C5
Posts - Pressure Treatment




2314.4.5

C6
Cross Ties and Switch Ties Pressure Treatment

2314.4.5

C7
Incised (Red, White & Alaska Yellow Cedar) Poles Butts Thermal Treatment

2314.4.5

C8
Poles (Western Red & Alaska Yellow Cedar) Full Length Thermal Treatment

2314.4.5
Change to read as shown.

C9—00
Plywood—Preservative Treatment by Pressure Processes
2304.11.2, 2304.11.4, 2304.11.7, 2314.4.5
Add to read as shown.

C10
Poles (Lodgepole Pine) Full Length Thermal Treatment
2314.4.5

C11
Wood Blocks for Floors & Platforms Pressure Treatment
2314.4.5
Change to read as shown.

C14—99
Wood for Highway Construction, Pressure Treatment by Pressure Process          2314.4.5
C16—00
Wood Used on Farms, Pressure Treatment by Pressure Process 
2314.4.5
C18—99
Standard for Pressure Treated Material in Marine Construction
    2314.4.5

Add to read as shown.

C20
Structural Lumber, Fire Retardant Pressure Treatment
    2314.4.5
Change to read as shown.

C22—96
Lumber and Plywood for Permanent Wood Foundations— Preservative Treatment by Pressure Processes

1805.4.6, 2314.4.5
C23—00
Round Poles and Posts Used in Building Construction— Preservative Treatment by Pressure Processes


2314.4.5
Add to read as shown.

C25
Crossarms Pressure Treatment



2314.4.5

C26

Crossarms, Non-Pressure Treatment


2314.4.5
Change to read as shown.

C28—99
Standard for Preservative Treatment by Pressure Process of Structural Glued Laminated Members and Laminations before Gluing




2314.4.5
Add to read as shown.

C29
Lumber to be Used for the Harvesting, Storage and Transportation of Food Stuffs— Preservative Treatment by Pressure Processes
2314.4.5
Change to read as shown.

M4—08
Standard for the Care of Preservative-Treated Wood Products
1809.1.2, 1823.1.4, 2303.1.8, 2314.4.5
Add to read as shown.

M6—96
Brands Used on Forest Products






2315.1.9
AWS


American Welding Society

550 N.W. LeJeune Road

Miami, FL 33126



Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section numb

Add to read as shown.

B2.1
Standard Welding Procedure and Performance Qualification
2214.3


C5.4
Recommended Practice for Stud Welding


2214.3


Change to read as shown.

D1.1—04
Structural Welding Code—Steel



2214.3


Add to read as shown.

D1.2
Structural Welding Code—Aluminum


2003.3


Change to read as shown.

D1.3—98
Structural Welding Code—Sheet Steel


2214.3
D1.4—98
Structural Welding Code—Reinforcing Steel
1903.5.2, 1922.4.4, 1922.4.5, 1926.4.6, 1926.4.8, 2119.1.1, 2214.3
Add to read as shown.

D9.1
Specification for Welding of Sheet Metal


2214.3


D10.9
Standard for Qualification of Welding Procedures and Welders for Piping and Tubing
2214.3

CPSC


Consumer Product Safety Commission

4330 East West Highway

Bethesada, MD 20814-4408



Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number

Change to read as shown.

16 CFR Part 1201(2002)
Safety Standard for Architectural Glazing Material

2406.1.1, 2406.2.1, 2407.1, 2408.2.1, 2408.3, 2411.1.3, 2411.3.1.3, 2411.4.2, 2612.4.8,
Add to read as shown.

Pub. No. 362

Safety Barrier Guidelines for Home Pools

424.1.3.1.9
DOC/NIST


Department of Commerce

National Institute of Standards and Technology

100 Bureau Drive Stop 3460

Gaithersburg, MD 20899



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number


Add to read as shown.

CS236
Mat-Formed Particleboard




2314.4.6, 2315.1.6
Change to read as shown.

PS-1-09
Construction and Industrial Plywood
2211.2.2.2, 2303.1.4, 2304.6.2, Table 2304.7(4), 2306.3.2, 2314.4.6, 2315.1.2


PS-2-10
Performance Standard for Wood Based Structural Use Panels
1809.1.1, 2211.3.1, 2303.1.4, 2304.6.2, Table 2304.7(4), Table 2304.7(5), Table 2306.3.1, 2306.3.2, 2314.4.6, 2315.1.2


PS20-05
American Softwood Lumber Standard        1809.1.1, 2302.1, 2303.1.1, 2314.4.6, 2315.1.8

Add to read as shown.

PS56
Structural Glued Laminated Timber




2314.4.6

DOL/OSHA

Department of Labor

Occupational Safety and Health Administration

Frances Perkins Building

200 Constitution Avenue, NW

Washington, DC 20210

Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number

Add to read as shown.

29CFR Part 1910

Occupational Safety and Health Standards

1618.4

29CFR 1926-950 (p)
Occupational Safety and Health Administration 

                                           Excavation Safety Act
1817.1
DOT

Department of Transportation

c/o Superintendent of Documents

U.S. Government Printing Office

Washington, DC 20402-9325

Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number

Add to read as shown.

FBC-TPHVHZ—2013
Florida Building Code, Test Protocols for High Velocity Hurricane Zones

RAS 109
1521.18, 1523.6.2.1

RAS 111
1503.3, 1504.5, 1514.2, 1514.2.1, 1514.2.2, 1514.2.3, 1514.2.4, 1514.2.5.2, 1514.3, 1514.4.1.1, 1515.2.3.2, 1517.6.1, 1517.6.2.1, 1517.6.2.3, 1517.6.2.5, 1518.5.3, 1518.6.2, 1518.7.3.4, 1518.9.5, 1519.8, 1519.10, 1519.13, 1523.6.5.2.14, 1519.16.5, 1523.6.5.2.14

RAS 115
1518.7

RAS 117              1519.7, 1519.11, 1520.4, 1520.5, 1521.7.1, 1521.14.3, 1523.6.5.29

RAS 118
1518.8.1

RAS 119
1518.8.1

RAS 120
1518.8.1
RAS 127
1518.8.5, 1518.8.6, 1523.6.5.2, 1523.6.5.2.2.2, 1523.6.5.2.2.3, 1523.6.5.2.3.2, 1523.6.5.2.3.3, 1523.6.5.2.6.2, 1525

RAS 128
1525

RAS 130
1518.10

RAS 133
1519.9.2

RAS 150
1519.1
TAS 100
1523.6.5, 1523.6.5.1, 1523.6.5.2, 1523.6.5.2.4, 1523.6.5.2.4.1, 1523.6.5.2.5, 1523.6.5.2.6, 1523.6.5.2.7

TAS 100A
1523.6.5.2.13

TAS 101
1523.6.5.22.2 1523.6.2.22, 1523.6.5.2.2.3

TAS 102
1523.6.5.2.3, 1523.6.5.2.3.2, 1523.6.5.2.3.3, 1523.6.5.2.6.2, 1523.6.5.2.6.3

TAS 102A
1523.6.5.2.3, 1523.6.5.2.3.2, 1523.6.5.2.3.3, 1523.6.5.2.6.2, 1523.6.5.2.6.3

TAS 103
1523.6.5.2.1

TAS 104
1523.6.5.2.1

TAS 105
1513.1, 1519.7.1, 1521.7, 1521.11

TAS 106
1512.4.2.4, 1523.6.5.2.2.4, 1523.6.5.2.3.4, 1523.6.5.2.6.4

TAS 107
1507.2.10, Table 1507.2.10, 1523.6.5.1

TAS 108
1523.6.5.2.2.1, 1523.6.5.2.2.2, 1523.6.5.2.2.3, 1523.6.5.2.3.1, 1523.6.5.2.3.2, 1523.6.5.2.3.3, 1523.6.5.2.6.1, 1523.6.5.2.6.2, 1523.6.5.2.6.3, 1715.2, 1715.2.2

TAS 110
1515.1.4, 1515.2.5, 1520.1, 1520.4, 1523.1.1, 1523.6.2, 1523.6.2.1, 1523.6.3, 1523.6.5.2.4.1, 1523.6.5.2.6, 1523.6.5.2.7, 1523.6.5.2.8, 1523.6.5.2.9, 1523.6.5.2.12, 1523.6.5.2.13.1, 1523.6.5.2.14, 1523.6.5.2.15, 1523.6.5.2.16, 1523.6.5.2.17

TAS 110A
1523.6.5.2.13

TAS 111A
1523.6.5.2.14
TAS 111B
1523.6.5.2.14

TAS 111C
1523.6.5.2.14

TAS 112
1523.6.5.2

TAS 113
1518.8.1.1

TAS 114
1513.1, 1515.1.1, 1515.2.4, 1517.5.1, 1519.5.1, 1520.4, 1523.6.2, 1523.6.2.1, 1523.6.3, 1523.6.5.2.9, 1523.6.5.2.10, 1523.6.5.2.11

TAS 115
1523.6.5.2.6.3
TAS 116
1513.1, 1523.6.5.2.2.1, 1523.6.5.2.3.1, 1523.6.5.2.6.1

TAS 121
1523.6.5.2.12

TAS 123
1518.8.1.1, 1523.6.5.2.15, 1523.6.5.2.17

TAS 123A
1523.6.5.2.16

TAS 124
1521.10, 1523.6.4

TAS 125
1518.9.1, 1523.6.5.2.4.1

TAS 126
1521.12

TAS 135
1523.6.5.2.6

TAS 201
202, 1609.1.4

TAS 202    1609.1.4, 1008.1.6, 1714.5.2.1, 1714.5.2.1.1, 1714.5.3, 1714.6

TAS 203
202, 1609.1.4

TAS 301
1515.1.3
FM

Factory Mutual

Standards Laboratories Department

1151 Boston-Providence Turnpike

Norwood, MA 02062

Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number

Change to read as shown.

4450 (1992) 
Approval Standard for Class 1 Insulated Steel Deck Roofs—with Supplements through July 1992
1504.3.1, 1508.1, 2603.3, 2603.4.1.5, 2612.3.2.5.2
Add to read as shown.

FM

4470 (1992) Approval Standard for Class 1 Roof Covers  .. . .1504.3.1, 1504.7, 1515.1.1
4471

Approval Standard for Class I Panel Roofs


1515.1.1
GSA


General Services Administration

1800 F Street, NW

Washington, DC 20405



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number


DD-G-451D (1977)
Glass, Flat and Corrugated for Glazing Mirrors and Other Uses

2411.1.2

DECO

Document Engineering Co., Inc., 

5210 Stagg Street

Van Nuys, California 9140

ANSI Z 358.1 04  Emergency Eyewash and shower Equipment    Table 420.3.17.2  
FINA


Federation Internationale de Natation Amateur

Av. de l' Avant-Poste 4

1005 Lausanne 

SWITZERLAND



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number


CHG-22
FINA Handbook 1998-2000




424.1.2.7
NFPA

Add to read as shown.

10—10

Standard for Portable Fire Extinguisher

419.4.2.10.2, 420.4.2.10.1.2, 423.28.2.14
Change to read as shown.

13—10                Installation of Sprinkler Systems
402.4.6, 431, 704.12, 707.2, 903.1.4, 903.3.1.1, 903.3.2, 903.3.5.1.1, 904.11, 907.8, 1621.3.10.1, 2121.2.12.8, 3104.5, 3104.9

30—12 
Flammable and Combustible Liquids Code


415.3, 423.20.4.1
Revise text to read as follows:

NFPA

61—08
Prevention of Fires and Dust Explosions in Agricultural and Food Product Facilities
415.7.1, 
423.7.7
72—10
National Fire Alarm Code
423.7.7, 436.7.1.1, 436.7.1.3, 416.7.2, 436.10.5.1, 436.10.5.2, 505.4, 901.6, 903.4.1, 904.3.5, 907.2, 907.2.1, 907.2.1.1, 907.2.10, 907.2.10.4, 907.2.11.2, 907.2.11.3, 907.2.12.2.3, 907.2.12.3, 907.4, 907.5, 907.9.2, 907.10, 907.14, 907.16, 907.17, 911.1, 1008.1.3.7.4, 3002.8, 3006.5
96-04 Standard for Ventilation Control and Fire Protection of Commercial Cooking Operations . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 436.6.2

99—10  Standard for Health Care Facilities. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4203.18.1, 420.3.20.2, 420.3.25.1, 419.3.18, 419.3.18.8

101—12 Life Safety Code . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 420.3.3.6, 423.6.1, 423.14.2.1, 423.27.9.1, 423.27.10.1, 427.2.2.1.1.1, 427.1.4.13.2, 427.1.4.2.13, 427.1.4.1.1.2, 427.1.3.1.1.2, 903.6.2, 1024.6.2 
110—10
Emergency and Standby Power Systems
419.3.18, 419.3.18.8, 420.3.25, 1006.2.33, 421.3.13.1, 4006.2.3.3, 1006.2.3.3, 2702.1

Add to read as shown.

780—04  Installation of Lighting Systems . . .419.3.19, 420.3.26.1, 423.17.7

APSP

Association of Pool and Spa Professionals
2111 Eisenhower Avenue

Alexandria, VA 22314



Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number


ANSI/NSF
International Standard 50-1996, Circulation System Components and Related Materials for Swimming Pools, Spas/Hot Tubs
424.1.6.5.1, 424.1.6.5.2, 424.1.6.5.16, 424.1.6.5.16.4.2, 424.1.6.5.16.5.2, 424.1.9.2.5.2


PCA

Portland Cement Association

5420 Old Orchard Road

Skokie, IL 60077

Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number
EB008-9
Concrete Masonry Handbook



2119.1.1
SMACNA


Sheet Metal and Air Conditioning Contractors' National Association

8224 Old Courthouse Rd.

Vienna, VA 22180



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number


SMACNA—2003
Fire, Smoke and Radiation Damper Installation Guide for HVAC Systems






419.2.1.3, 420.2.3, 421.2.1.3, 
Metal Roof and Wall Systems . . .RAS 133-9.2
UL

Underwriters Laboratories

333 Pfingsten Road

Northbrook, IL 60062-2096

Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number

Add to read as shown.

181—96

Standard for Factory-Made Air Ducts and Air Connectors
419.3.11.6
Add to read as shown.

RCSC


Research Council on Structural Connections

c/o Stanley D. Lindsey & Assoc. Ltd.

2244 Metro Center Blvd., Suite 208

Nashville, TN 37228-1320



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number


RCSC—88
Specification for Structural Joints Using ASTM A 325 or A 490 Bolts

2214.3

RMI

Rack Manufacturers Institute

8720 Red Oak Boulevard, Suite 201

Charlotte, NC 28217

Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number

Change to read as shown.

10100
Manual of Safety Practices - A Code of Practices for the Use of Industrial and Commercial Steel Storage Racks


2214.3

10150
Industrial Steel Storage Racks Manual



2214.3

10083
Specification for the Design, Testing and Utilization of Industrial Steel Storage Racks

2208.1
SDI


Steel Deck Institute

PO Box 25

Fox River Grove, IL 60021



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number


DDP

Deck Damage and Penetrations



2214.3


DDM—023
Diaphragm Design Manual


2214.3, 2222.4


Number 30 31
Design Manual For Composite Decks, Form Decks and Roof Decks


2214.3


MOC1 2

Manual of Construction with Steel Deck


2214.3


SPD2

Standard Practice Details




2214.3

SJI


Steel Joist Institute

3127 10th Avenue, North

Myrtle Beach, SC 29577-6760



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number

Add to read as shown.

SJI—71
Structural Design of Steel Joist Roofs to Resist Ponding Loads, Technical Digest No. 3

2214.3


SJI—88
Vibration of Steel Joist-Concrete Slab Floors, Technical Digest No. 5



2214.3


SJI—03
Structural Design of Steel Joist Roofs to Resist Uplift Loads, Technical Digest No. 6

2214.3


SJI—83
Welding of Open Web Steel, Technical Digest No. 8


2214.3


SJI—87
Handling and Erection of Steel Joists and Joist Girders, Technical Digest No. 9


2214.3


SJI—02
Standard Specifications, Load Tables and Weight Tables for Steel Joists and Joist Girders






1604.3.3, 2206, 2214.3


SJI—03
75-Year Steel Joist Manual




2214.3

Add to read as shown.

SMA


Storage Equipment Manufacturers Association

8720 Red Oak Blvd, Suite 201

Charlotte, NC 28217



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number


ANSI/SMA MH281—97
Specification of Industrial Grade Steel Shelving
2214.3

Add to read as shown.

SSPC


The Society for Protective Coatings

40 24th Street, 6th Floor

Pittsburgh PA 15222-4656



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number


SSPC - Paint 15
Steel Joist Shop Paint




2214.3


SSPC/AISC
Guide to the Shop Painting of Structural Steel

2214.3

STI


Steel Tube Institute

522 Westgate Tower

Cleveland, OH 44116



Standard reference number
Title

Referenced in section number


STI
Manual of Cold-Formed Welded Structural Steel Tube

2214.3

TECO

Timber Company, Inc.

2402 Daniels Street

Madison, WI 53704

Standard reference number
Title


Referenced in section number

TECO PRP-133
Performance Standards and Policies for Structural Use Panels
2314.4.8, 2315.1.2
1256—02            Fire Test of Roof Deck Construction—with Revisions through March 2000

1508.1, 2603.3, 2603.4.1.5, 2612.3.2.5.2
Add to read as shown.

2017-08 Standard for General-Purpose Signaling Devices and Systems – with Revisions through October 13, 2009        424.2.17.1.9
Change to read as shown.

Underwriters Laboratories Inc. (UL),
333 Pfingsten Road, Northbrook, 
IL 60062-2096. 

UL 1069, 7th edition…..420.3.25
Chapter 36 Florida Fire Prevention Code.  Add to read as shown.

Chapter 36 Florida Fire Prevention Code
3601.1 Scope.  Add to read as shown.

3601.1 Scope.  Provisions of this chapter shall govern the design, construction and arrangement of elements to provide a safe means of egress from buildings and structures and to minimize hazard to life and property due to fire and panic.
3601.2 Add to read as shown.

3601.2  In addition to the provisions of this code, buildings shall comply with the 2013 Florida Fire Prevention Code as adopted by the Florida State Fire Marshal.
Appendix B Board of Appeals.  Change to read as shown.  

APPENDIX B

CHAPTER 9B-52 F.A.C.

FLORIDA STANDARD FOR PASSIVE RADON-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION

See Appendix B of the 2010 FBC, Building
Appendix C Group U – Agricultural Buildings.  Change to read as shown.  

APPENDIX C
CHAPTER 9B-53 F.A.C STANDARD FOR MITIGATION OF RADON IN EXISTING BUILDINGS
See Appendix C of the 2010 FBC, Building
APPENDIX E

Chapter 9 B-67 FLORIDA STANDARD FOR RADON-RESISTANT NEW COMMERCIAL CONSTRUCTION

See Appendix E of the 2010 FBC, Building
